PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

CITY OF OCEAN CITY

AMERICA’'S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, April 30, 2013 @ 2:00 PM, EDT
CITY CONTRACT #: 13-05
PROPOSAL NAME: Supply of Sportswear & Work Apparel

NAME, ADDRESS AND
BID OF EACH BIDDER

American Process Lettering Inc. (AMPRO)

Austin's Sports Center

BSN Sports

Metuchen Center, Inc.

30 Bunting Lane

2103 MacDade Boulevard

P. 0. Box 49

10-12 Embroidery St.

Primos, PA 19018

Holmes, PA 19043

Jenkintown, PA 19046

Sayreville, NJ 08872

Thomas M. Keating, Sales Manager

Joseph Austin, President

Lyn Weiss, Bid Specialist

Al Douglas, President

Quote Reference #3070227-13

Ph: (610) 623-9000, Ext. 1213

Ph: (610) 237-1551

Ph: (800) 445-9446

Ph: (732) 418-1388

Fax: (610) 623-1300

Fx: (610) 532-8286

Fx: (800) 523-5112

Fx: (732) 246-3341

email: Tkeating@amprosports.com email: austins@rcn.com email: passonsbid@bsnsports.com email: jreddington@gardenstateapparel.com
2013-2014 UNIT 2014-2015 UNIT 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
A ADMINISTRATION
1.0|Polo Shirts-Ping Pima Pique Shirts #P305 & LP305 S-XL no bid no bid $ 32.00 | $ 33.00 | no bid $ 28.49 28.49( $ 29.49
Color: TBD 2XL-4XL $ 33.00 | $ 34.00 $ 3149 | $ 3149 | $ 32.49
Brand Devon & Jones Mens Pima Pique Polo Devon & Jones
Item # D100 D440 & D440W
2.0|Polo Shirts-Ping Collection Dry Fiber Dynamics #P501 & LP501 S-XL no bid no bid $ 15.00 | $ 16.00 | no bid $ 2099 | $ 20.99 | $ 21.99
Color: TBD 2XL-4XL $ 17.00 | $ 17.00 $ 23.99 | $ 23.99 | $ 24.99
Brand Gildan 5.6 oz Dry Blend 50/50 Jersey Polo Part & Company
Item # G880 K455 & L455
TOTAL NUMBER OF LINE ITEMS IN GROUP A-ADMINISTRATION [ 0 2 $ 2.00
B AQUATIC & FITNESS CENTER
1.0|Polo Shirt-Port Authority-Silk Touch Polo #K500 & L500 S-XL $ 1595 | $ 16.45 | no bid $ 1250 | $ 1250 | $ 12.50 | no bid $ 1599 | $ 1599 | $ 16.99
Color:_strong blue or smoke blue 2XL-3XL $16.95/$18.95 $17.45/$19.45 $ 1450 | $ 1450 | $ 14.50 $ 18.99 | $ 18.99 | $ 19.99
Brand as specified as specified Port Authority
Item # K500 & KLOO
2.0|Polo Shirt-Ultra Club Micro-Pima Solid Polo #8535 & 8530 S-XL $ 1525 | $ 15.75 | no bid $ 12.35 | $ 12.35 | $ 12.35 | no bid $ 1599 | $ 1599 | $ 16.99
Color:_storm blue and black 2XL-3XL $16.25/$18.25 $16.75/$18.75 $ 1435 (% 1435 | $ 14.35 $ 18.99 | $ 18.99 | $ 19.99
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #
Polo Shirt-Ultra Club Micro-Pima Solid Polo #8535 & 8530 and/or
3.0|Approved Equal S-XL $ 1525 | $ 15.75 | no bid $ 1235 | $ 12.35 | $ 12351 % 32.00 | $ 33.00 |no bid $ 1599 | $ 1599 | $ 16.99
Color: storm blue and black 2XL-3XL $16.25/$18.75 $16.75/$18.75 $ 1435 (% 1435 | $ 14351 % 33.00 | $ 34.00 $ 18.99 | $ 18.99 | $ 19.99
Brand as specified as specified Devon & Jones Mens Prima Pigue Polo as specified
Item # D100
Polo Shirt-Sorrel Z2300 & 25300 Polyester Mesh Polo and/or
4.0|Approved Equal S-XL no bid $ 1295 | $ 1295 | $ 12951 % 28.00 | $ 29.00 | no bid no bid
Color: TBD 2XL-4XL $ 1495 | $ 1495 | $ 14951 % 30.00 | $ 31.00
Brand as specified Devon & Jones Mens & Womens Dri-Fast Polo
Item # DG385
4.0|Dri-Mesh Polo-Sport-Tek #T474 & L474 and/or Approved Equal S-XL $ 14.95 15.45 | no bid $ 18.25 | $ 18.25 | $ 18.25]1 % 28.00 | $ 29.00 | no bid $ 2149 | $ 2149 | $ 22.49
Color: TBD 2XL-4XL $15.95/$17.95/$18.95 $16.45/$18.45/$19.45 $ 2025 | $ 2025 | $ 20.25|$ 30.00 | $ 31.00 $ 2449 | $ 2449 | $ 25.49
Brand as specified as specified Devon & Jones Mens & Womens Dri-Fast Polo as specified
Item # DG385
5.0|T-Shirt-Badger 4820 and/or Approved Equal S-XL $ 12.60 12.95 | no bid $ 930 | $ 9.30 | $ 9.30|$ 16.00 | $ 16.00 | no bid $ 9.99 | $ 9.99 | $ 10.49
Color: TBD 2XL-4XL $12.60/$15.95/$17.95 $12.95/$16.45/$18.45 $ 1130 | $ 11.30 | $ 11301 % 17.00 | $ 17.00 $ 1299 | $ 1299 | $ 13.49
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
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BSN Sports

Metuchen Center, Inc.

30 Bunting Lane

2103 MacDade Boulevard

P. 0. Box 49

10-12 Embroidery St.
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email:_Tkeating@amprosports.com email: austins@rcn.com email: passonsbid@bsnsports.com email: jreddington@gardenstateapparel.com
2013-2014 UNIT 2014-2015 UNIT 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016
DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

T-Shirt-Badger 4820 and/or Approved Equal S-XL $ 1260 | $ 12.95 | no bid $ 930 % 9.30 | $ 9.00]$% 16.00 | $ 16.00 | no bid $ 999 |$ 9.99 | $ 10.49
Color-TBD 2XL-4XL $12.60/$15.95/$17.95 $12.95/$16.45/$18.45 $ 1130 $ 1130 | $ 11301 $ 17.00 | $ 17.00 $ 1299 | $ 1299 | $ 13.49
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
Tank Top-Lifeguards/Staff-Anvil 215 and/or Approved Equal S-XL $ 7.25|$ 7.50 | no bid $ 6.50 | $ 6.50 | $ 6.50 | $ 13.00 | $ 14.00 | no bid $ 7.99 | $ 7.99 | $ 8.49
Color-TBD 2XL $ 925 % 9.50 $ 7.95|% 7951 % 795]8% 14.00 | $ 15.00 $ 999 |$ 9.99 | $ 10.49
Brand as specified-white as specified as specified as specified
Item #
Tank Top-Event/Race-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2200 S-XL $ 550 |$ 5.75 | no bid $ 395|% 3.95 | $ 3.95]1% 12.00 $ 599 % 599 | % 6.49
Color-TBD 2XL $ 745 $ 7.70 $ 525|$% 525 % 525]$% 13.00 $ 799 % 799 % 8.49
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
T-Shirts-Staff-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 & 2000L S-XL no bid $ 425 $ 425 $ 4.251% 8.00 $ 499 % 4.99 | $ 5.49
Color-TBD 2XL-4XL $ 6.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 6.00]% 9.00 $ 599 % 599 % 6.49
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #
T-Shirts-Event/Race-Badger 4820 (Men's) , 4860 (Women's) &

.0/2820 Youth S-XL $ 11408 11.90 | no bid $ 875|% 875|$% 875]% 16.00 | $ 17.00 | no bid $ 969 |$ 969 | $ 9.99
Color-TBD 2XL-4XL $11.40/$14.40/$15.90 $11.90/$15.90/$16.40 $ 9.75|$ 9.75 | % 9.75] % 16.00 | $ 17.00 $ 1269 | $ 1269 | $ 12.99
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #

.0|T-Shirts-Youth/Toddler-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000B & 2000P S-XL $3.65 (w) $4.85 () $3.95 (w) $4.95(c) no bid $ 395|% 395|$% 3.95]% 8.00 | $ 9.00 | no bid $ 399 % 399 | $ 4.49
Color-TBD 2T-4-T $3.50 (W) $4.70 (0) $3.75 (W) $4.90 (c) $ 3.90 | $ 3.90 [ $ 3.90 [no bid no bid $ 3.99 [ $ 3.99 [ $ 4.49
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #

.0|T-Shirts Long Sleeve-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2400 & 2400L S-XL no bid $ 675 % 675 % 6.75]$% 11.00 | $ 12.00 | no bid $ 699 |$ 699 | $ 7.49
Color-TBD 2XL-4XL $ 850 |$ 850 | $ 850]$% 12.00 | $ 13.00 $ 799 % 799 % 8.49
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #

Sweatshirts Full Zip Hooded-Gildan Heavy Blend #18600 and/or

.0|Approved Equal S-XL no bid $ 16.95 | $ 16.95 | $ 16.95] $ 27.00 | $ 28.00 | no bid $ 19.99 | $ 19.99 | $ 20.99
Color-TBD 2XL-3XL $ 1995 $ 19.95 | $ 19951 % 28.00 | $ 29.00 $ 2299 | $ 2299 | $ 23.99
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #

.0[Shorts-Sport-Tek By Port Authority Ladies Cheer Short #L210 S-XL no bid $ 7.05|$ 7.05|$ 7.05 |no bid $ 7.99 | $ 7.99 | $ 8.49
Color-TBD 2XL $ 805|$% 8.05|$% 8.05 $ 899 % 899 | $ 9.49
Brand as specified as specified
Item #

.0[Shorts-Sport-Tek by Port Authority Jersey Knit Short #7110 S-XL no bid $ 8.50 | $ 8.50 | $ 8.50 |no bid $ 9.99 | $ 9.99 | $ 10.99
Color-TBD 2XL-4XL $ 950 | $ 9.50 | $ 9.50 $ 1099 | $ 10.99 | $ 11.99
Brand as specified as specified
Item #




SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, April 30, 2013 @ 2:00 PM, EDT

CITY CONTRACT #: 13-05

PROPOSAL NAME: Supply of Sportswear & Work Apparel

NAME, ADDRESS AND American Process Lettering Inc. (AMPRO) Austin's Sports Center BSN Sports Metuchen Center, Inc.
BID OF EACH BIDDER 30 Bunting Lane 2103 MacDade Boulevard P. O. Box 49 10-12 Embroidery St.
Primos, PA 19018 Holmes, PA 19043 Jenkintown, PA 19046 Sayreville, NJ 08872
Thomas M. Keating, Sales Manager Joseph Austin, President Lyn Weiss, Bid Specialist Al Douglas, President
Quote Reference #3070227-13
Ph: (610) 623-9000, Ext. 1213 Ph: (610) 237-1551 Ph: (800) 445-9446 Ph: (732) 418-1388
Fax: (610) 623-1300 Fx: (610) 532-8286 Fx: (800) 523-5112 Fx: (732) 246-3341
email:_Tkeating@amprosports.com email: austins@rcn.com email: passonsbid@bsnsports.com email: jreddington@gardenstateapparel.com
2013-2014 UNIT 2014-2015 UNIT 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
16.0|Gym Shorts-Champion #C82134 S-XL no bid 13.00 | $ 14.00 | no bid $ 899 % 899 | % 9.49
Color-TBD 2XL $ 875|% 875 % 8.75 14.00 | $ 15.00 $ 999 |$ 9.99 | $ 10.49
Brand $ 9.75 | $ 9.75 | $ 9.75 |Champion Champion
Item # as specified 8187 $ 8,187.00
17.0|Gym Shorts-Champion #CH3853 S-XL no bid $ 875|% 8751 $% 8.75 16.00 | $ 17.00 | no bid no bid
Color-TBD 2XL $ 9.75 | $ 9.75 | % 9.75 17.00 | $ 18.00
Brand as specified Champion
Item # CH3393
18.0|Fleece Vest-Port Authority F219 & L219 and/or Approved Equal S-XL $ 21.90 | $ 22.45 | no bid $ 16.95 | $ 16.95 | $ 16.95] $ 25.00 | $ 26.00 | no bid $ 2049 | $ 2049 | $ 21.49
Color-TBD 2XL-3XL $22.90/$24.90 $23.45/$25.45 $ 1895 | $ 18.95 | $ 18951 % 27.00 | $ 28.00 $ 2349 | $ 2349 | $ 24.49
Brand as specified as specified Harriton 80z Fleece Vest as specified
Item # M985
TOTAL NUMBER OF LINE ITEMS IN GROUP B-AQUATIC & FITNESS CENTER 18 $ 17.00
c BEACH FEE PROGRAM
1.0|Tank Top-Augusta #180 or Equal S-XL $ 525|% 5.50 | no bid $ 570 | $ 570 | $ 570]$% 11.00 | $ 12.00 | no bid $ 4.9 | $ 4.99 | $ 5.49
Color: gray w/dark blue imprint
Brand Gildan Ultra Cotton as specified as specified Anvil
Item # $ 215.00
2.0|Polo Shirts-Anvil/#4600 S-XL no bid $ 650 | $ 6.50 | $ 650 ] % 20.00 | $ 21.00 | no bid $ 849 |$ 8.49 | $ 9.49
Color:_light blue w/navy blue imprint
Brand as specified Anvil as specified
Item # $  4,610.00
3.0|Polo Shirt-Ultra Club Collection #8520 S-XL no bid $ 1195 $ 1195 | $ 11.95 | no bid $ 1149 $ 1149 | $ 11.99
Color:_royal w/white imprint 2XL-3XL $ 1495 | $ 14.95 | $ 14.95 $ 1399 | $ 13.99 | $ 14.49
Brand as specified as specified
Item #
4.0|T-Shirt-Hanes Heavyweight #5250 S-XL $ 275|% 2.90 | no bid $ 295|$% 2951 % 295]% 750 | $ 8.50 | no bid $ 299 % 349 $ 3.99
Color: white w/navy blue imprint
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
5.0|T-Shirts Long Sleeve-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2400 & 2400L S-XL $ 520 |$ 5.45 | no bid $ 525|$% 525 % 525]$% 10.90 | $ 11.90 | no bid $ 549 | $ 549 | $ 5.99
Color: white w/navy imprint color
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
6.0|Hat-Big Accessories, Inc. HCO Outlander #91309 one size no bid no bid $ 12.00 | $ 13.00 | no bid $ 799 % 799 % 7.99
Color: natural
Brand Big Accessories Guide Hat as specified
Item # BX016
7.0|Packaway Jackets-Ultra Club #8925 Hooded Pullover 1/4 Zip S-XL $ 1545 $ 15.75 | no bid $ 16.50 | $ 16.50 | $ 16.50 | $ 20.00 | $ 21.00 | no bid $ 1799 | $ 1799 | $ 18.99
Color:_true navy 2XL-4XL $17.95/$19.95 $18.45/$20.45 $ 19.25 | $ 1925 | $ 19251 % 21.00 | $ 20.00 $ 2199 | $ 2199 | $ 22.99
Brand as specified as specified Harriton Packable Nylon Jacket as specified
Item # M750




SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, April 30, 2013 @ 2:00 PM, EDT
CITY CONTRACT #: 13-05
PROPOSAL NAME: Supply of Sportswear & Work Apparel

NAME, ADDRESS AND American Process Lettering Inc. (AMPRO) Austin's Sports Center BSN Sports Metuchen Center, Inc.
BID OF EACH BIDDER 30 Bunting Lane 2103 MacDade Boulevard P. O. Box 49 10-12 Embroidery St.
Primos, PA 19018 Holmes, PA 19043 Jenkintown, PA 19046 Sayreville, NJ 08872
Thomas M. Keating, Sales Manager Joseph Austin, President Lyn Weiss, Bid Specialist Al Douglas, President
Quote Reference #3070227-13
Ph: (610) 623-9000, Ext. 1213 Ph: (610) 237-1551 Ph: (800) 445-9446 Ph: (732) 418-1388
Fax: (610) 623-1300 Fx: (610) 532-8286 Fx: (800) 523-5112 Fx: (732) 246-3341
email:_Tkeating@amprosports.com email: austins@rcn.com email: passonsbid@bsnsports.com email: jreddington@gardenstateapparel.com
2013-2014 UNIT 2014-2015 UNIT 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
8.0|Hat-Ultra Club Headwear #8105 one size $ 345 % 3.65 | no bid $ 315|$% 315 $ 315]1% 6.00 | $ 7.00 | no bid $ 369$% 3.69 | $ 3.69
Color: 2 tone khaki/navy
Brand as specified as specified Adams 6 Panel Low Profile 2 Tone Unstructured Cap | as specified
Item # AD969
9.0|Baguette Waist Apron-Topper #9420 one size $ 525|% 5.50 | no bid $ 315|$% 315 $ 315]1$% 4.00 | $ 5.00 | no bid $ 269 % 269 | $ 2.69
Color: navy blue
Brand Ultra Club as specified Big Accessories 3 pocket 10" Waist Apron Capco
Item # 8203 Apr-50 9420
TOTAL NUMBER OF LINE ITEMS IN GROUP C-BEACH FEE PROGRAM 6 8 9
D PARKING REGULATIONS AND REVENUE COLLECTION
1.0|Polo Shirt-Gildan Ultra Blend #8800 S-XL $ 565 |% 5.95 | no bid $ 5.65|% 565 | % 565]$% 15.00 | $ 16.00 | no bid $ 549 | $ 549 | $ 5.99
Color: TBD 2XL-5XL $ 895|$% 8.95 $ 850 % 850 | $ 850]$% 16.00 | $ 17.00 $ 849 |$ 849 | $ 8.99
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
2.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 & 2000L S-XL $ 445 $ 4.75 | no bid $ 395|% 3.95 | $ 3.95]1% 8.00 | $ 9.00 | no bid $ 449 |$ 449 | $ 4.99
Color: TBD 2XL-5XL $ 695 % 7.25 $ 595|$% 595 | % 595]% 9.00 | $ 10.00 $ 549 | $ 549 | $ 5.99
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #
3.0|Baguette Waist Apron-Topper #9420 one size $ 525|$% 5.50 | no bid $ 315|$% 315 $ 315]1% 4.00 | $ 5.00 | no bid $ 269 % 269 | $ 2.99
Color: navy blue
Brand Ultra Club as specified Big Accessories 3-Pocket Waist Apron Capro
Item # 8203 Apr-50 9420
4.0|Visor, Toppers Gen-X Sport Visor #3904 one size no bid $ 580 % 580 | % 580]$% 10.00 | $ 11.00 | no bid $ 649 | $ 6.49 | $ 6.99
Color: navy blue
Brand as specified Anvil Solid Low Profile Visor Capco
Item # $ 158.00 4130
5.0|Hat-Big Accessories, Inc. HCO Outlander #91309 one size no bid no bid $ 17.00 | $ 18.00 | no bid $ 1249 | $ 1249 | $ 12.99
Color: navy
Brand Big Accessories Guide Hat as specified
Item # BX016
6.0|Hat Flex Fit V-Cotton Twill #5001 S-XL no bid $ 825|% 825|$% 825]% 18.00 | $ 19.00 | no bid $ 1099 | $ 10.99 | $ 11.99
Color: navy
Brand as specified Yupoongs Flexfit 6 Panel Cap as specified
Item # $ 6,377.00
7.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Blend #8000 & 8000B S-XL $ 420 | $ 4.45 | no bid $ 450 % 450 | $ 4501 % 12.00 | $ 13.00 | no bid $ 449 | $ 449 | $ 4.99
Color: TBD 2XL-5XL $ 625 % 6.50 $ 625 % 625 % 625]% 13.00 | $ 14.00 $ 549 | $ 549 | $ 5.99
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
8.0/Women's Flat Front Shorts, Dickie Brand #FR221 (6-18) $ 19.45 | $ 19.45 | no bid no bid no bid $ 11.99 | $ 1249 | $ 12.99
Color: navy
Brand as specified as specified
Item #




SUMMARY OF BIDS
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email:_Tkeating@amprosports.com email: austins@rcn.com email: passonsbid@bsnsports.com email: jreddington@gardenstateapparel.com
2013-2014 UNIT 2014-2015 UNIT 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016
DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Men's Flat Front Shorts, Dickie #42234FF one size no bid no bid no bid $ 1325 $ 13.75 | $ 14.25
Color: navy
Brand as specified
Item #
Jacket-Devon & Jones Shelter Island #D750 & #D750W S-XL no bid $ 3375 | $ $ 33.75] % 32.00 | $ 33.00 | no bid $ 39.99 | $ 39.99 | $ 40.99
Color: royal/navy 2XL-4XL $ 3575 | $ $ 35.75] % 33.00 | $ 34.00 $ 4299 | $ 4299 | $ 43.99
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #
TOTAL NUMBER OF LINE ITEMS IN GROUP D-PARKING REGULATIONS AND REVENUE COLLECT|5 7 10
PLANNING & ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT
Polo Shirts-Outer Banks Basic Polo with Pocket #2100 & 2400 S-XL no bid $ 785 $ $ 7.85 | no bid $ 1399 | $ 13.99 | $ 14.99
Color: TBD 2XL-4XL $ 9.95|$ $ 9.95 $ 16.99 | $ 16.99 | $ 17.99
Brand as specified as specified
Item #
Sweatshirts-Sport Tek Pullover Hooded Sweatshirt #F281 S-XL no bid $ 25.00 | $ $ 25.00] % 25.00 | $ 26.00 | no bid $ 26.99 | $ 27.49 | $ 27.99
Color: TBD 2XL-4XL $ 27.00 | $ $ 27.00] % 26.00 | $ 27.00 $ 29.99 | $ 3049 | $ 30.99
Brand as specified Hanes as specified
Item # 10 oz Cotton Pullover Hood
TOTAL NUMBER OF LINE ITEMS IN GROUP E-PLANNING & ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT 0 2 $ 2.00

PUBLIC RELATIONS
T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 & 2000L S-XL no bid $ 575|$% $ 575]$% 8.00 | $ 9.00 | no bid $ 499 % 4.99 | $ 5.49
Color: TBD 2XL-4XL $ 725% $ 7.25]1$% 850 | $ 9.50 $ 599 % 599 | % 6.49
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #
T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2400 & 2400L S-XL no bid $ 740 $ $ 7.40]% 11.00 | $ 12.00 | no bid $ 799 % 799 % 8.49
Color: TBD 2XL-4XL $ 925 % $ 9.25]$% 12.00 | $ 13.00 $ 899 % 899 | % 9.49
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #
Long Sleeve T-Shirt-Gildan Ultra Cotton #8400 & 8400L S-XL no bid $ 655 |$ $ 6.55] % 11.00 | $ 12.00 | no bid $ 749 % 749 | $ 7.99
Color: TBD 2XL-3XL $ 855|% $ 855]% 12.00 | $ 13.00 $ 849 |$ 8.49 | $ 8.99
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #

.0|Polo Shirts-Ultra Club Egyptian Interlock Polo #8503 & 8504 S-XL no bid $ 1550 | $ $ 15501 $ 28.00 | $ 29.00 | no bid $ 1799 | $ 1799 | $ 18.99
Color: TBD 2XL-4XL $ 1750 | $ $ 17501 $ 30.00 | $ 31.00 $ 2099 | $ 2099 | $ 21.99
Brand as specified Devon & Jones Solid Prima Interlock Polo M/W as specified
Item # D1405 & D1405W

.0[Polo Shirts-Ultra Club Micro-Pima Patterned Polo #8582 & 8583 S-XL no bid $ 22.00 | $ $ 22.00 | no bid $ 19.99 | $ 19.99 | $ 20.99
Color: TBD 2XL-3XL $ 24.00 | $ $ 24.00 $ 2299 | $ 2299 | $ 23.99
Brand as specified as specified
Item #
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Thomas M. Keating, Sales Manager Joseph Austin, President Lyn Weiss, Bid Specialist Al Douglas, President
Quote Reference #3070227-13
Ph: (610) 623-9000, Ext. 1213 Ph: (610) 237-1551 Ph: (800) 445-9446 Ph: (732) 418-1388
Fax: (610) 623-1300 Fx: (610) 532-8286 Fx: (800) 523-5112 Fx: (732) 246-3341
email:_Tkeating@amprosports.com email: austins@rcn.com email: passonsbid@bsnsports.com email: jreddington@gardenstateapparel.com
2013-2014 UNIT 2014-2015 UNIT 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

6.0|Polo Shirts-Ultra Club Cool-N -Dry #8405 & 8407 S-XL no bid $ 1425 $ 1425 | $ 14.25 | no bid $ 16.99 | $ 16.99 | $ 17.99
Color: TBD 2XL-6XL $ 1725 $ 1725 | $ 17.25 $ 2099 | $ 2099 | $ 21.99
Brand as specified as specified
Item #

7.0|Polo Shirts-Ultra Club Cool-N-Dry #8425 S-XL no bid $ 14751 $ 1475 | $ 14.75 | no bid $ 1599 | $ 1599 | $ 16.99
Color: TBD 2XL-4XL $ 1675 $ 16.75 | $ 16.75 $ 1799 | $ 1799 | $ 18.99
Brand as specified as specified
Item #

8.0|Polo Shirts- Ultra Club Cool-N-Dry #8425 S-XL no bid $ 1475 $ 1475 | $ 14.75 | no bid $ 1599 | $ 1599 | $ 16.99
Color: TBD 2XL-4XL $ 1675 $ 16.75 | $ 16.75 $ 1799 | $ 1799 | $ 18.99
Brand as specified as specified
Item #

Dress Shirts Long Sleeve Performance Pinpoint-Ultra Club #8360 &

9.0{8361 S-XL no bid $ 2325 | $ 2325 | % 23.25 | no bid $ 2499 | $ 2499 | $ 25.99
Color: TBD 2XL-3XL $ 2525 | $ 2525 | $ 25.25 $ 26.99 | $ 2699 | $ 27.99
Brand as specified as specified
Item #

10.0|Sweatshirts-Gildan Ultra Blend #12000 S-XL no bid $ 1150 | $ 1150 | $ 11501 $ 18.50 | $ 19.50 | no bid $ 1349 $ 1349 | $ 13.99
Color: TBD 2XL-3XL $ 1350 | $ 1350 | $ 13501 $ 20.00 | $ 21.00 $ 1549 | $ 1549 | $ 15.99
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #

11.0|Jacket Hooded Fleeced Lined-Ultra Club #8915 S-XL $ 2795 | $ A $ 2695 | $ 2695 | $ 26.95]% 40.00 | $ 41.00 | no bid $ 2799 | $ 2799 | $ 28.99
Color: TBD 2XL-4XL $29.95/$31.95/$33.95 $30.95/$32.95/$34.95 $ 28.95 | $ 28.95 | $ 28.95]$% 42.00 | $ 43.00 $ 3299 |$ 3299 | $ 33.99
Brand as specified as specified Dickies Fleece Line Hooded Jacket as specified
Item # $ 33,237.00

12.0|Jacket-Luna Pier Coach Jacket #BB9515 S-XL no bid $ 1525 | $ 1525 | $ 15.25 | no bid no bid
Color: TBD 2XL-4XL $ 1725 $ 1725 | $ 17.25
Brand as specified
Item #

13.0|Work Pants-Dickies Original #874 (28-48) $ 30.00 | $ 32.00 | no bid no bid $ 34.00 | $ 35.00 | no bid $ 1849 | $ 1849 | $ 18.49
Color: navy blue
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #

TOTAL NUMBER OF LINE ITEMS IN GROUP F-PUBLIC RELATIONS 2 12 $ 12.00
G RECREATION DIVISION

1.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 & 2000L S-XL $ 9.80 | $ 10.25 | no bid $ 525|$% 525 % 525]$% 13.00 | $ 14.00 | no bid $ 749 $ 749 | $ 7.49
Color:_dark color-TBD
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #




SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, April 30, 2013 @ 2:00 PM, EDT
CITY CONTRACT #: 13-05
PROPOSAL NAME: Supply of Sportswear & Work Apparel

NAME, ADDRESS AND American Process Lettering Inc. (AMPRO) Austin's Sports Center BSN Sports Metuchen Center, Inc.
BID OF EACH BIDDER 30 Bunting Lane 2103 MacDade Boulevard P. O. Box 49 10-12 Embroidery St.
Primos, PA 19018 Holmes, PA 19043 Jenkintown, PA 19046 Sayreville, NJ 08872
Thomas M. Keating, Sales Manager Joseph Austin, President Lyn Weiss, Bid Specialist Al Douglas, President
Quote Reference #3070227-13
Ph: (610) 623-9000, Ext. 1213 Ph: (610) 237-1551 Ph: (800) 445-9446 Ph: (732) 418-1388
Fax: (610) 623-1300 Fx: (610) 532-8286 Fx: (800) 523-5112 Fx: (732) 246-3341
email:_Tkeating@amprosports.com email: austins@rcn.com email: passonsbid@bsnsports.com email: jreddington@gardenstateapparel.com
2013-2014 UNIT 2014-2015 UNIT 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
2.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 & 2000L S-XL $ 6.60 | $ 6.95 | no bid $ 525|$% 525 % 525]$% 13.00 | $ 14.00 | no bid $ 549 | $ 549 | $ 5.99
Color: dark color-TBD 2XL-4XL $ 9.00 | $ 9.25 $ 685 % 6.85| % 685]% 14.00 | $ 15.00 $ 649 | $ 6.49 | $ 6.99
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
3.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2400 & 2400L S-XL $ 1075 $ 10.95 | no bid $ 7.65|% 765 % 765]$% 14.00 | $ 15.00 | no bid $ 749 % 749 | $ 7.99
Color: dark color-TBD 2XL-4XL $ 1225 $ 12.45 $ 935|$% 935 % 9.35]$% 15.00 | $ 16.00 $ 849 |$ 849 | $ 8.99
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
4.0[Shooter Shirt-Augusta #203 S-XL $ 10.40 $10.50 | no bid $ 6.95|%$ 695 | % 6.95]% 1350 | $ 14.50 | no bid $ 749 % 749 | $ 7.99
Color: dark color-TBD 2XL-3XL $11.50/$12.40 $11.60/12.50 $ 795|% 7951 % 795]% 1450 | $ 15.50 $ 849 |$ 849 | $ 8.99
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
5.0|V-Neck T Shirt-Anvil #652 S-XL $ 9.60 | $ 9.75 | no bid $ 625 % 625 % 625]% 14.00 | $ 15.00 | no bid $ 599 % 599 % 6.49
Color:_dark color-TBD
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
6.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Blend #8000 & 8000B S-L Youth $ 4.95 | $ 5.25 | no bid $ 460 % 4.60 | $ 4.60 1% 15.00 | $ 16.00 | no bid $ 649 | $ 6.49 | $ 6.99
Color: 6 sets of 10, 6 colors S-XL Adult $ 4.90 | $ 5.20 $ 480 % 4.80 | 4.8 $ 16.00 | $ 17.00 $ 649 | $ 6.49 | $ 6.99
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
7.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 & 2000B S-XL no bid $ 595 % 595 | % 595]% 14.00 | $ 15.00 | no bid $ 599 % 599 | % 6.49
Color: TBD 2XL-4XL $ 750 $ 750 | $ 750]$% 15.00 | $ 16.00 $ 699 |$ 699 | $ 7.49
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #
8.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 2000B S-XL no bid $ 595 % 595 | % 595]% 13.00 | $ 14.00 | no bid $ 599 % 599 | % 6.49
Color:_dark color-TBD
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #
9.0|T-Shirts Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 & 2000B S-XL $ 6.15|$ 6.30 | no bid $ 550 % 550 | $ 5.50 ] no bid $ 849 |$ 899 | % 8.99
Color: _sixteen (16) colors TBD 2XL-4XL $ 815 % 8.30 $ 725% 7.2517..25 $ 949 | $ 9.99 | $ 9.99
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #
10.0|T-Shirts Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000B S-XL $ 575 % 5.95 | no bid $ 395|% 395|$% 3.95 | no bid $ 499 % 4.99 | $ 5.49
Color:_4 sets of 10 shirts 4 colors TBD
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #
11.0|Shooter Shirt-Augusta #203 & 204 S-L Youth $ 625 % 6.25 | no bid 6.50 6.50 6.50 ] no bid 6.29 6.29 6.79
Color: ten (10) different colors S-XL Adult $ 6.95 | $ 6.95 6.95 6.95 6.95 6.89 6.89 7.39
2XL-3XL $7.95/$8.70 $7.95/$8.70 7.95 7.95 7.95 7.99 7.99 8.49
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #




SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, April 30, 2013 @ 2:00 PM, EDT
CITY CONTRACT #: 13-05
PROPOSAL NAME: Supply of Sportswear & Work Apparel

NAME, ADDRESS AND American Process Lettering Inc. (AMPRO) Austin's Sports Center BSN Sports Metuchen Center, Inc.
BID OF EACH BIDDER 30 Bunting Lane 2103 MacDade Boulevard P. O. Box 49 10-12 Embroidery St.
Primos, PA 19018 Holmes, PA 19043 Jenkintown, PA 19046 Sayreville, NJ 08872
Thomas M. Keating, Sales Manager Joseph Austin, President Lyn Weiss, Bid Specialist Al Douglas, President
Quote Reference #3070227-13
Ph: (610) 623-9000, Ext. 1213 Ph: (610) 237-1551 Ph: (800) 445-9446 Ph: (732) 418-1388
Fax: (610) 623-1300 Fx: (610) 532-8286 Fx: (800) 523-5112 Fx: (732) 246-3341
email:_Tkeating@amprosports.com email: austins@rcn.com email: passonsbid@bsnsports.com email: jreddington@gardenstateapparel.com
2013-2014 UNIT 2014-2015 UNIT 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
12.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 S-XL $ 4.60 | $ 4.90 | no bid $ 495 % 4.95 | $ 4.95]1% 13.00 | $ 14.00 | no bid $ 549 | $ 549 | $ 5.49
Color: twelve (12) different medium & dark colors TBD
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
Jerseys-Venus Knitting Mills/VKM Air Knit Mesh Jersey #A570 &
13.0|Y570 M-L Youth no bid $ 965 |$ 9.65| % 9.65 | no bid $ 1199 | $ 1150 | $ 12.49
Color: four (4) sets (1 set is 12 shirts) 4 different colors TBD S-XL Adult $ 9.65 | $ 9.65 | $ 9.65 $ 1249 | $ 1249 | $ 12.99
Brand as specified as specified
Item #
14.0|Coach T-Shirts-Gildan #2000 S-XL $ 525|% 5.50 | no bid $ 395|% 395|$% 395]% 11.00 | $ 12.00 | no bid $ 499 % 4.99 | $ 4.99
Color:_dark color-TBD
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
15.0|T-Shirts-Fruit of the Loom #5930R & 5930BR S-L Youth $ 475 $ 4.95 | no bid $ 385|% 385|8% 385]% 9.00 | $ 10.00 | no bid $ 449 | $ 449 | $ 4.99
Color: 8 sets/8 colors (1 set is 12 shirts) S-XL Adult $ 445 $ 4.65 $ 395|% 395 | $ 3.95]% 9.00 | $ 10.00 $ 449 | $ 449 | $ 4.99
Brand as specified not indicated as specified
Item #
16.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 S-L Youth $ 525|% 5.50 | no bid $ 415$% 415 $ 4.15]1% 13.00 | $ 14.00 | no bid $ 449 | $ 449 | $ 4.99
Color: 4 sets/4 colors (1 set is 12 shirts) TBD S-XL Adult $ 4.95 | $ 5.25 $ 425|% 425 $ 4.25]1% 14.00 | $ 15.00 $ 449 | $ 449 | $ 4.99
Brand as specified not indicated as specified
Item #
17.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 S-XL $ 645 | $ 6.75 | no bid $ 495 % 4.95 | $ 4.951% 13.00 | $ 14.00 | no bid $ 599 % 599 | % 6.29
Color:_dark color-TBD
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
18.0|T-Shirt-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 S-XL $ 550 | $ 550 | $ 550]$% 13.00 | $ 14.00 | no bid $ 649 | $ 6.49 | $ 6.99
Color: dark color-TBD 2XL-3XL no bid $ 675 % 675 % 6.75]$% 14.00 | $ 15.00 $ 799 % 799 % 8.49
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #
19.0|Adult Baseball Tee-Anvil #2184 S-XL no bid $ 1135 (% 1135 | $ 1135] % 18.00 | $ 19.00 | no bid $ 1349 | $ 1349 | $ 13.99
Color: TBD 2XL-3XL $ 1295 | $ 1295 | $ 12951 % 18.00 | $ 19.00 $ 1549 | $ 1549 | $ 15.99
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #
20.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Blend #8000 & 8000B S-L Youth $ 7.00 % 7.00 | no bid $ 550 % 550 | $ 550]$% 9.00 | $ 10.00 | no bid $ 649 | $ 6.49 | $ 6.99
Color: dark color-TBD S-XL Adult $ 645 | $ 6.45 $ 575|$% 5751 % 575]$% 9.00 | $ 10.00 $ 649 | $ 6.49 | $ 6.99
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
21.0[Shorts Badger Sports #2202 & 7202 Cheer Shorts S-L Youth $ 9.00 | $ 9.25 | no bid $ 6.75|% 675 % 6.75]$% 13.00 | $ 14.00 | no bid $ 749 % 749 | $ 7.99
Color: TBD S-XL Adult $ 945 | $ 9.75 $ 6.95|% 6.95| % 6.95]3% 13.00 | $ 14.00 $ 749 % 749 | $ 7.99
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
22.0[Shorts-Soffee #M307 Cheer Shorts S-L Junior no bid $ 695 % 695 | % 6.95]% 13.00 | $ 14.00 | no bid $ 799 % 799 % 8.49
Color:_dark color-TBD
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #




SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, April 30, 2013 @ 2:00 PM, EDT
CITY CONTRACT #: 13-05
PROPOSAL NAME: Supply of Sportswear & Work Apparel

NAME, ADDRESS AND American Process Lettering Inc. (AMPRO) Austin's Sports Center BSN Sports Metuchen Center, Inc.
BID OF EACH BIDDER 30 Bunting Lane 2103 MacDade Boulevard P. O. Box 49 10-12 Embroidery St.
Primos, PA 19018 Holmes, PA 19043 Jenkintown, PA 19046 Sayreville, NJ 08872
Thomas M. Keating, Sales Manager Joseph Austin, President Lyn Weiss, Bid Specialist Al Douglas, President
Quote Reference #3070227-13
Ph: (610) 623-9000, Ext. 1213 Ph: (610) 237-1551 Ph: (800) 445-9446 Ph: (732) 418-1388
Fax: (610) 623-1300 Fx: (610) 532-8286 Fx: (800) 523-5112 Fx: (732) 246-3341
email:_Tkeating@amprosports.com email: austins@rcn.com email: passonsbid@bsnsports.com email: jreddington@gardenstateapparel.com
2013-2014 UNIT 2014-2015 UNIT 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
23.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Blend #8000B S-L Youth $ 475 $ 4.95 | no bid $ 405|$% 4.05 | $ 4.051% 10.00 | $ 11.00 | no bid $ 439 % 439 | $ 4.39
Color:_dark color-TBD
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
24.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Blend #8000B S-L Youth $ 475 $ 4.95 | no bid $ 405|$% 4.05 | $ 4.051% 10.00 | $ 11.00 | no bid $ 439$% 439 | $ 4.79
Color: dark color-TBD S-XL Adult $ 445 $ 4.65 $ 425% 4.25 | $ 4.251% 10.00 | $ 11.00 $ 439 % 439 | $ 4.79
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
25.0|Polo Shirts-Ultra Club Cool-N-Dry #8435 & 8436 S-XL no bid $ 1810 | $ 18.10 | $ 18.10 | no bid $ 1949 | $ 1949 | $ 19.99
Color: TBD
Brand as specified as specified
Item #
26.0|Polo Shirts-Gildan #3800 S-XL no bid $ 1110 $ 1110 | $ 11101 $ 17.00 | $ 18.00 | no bid $ 1249 | $ 1249 | $ 12.99
Color: TBD
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #
27.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 L Youth $ 435 $ 4.50 | no bid $ 470 $ 470 | $ 4.701$ 12.00 | $ 13.00 | no bid $ 749 $ 749 | $ 7.99
Color: white w/2 color print-TBD S-XL Adult $ 435 $ 4.50 $ 480 % 4.80 | $ 4801 % 12.00 | $ 13.00 $ 749 % 749 | $ 7.99
Brand as specified not indicated as specified as specified
Item #
28.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 S-L Youth no bid $ 395|% 395|% 395]% 12.00 | $ 13.00 | no bid $ 529 % 529 % 5.79
Color: navy S-XL Adult $ 415 $ 415 $ 4.15]1$% 12.00 | $ 13.00 $ 529 |$% 529 | % 5.79
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #
29.0(Shorts-Soffee #M036 Shorts S-L Adult no bid $ 840 | $ 8.40 | $ 8.40]$% 18.00 | $ 19.00 | no bid $ 859 % 859 | $ 8.59
Color: grey
Brand as specified Badger Defender Short as specified
Item # $  4,112.00
30.0|T-Shirts-Soffee #B345 & M305 S-L Youth no bid $ 825|$% 825|% 825]% 9.00 | $ 10.00 | no bid $ 579 % 579 1% 5.99
Color: grey S-L Adult $ 840 | $ 8.40 | $ 8.40]$% 9.00 | $ 10.00 $ 659 |$ 659 | $ 6.99
Brand as specified Fruit of the Loom 5 oz Cotton T-Shirt as specified
Item # $ 3,931.00
31.0|Baseball Style Hat-flex Fit Style #6777 & 6777Y One-Size Youth | no bid $ 875|$% 875|$% 875]% 18.00 | $ 19.00 | no bid $ 699 |$ 699 | $ 7.49
Color: navy One-Size Adult $ 895|$% 895 % 895]% 18.00 | $ 19.00 $ 699 |$ 699 | $ 7.49
Brand not indicated Yupoong Flexfit 6 Panel Cap
Item # $ 6,377.00 as specified
32.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 & 2000B S-L Youth $ 510 $ 5.25 | no bid $ 390 % 3.90 | % 3.90 | no bid $ 395|% 395|$% 4.50
Color: dark color-TBD S-XL Adult $ 4.95 | $ 4.95 $ 405|$% 4.05 | $ 4.05 $ 395|% 395|8% 4.50
Brand as specified not indicated as specified
Item #
33.0|Tennis Championship v-Neck T-Shirt-Anvil #652 S-L Adult $ 7251% 7.50 | no bid $ 525|$% 525 % 5.25 | no bid $ 629 % 629 | $ 6.29
Color:_dark color-TBD
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #




SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, April 30, 2013 @ 2:00 PM, EDT
CITY CONTRACT #: 13-05
PROPOSAL NAME: Supply of Sportswear & Work Apparel

NAME, ADDRESS AND American Process Lettering Inc. (AMPRO) Austin's Sports Center BSN Sports Metuchen Center, Inc.
BID OF EACH BIDDER 30 Bunting Lane 2103 MacDade Boulevard P. O. Box 49 10-12 Embroidery St.
Primos, PA 19018 Holmes, PA 19043 Jenkintown, PA 19046 Sayreville, NJ 08872
Thomas M. Keating, Sales Manager Joseph Austin, President Lyn Weiss, Bid Specialist Al Douglas, President
Quote Reference #3070227-13
Ph: (610) 623-9000, Ext. 1213 Ph: (610) 237-1551 Ph: (800) 445-9446 Ph: (732) 418-1388
Fax: (610) 623-1300 Fx: (610) 532-8286 Fx: (800) 523-5112 Fx: (732) 246-3341
email:_Tkeating@amprosports.com email: austins@rcn.com email: passonsbid@bsnsports.com email: jreddington@gardenstateapparel.com
2013-2014 UNIT 2014-2015 UNIT 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
34.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 & 2000B S-XL $ 475 $ 4.95 | no bid $ 395|% 395 | $ 3.95 | no bid $ 499 |$ 4.99 | $ 5.29
Color:_dark color-TBD
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #
35.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 S-L Adult $ 4.95 | $ 5.25 | no bid $ 550 % 550 | $ 5.50 ] no bid $ 599 % 599 | % 6.49
Color: navy with gold print
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #
36.0|Hat-Yupoong Flex Fit Baseball Caps #6997 Youth no bid $ 815 % 815 | % 815]$% 16.00 | $ 17.00 | no bid $ 1199 $ 1199 | $ 12.49
Color: navy blue Adult $ 875|$% 875 % 875]% 16.00 | $ 17.00 $ 119 | $ 11.99 | $ 12.49
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #
37.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 & 2000B S-L Youth 5.50 5.75 | no bid 4.95 4.95 4.95 14.00 15.00 | no bid 5.29 5.29 5.49
Color: dark color-TBD S-XL Adult 5.25 5.50 5.10 5.10 5.10 14.00 15.00 5.29 5.29 5.49
2XL-3XL 7.25 7.50 6.25 6.25 6.25 14.00 15.00 6.29 6.29 6.49
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
38.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 & 2000B S-XL $ 575 % 5.95 | no bid $ 6.15|$ 6.15| % 6.15]% 14.00 | $ 15.00 | no bid $ 7291% 729 1% 7.29
Color:_dark color-TBD
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
Infant Pull Over Towel Bib-L.A.T. Sportswear, Inc.-Rabbit Skins
39.0|#1000 One-Size no bid $ 425 $ 425 | $ 4.25 | no bid $ 599 % 599 | % 6.49
Color:_dark color-TBD
Brand as specified as specified
Item #
40.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 S-L Youth 5.50 5.75 | no bid 3.90 3.90 3.90 13.00 14.00 | no bid 5.29 5.29 5.79
Color: dark color-TBD S-XL Adult 5.25 5.50 3.95 3.95 3.95 13.00 14.00 5.29 5.29 5.79
2XL-3XL 5.75 7.50 4.25 4.25 4.25 13.00 14.00 6.79 6.79 7.29
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
41.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 &0 2000B S-L Youth no bid $ 575 % 5751 % 575]$% 14.00 | $ 15.00 | no bid $ 899 % 899 | % 9.49
Color: white S-XL Adult $ 595 % 595 % 595]$% 14.00 | $ 15.00 $ 899 % 899 | % 9.49
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #
TOTAL NUMBER OF LINE ITEMS BID IN GROUP G-RECREATION DIVISION 26 41 $ 41.00
H PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
1.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 S-XL $ 440 $ 4.60 | no bid $ 460 % 4.60 | $ 4.601$ 13.00 | $ 14.00 | no bid $ 499 % 4.99 | $ 5.29
Color: fluorescent safety green #188 w/black imprint 2XL-5XL $ 6.35|$ 6.50 $ 575 | $ 575 | % 575|$ 13.00 | $ 14.00 $ 6.49 | $ 6.49 | $ 6.79
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
2.0[Polo Shirts-Anvil Short Sleeve Sport Shirt #5002 S-XL no bid $ 620 | $ 6.20 | $ 6.20]$% 17.00 | $ 18.00 | no bid $ 799 % 799 % 8.49
Color: heather gray w/black imprint 2XL-5XL $ 750 | $ 750 | $ 750 |$ 18.00 | $ 19.00 $ 9.99 | $ 9.99 | $ 10.49
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #




SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, April 30, 2013 @ 2:00 PM, EDT

CITY CONTRACT #: 13-05

PROPOSAL NAME: Supply of Sportswear & Work Apparel

NAME, ADDRESS AND American Process Lettering Inc. (AMPRO) Austin's Sports Center BSN Sports Metuchen Center, Inc.
BID OF EACH BIDDER 30 Bunting Lane 2103 MacDade Boulevard P. O. Box 49 10-12 Embroidery St.
Primos, PA 19018 Holmes, PA 19043 Jenkintown, PA 19046 Sayreville, NJ 08872
Thomas M. Keating, Sales Manager Joseph Austin, President Lyn Weiss, Bid Specialist Al Douglas, President
Quote Reference #3070227-13
Ph: (610) 623-9000, Ext. 1213 Ph: (610) 237-1551 Ph: (800) 445-9446 Ph: (732) 418-1388
Fax: (610) 623-1300 Fx: (610) 532-8286 Fx: (800) 523-5112 Fx: (732) 246-3341
email:_Tkeating@amprosports.com email: austins@rcn.com email: passonsbid@bsnsports.com email: jreddington@gardenstateapparel.com
2013-2014 UNIT 2014-2015 UNIT 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
3.0/Scrub Tops-Landau Solid Twist V-Neck Tunic #8219 S-XL no bid no bid no bid no bid
Color: _shade of blue TBD 2XL-5XL
Brand
Item #
4.0|Scrub Tops-Landau Patterned Twist V-neck Tunic #82190 S-XL no bid no bid no bid no bid
Color: _shade of blue TBD 2XL-5XL
Brand
Item #
5.0|Scrub Pants-Landau Classic Fit Pant #8320 S-XL no bid no bid no bid no bid
Color: _shade of blue TBD 2XL-5XL
Brand
Item #
6.0|Work Pants-Dickies Original #874 28-48 $ 30.00 | $ 32.00 | no bid no bid no bid $ 1799 [ $ 1799 | $ 18.99
Color: navy blue
Brand as specified as specified
Item #
TOTAL NUMBER OF LINE ITEMS IN GROUP H-PUBLIC WORKS 2 2 $ 3.00
1 PUBLIC WORKS-GROUNDS
1.0|T-Shirts-Gildan Ultra Cotton #2000 S-XL $ 440 $ 4.60 | no bid $ 485|% 4.85 | $ 4851 % 11.00 | $ 12.00 | no bid $ 499 % 4.99 | $ 5.49
Color: fluorescent safety green #188 w/black imprint 2XL-5XL $ 6.35|$ 6.50 $ 5.95 | $ 5.95|$ 5.95|$ 12.00 | $ 13.00 $ 649 | $ 6.49 | $ 6.99
Brand as specified as specified as specified as specified
Item #
2.0[Polo Shirt-Gildan Ultra Cotton #3800 S-XL no bid $ 7.95|$% 7951 % 795]% 17.00 | $ 18.00 | no bid $ 799 1% 799 % 8.49
Color: TBD 2XL-5XL $ 940 | $ 9.40 | $ 9.40]$% 18.00 | $ 19.00 $ 999 |$ 9.99 | $ 10.49
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #
3.0/Polo Shirt Gildan Ultra Blend #8800 S-XL no bid $ 675 % 675 % 6.75]$% 14.00 | $ 15.00 | no bid $ 699 |$ 699 | $ 7.49
Color: TBD 2XL-5XL $ 875|% 875|$% 875]% 16.00 | $ 17.00 $ 849 |$ 849 | $ 8.99
Brand as specified as specified as specified
Item #
4.0[Jacket-Luna Pier Coach Jacket #BB9515 S-XL no bid $ 1525 | $ 1525 | $ 15.25 | no bid no bid
Color: TBD 2XL-5XL $ 1775 $ 1775 | $ 17.75
Brand as specified
Item #
5.0|Baseball Style Hat-Flex Fit Style #6777 & 6777Y One Size no bid $ 855 % 855 | % 855]% 14.00 | $ 15.00 | no bid $ 1049 | $ 1049 | $ 10.49
Color: TBD
Brand as specified Yupoong Flexfit Athletic Mesh Cap as specified
Item # 6777 & 6777Y |




SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, April 30, 2013 @ 2:00 PM, EDT
CITY CONTRACT #: 13-05
PROPOSAL NAME: Supply of Sportswear & Work Apparel

NAME, ADDRESS AND American Process Lettering Inc. (AMPRO) Austin's Sports Center BSN Sports Metuchen Center, Inc.
BID OF EACH BIDDER 30 Bunting Lane 2103 MacDade Boulevard P. O. Box 49 10-12 Embroidery St.
Primos, PA 19018 Holmes, PA 19043 Jenkintown, PA 19046 Sayreville, NJ 08872
Thomas M. Keating, Sales Manager Joseph Austin, President Lyn Weiss, Bid Specialist Al Douglas, President
Quote Reference #3070227-13
Ph: (610) 623-9000, Ext. 1213 Ph: (610) 237-1551 Ph: (800) 445-9446 Ph: (732) 418-1388
Fax: (610) 623-1300 Fx: (610) 532-8286 Fx: (800) 523-5112 Fx: (732) 246-3341
email: Tkeating@amprosports.com email: austins@rcn.com email: passonsbid@bsnsports.com email: jreddington@gardenstateapparel.com
2013-2014 UNIT 2014-2015 UNIT 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016 2013-2014 2014-2015 2015-2016
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
6.0|Work Pants-Dickies Original #874 28-48 $ 30.00 | $ 32.00 | no bid no bid no bid $ 16.99 [ $ 16.99 | $ 16.99
Color: navy blue
Brand as specified as specified
Item #
TOTAL NUMBER OF LINE ITEMS IN GROUP I-PUBLIC WORKS-GROUNDS 2 |5 $ 5.00
[
TOTAL NUMBER OF GROUPS BID (A-1) 54 95 $ 9.00
|
NUMBER OF DAYS FOR DELIVERY AFTER RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER not indicated 15 $ 30.00 10-15 days
I
Required Information
RIGHT TO EXTEND-TIME FOR AWARD: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO
STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE STATEMENT: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO
NJ MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY LANGUAGE: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO
NJ AFFIRMATIVE ACTION COMPLIANCE NOTICE: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RECEIPT OF ADDENDA: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO
NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE (BRC) SUBMITTED: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO




