PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

CITY OF OCEAN CITY

AMERICA'S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

CITY CONTRACT #: 13-12
PROPOSAL NAME: Supply of Lifeguard Uniforms

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, April 30, 2013 @ 2:00 PM, EDT

NAME, ADDRESS AND
BID OF EACH BIDDER

Austin's Sports Center

Metuchen Center, Inc.

\Wave One Sports Inc.

2103 MacDade Boulevard

10-12 Embroidery Street

1992 Batler Pike

Holmes, PA 19043

Sayreville, NJ 08872

Conshohocken, PA 19428

Joseph Austin, President

Al Douglas, President

Peter Oppenheimer, President

Ph: (610) 237-1551

Ph: (732) 418-1388

Ph: (610) 238-4770

Fx: (610) 532-8286

Fx: (732) 246-3341

Fx: (610) 238-9098

email: austins@rcn.com email: jreddington@gardenstateapparel.com
2013-14 2014-2015 2015-16 2013-14 2014-2015 2015-16 2013-14 2014-2015 2015-16 2013-14 2014-2015 2015-16 2013-14 2014-2015 2015-16
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
A SHIRTS-TANKS, T-SHIRTS & SPORTSWEAR
1.0|Tank Tops -SAMPLE REQUIRED S-XL no bid $ 1999 [ $ 2099 | $ 21.99 | no bid
Unique Sale Co. #152-no sub.
2.0|T-Shirt -SAMPLE REQUIRED S-XL $ 9.95 [ $ 9.95 | $ 9.951$% 11.99 [ $ 11.99 | $ 12.99 ] no bid
Ultra Club #8400 Right Fit-no sub. XXL $ 1095 | $ 1095 | $ 1095]1$ 1299 | $ 1299 | $ 13.99
3.0[Long Sleeve T-Shirts S-XL $ 1425 | $ 1425 | $ 1425]1$% 1499 | $ 1499 | $ 15.99 | no bid
Ultra Club #8401 Right Fit-no sub. XXL $ 15.25 [ $ 15.25 [ $ 15251 $ 15.99 | $ 15.99 | $ 16.99
4.0[/Raglan Men's Sport Shirt-Navy Blue S-XL $ 15.95 [ $ 15.95 [ $ 15.951 $ 17.99 | $ 17.99 | $ 18.49 ] no bid
Sport-Tek #T475-no sub. XXL $ 1695 | $ 1695 | $ 16951 % 1899 [ $ 1899 | $ 19.49
5.0|Raglan Men's Sport Shirt-White S-XL $ 15.95 | $ 15.95 [ $ 15.95]1 $ 17.99 | $ 17.99 | $ 18.49 | no bid
Sport-Tek #T475-no sub. XXL $ 16.95 | $ 16.95 | $ 16.95 1 $ 18.99 | $ 18.99 | $ 19.49
6.0[Raglan Men's Sport Shirt-Red S-XL $ 15.95 [ $ 15.95 [ $ 15.951 $ 17.99 | $ 17.99 | $ 18.49 ] no bid
Sport-Tek #T475-no sub. XXL $ 1695 | $ 1695 | $ 16951 % 1899 | $ 1899 | $ 19.49
7.0|Raglan Ladies Sport Shirt-Navy S-L $ 15.95 | $ 15.95 | $ 15.95 1 $ 17.99 | $ 17.99 | $ 18.49 | no bid
Sport-Tek #L475-no sub.
8.0[Raglan Ladies Sport Shirt-White S-L $ 15.95 [ $ 15.95 [ $ 15.951 $ 17.99 | $ 17.99 | $ 18.49 ] no bid
Sport-Tek #L475-no sub.
9.0|Raglan Ladies Sport Shirt-Red S-L $ 15.95 | $ 15.95 | $ 15.95]1 $ 17.99 | $ 17.99 | $ 18.49 | no bid
Sport-Tek #L475-no sub.
B SWIM SUITS & BOARD SHORTS
1.0|Women's One-Piece Swimsuit-Navy Blue 28-38 no bid $ 48.95 | $ 48.95 | $ 48.95 | no bid
Speedo #7190113-no sub.
2.0|Women's One Piece Swimsuit-Navy Blue 28-38 no bid $ 48.95 | $ 48.95 | $ 48.95 | no bid
Speedo #7190104- no sub.
3.0|Women's One-Piece Swimsuit-Navy Blue 28-38 no bid $ 48.95 | $ 48.95 | $ 48.95 | no bid
Speedo #7190434-no sub.
4.0|Women's Two-Piece Swimsuit-Navy Blue 6-14 no bid $ 48.95 | $ 48.95 | $ 48.95 | no bid
Speedo #7190164 and/or approved equal
5.0|Women's Fly Back Top-Navy Blue XS-XL no bid $ 28.95 | $ 28.95 | $ 28.95 | no bid
Speedo #7190436 and/or approved equal
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6.0/Women's Swim Suit Bottom XS-XL no bid $ 2895 | $ 2895 $ 28.95 | no bid
Speedo #7190437 and/or approved equal
7.0| Lifeguard Male Board Shorts-Navy Blue 22-44 no bid no bid no bid
Maui Rippers Lifeguard Shorts- no sub.
8.0|Lifeguard Female Board Shorts-Navy Blue 1-15 no bid no bid no bid
Maui Rippers Lifeguard Shorts- no sub.
JACKETS, SWEATSHIRTS, WARM UP PANTS &
C RAINGEAR
1.0|JACKETS-Red M-XL no bid no bid $ 78.00 | $ 79.00 [ $ 80.00
Guard Wave One Sports-no sub. XXL $ 84.00 | $ 84.00 | $ 85.00
2.0[JACKETS-Navy M-XL no bid no bid $ 78.00 | $ 79.00 | $ 80.00
Administration Wave One Sports-no sub. XXL $ 84.00 | $ 84.00 | $ 85.00
3.0/WARM-UP PANTS-Red M-XL no bid no bid $ 40.00 | $ 42.00 | $ 43.00
Guard Wave One Sports-no sub. XXL $ 45.00 | $ 47.00 | $ 48.00
4.0/WARM-UP PANTS-Navy M-XL no bid no bid $ 40.00 | $ 42.00 | $ 43.00
Administration Wave One Sports-no sub. XXL $ 45.00 | $ 47.00 | $ 48.00
5.0[SWEATSHIRT-HOODED-Light Ash S-XL no bid $ 3299 | $ 3299 | $ 33.99 | no bid
Eagle US Style #S1102 and/or approved equal XXL $ 34.99 [ $ 34.99 | $ 35.99
6.0[RAINGEAR-Orange S-XL no bid no bid
Rainfair RN #91539-no sub.
C OTHER ITEMS-HATS
1.0|HAT-Natural ONE SIZE | no bid $ 1199 [ $ 1199 | $ 12.99 | no bid
Big Accessories, Inc. HCO Outlander-no sub.
2.0[BASEBALL STYLE HAT-Navy/Red ONE SIZE no bid $ 949 | $ 949 | $ 9.99 | no bid
FlexFit Style #6577S-no sub.
3.0[BASEBALL STYLE HAT-Navy/Red S-M no bid $ 1049 | $ 1049 | $ 10.99 | no bid
FlexFit Cool & Dry Style #6077-no sub. S-XL $ 10.49 | $ 10.49 | $ 10.99
Required Information
RIGHT TO EXTEND-TIME FOR AWARD: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO
STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE STATEMENT: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO
NJ MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY LANGUAGE: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO
NJ AFFIRMATIVE ACTION COMPLIANCE NOTICE: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RECEIPT OF ADDENDA: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO
NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE (BRC) SUBMITTED: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO
NUMBER OF COPIES SUBMITTED: (3) YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO N YES/NO YES/NO




