PURCHASING DIVISION

SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS
BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

CITY OF OCEAN CITY

AMERICA’S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

DATE RECEIVED: Thursday, October 31, 2013 @ 2:00 PM, EDT
CITY CONTRACT #: 14-09
PROPOSAL NAME: Supply & Delivery of Sand Fence & Posts & Posts & Rail Fence Materials

NAME, ADDRESS AND Capital Forest Products Chemung Supply Corp. EB Fence, LLC Lumberman Associates, Inc.
BID OF EACH BIDDER 107 Gibralter Avenue PO Box 527 23 Red Fox Terrace 2101 Hunter Road
Annapolis, MD 21401 2420 Corning Road Sicklerville, NJ 08081 PO Box 720
Elmira, NY 14902 Bristol, PA 19007
Mark Kobylinski-Sales Rep Christopher Michelini-Vice President
440-759-2080-Phone Carl Perine-Vice President 609-704-8884-Phone Tom Coleman-Vice President
866-220-4010-Fax 607-733-5506-Phone 609-543-2335-Fax 215-785-4600-Phone
mkobylinski@capital forest.com 607-732-5379-Fax ebfence@comcast.net 215-785-5645-Fax
cperine@chemungsupply.com tomc@lumbermanass%com
OoNrTPRtce 1 1 | ONITPRICE
11/15/13- UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE 11/15/13- UNIT PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY 5/15/14 11/15/13-5/15/14 11/15/13-5/15/14 5/15/14 11/15/13-5/15/14
1|SAND FENCE
Supply & Delivery of Snow Fence
City of Ocean City 0-0 Rolls N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Borough of Avalon 0- 500 Rolls $ 39.25 $ 44.95 $ 68.00 $ 37.35 $ -
City of Sea Isle City 0- 0 Rolls N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2|WOODEN POST
Supply & Delivery of Seven (7') Foot Wooden Post
City of Ocean City 0-0 Each N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Borough of Avalon 0- 500 Each $ 6.05 No Bid $ 22.50 $ 8.85 $ -
City of Sea Isle City 0- 0 Each N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
3[RAILS FOR POST & RAIL FENCE
Supply& Delivery of Rails
City of Ocean City 0- 1,000 Rails $ 6.95 No Bid $ 15.00 $ 6.84 $ -
Borough of Avalon 0- 500 Rails $ 6.95 No Bid $ 15.00 $ 6.84 $ -
City of Sea Isle City 0- 100 Rails $ 7.50 No Bid $ 15.00 $ 6.84 $ -
4|WOODEN POST FOR POST & RAIL FENCE
Supply & Delivery of Wooden Post
City of Ocean City 0- 2,000 Each $ 11.25 No Bid $ 22.50 $ 9.63 $ -
Borough of Avalon 0- 500 Each $ 11.25 No Bid $ 22.50 $ 9.63 $ -
City of Sea Isle City 0- 100 Each $ 11.75 No Bid $ 22.50 $ 9.63 $ -
Required Information
RIGHT TO EXTEND-TIME FOR AWARD: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO
STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE STATEMENT: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO
MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY LANGUAGE: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RECEIPT OF ADDENDA: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO
NJ AFFIRMATIVE ACTION COMPLIANCE NOTICE: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO
CERTIFICATE OF ORIGIN: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO
NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE (BRC) SUBMITTED: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO
NUMBER OF COPIES SUBMITTED: (3) 3 3 3 3




