SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

CITY OF OCEAN CITY

AMERICA’'S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

DATE RECEIVED: Thursday, September 25, 2014 @ 2:00 PM, EDT
CITY CONTRACT NO: 14-34
CONTRACT NAME: SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF LUMBER AND PILING

KEY

NAME, ADDRESS AND
BID OF EACH BIDDER

Awarded as per 40A:11-18 -American goods & products

to be used whenever possible.

Unit Price Bid - Commodity

Lumberman Associates, Inc.

Tague Lumber, Inc.

P. O. Box 720

560 East High Street

Bristol, PA 19007

Philadelphia, PA 19144

Thomas C. Coleman, Vice President

Jeff Sandaver, Sales Representative

Ph: (215) 785-4600

Ph: (215) 848-2500, ext. 110

Fx: (215) 785-5645

Fx: (215) 848-0433

email: tomc@lumbermanassoc.com

email: jsandaver@taguelumber.com

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

oTY

UNIT COST TOTAL COST

UNIT COST

TOTAL COST

UNIT COST

TOTAL COST

UNIT COST

TOTAL COST

GROUP A - 5/4" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE

[

5/4"x 6"x10', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, E4E, MCA/CA above ground contact, Type C,

Grade #2

PCS

N

5/4"x 6"x 8', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, E4E,MCA above ground contact, Type C,

Grade Premium

0- 1,440

PCS

7,344.00

8,985.60

w

5/4"x 6"x12', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, E4E,MCA above ground contact, Type C,

Grade Premium

0- 480

PCS

$ 830|$

3,984.00

4,675.20

GROUP A TOTAL AMOUNT

$ 11,328.00

13,660.80

TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID

2

2

GROUP B - 1" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE

NOT REQUIRED AT THIS TIME

GROUP C - 2" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE

[

2"x4"x16', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, E4E, MCA/CA above ground contract

Type C, Grade #1

0- 100

PCS

985.00

$ 1011 $

1,011.00

N

2"x6"x10', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, E4E, MCA/CA above ground contact, Type C,

2.1A - Southern pine, SP1B Table 1.B

select structural only, S4S,E4E with fiber

bending rating of 2550 psi. All lumber

shall be K.D.A.T or A.D.A.T. to achieve

in-service moisture content of 19% after

treatment. Heartwood shall be less than 10%

PCS




SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

CITY CONTRACT NO: 14-34
CONTRACT NAME: SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF LUMBER AND PILING

KEY

NAME, ADDRESS AND
BID OF EACH BIDDER

Awarded as per 40A:11-18 -American goods & products
to be used whenever possible.

Unit Price Bid - Commodity

Lumberman Associates, Inc.

Tague Lumber, Inc.

P. O. Box 720

560 East High Street

Bristol, PA 19007

Philadelphia, PA 19144

Thomas C. Coleman, Vice President

Jeff Sandaver, Sales Representative

Ph: (215) 785-4600

Ph: (215) 848-2500, ext. 110

Fx: (215) 785-5645

Fx: (215) 848-0433

email: tomc@lumbermanassoc.com

email: jsandaver@taguelumber.com

ITEM

DESCRIPTION QTY

UNIT COST TOTAL COST

UNIT COST

TOTAL COST

UNIT COST

TOTAL COST

UNIT COST

TOTAL COST

w

2"x6"x12', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, E4E, MCA/CA above ground contact, Type C,

2.1A - Southern pine, SP1B Table 1.B

select structural only, S4S,E4E with fiber

bending rating of 2550 psi. All lumber

shall be K.D.A.T or A.D.A.T. to achieve

in-service moisture content of 19% after

Treatment. Heartwood shall be less than 10% 640- 5,000

PCS

$ 1025 $

51,250.00

$ 1298 [ $

64,900.00

N

2"x6"x16', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, E4E, MCA/CA above ground contact, Type C,

2.1A - Southern pine, SP1B Table 1.B

select structural only, S4S,E4E with fiber

bending rating of 2550 psi. All lumber

shall be K.D.A.T or A.D.A.T. to achieve

in-service moisture content of 19% after

treatment. Heartwood shall be less than 10% 128- 5,000

PCS

$ 1415[ $

70,750.00

$ 1750 $

87,500.00

&

2"x6"x20', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, E4E, MCA/CA above ground contact, Type C,

2.1A - Southern pine, SP1B Table 1.B

select structural only, S4S,E4E with fiber

bending rating of 2550 psi. All lumber

shall be K.D.A.T or A.D.A.T. to achieve

in-service moisture content of 19% after

treatment. Heartwood shall be less than 10% 0- 1,000

PCS

$ 1920 $

19,200.00

$ 2750 [ $

27,500.00

)

2"x10"x12', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, E4E, MCA above ground contact, Type C,

Grade #2 0- 1,000

PCS

$ 1380 [ $

13,800.00

$ 13.00 [ $

13,000.00

~

2"x10"x14', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, E4E, MCA above ground contact, Type C,

Grade #2 0- 250

PCS

$ 1530 [ $

3,825.00

$ 1474 | $

3,685.00

GROUP C TOTAL AMOUNT

$ 159,810.00

197,596.00

TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP C 6

6

6




SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

CITY CONTRACT NO: 14-34
CONTRACT NAME: SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF LUMBER AND PILING

KEY

NAME, ADDRESS AND
BID OF EACH BIDDER

Awarded as per 40A:11-18 -American goods & products
to be used whenever possible.

Unit Price Bid - Commodity

Lumberman Associates, Inc.

Tague Lumber, Inc.

P. O. Box 720

560 East High Street

Bristol, PA 19007

Philadelphia, PA 19144

Thomas C. Coleman, Vice President

Jeff Sandaver, Sales Representative

Ph: (215) 785-4600

Ph: (215) 848-2500, ext. 110

Fx: (215) 785-5645

Fx: (215) 848-0433

email: tomc@lumbermanassoc.com

email: jsandaver@taguelumber.com

ITEM

DESCRIPTION QTY

UNIT COST TOTAL COST

UNIT COST TOTAL COST

UNIT COST

TOTAL COST

UNIT COST

TOTAL COST

GROUP D - 3" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE

[

3"x4"x10', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, MCA/CA ground contact,

2.1A - Southern pine, SP1B Table 1.B

select structural only, S4S,E4E with fiber

bending rating of 2550 psi. All lumber

shall be K.D.A.T or A.D.A.T. to achieve

in-service moisture content of 19% after

treatment. Heartwood shall be less than 10% 0- 500

PCS

$ 1170 [ $

5,850.00

$ 1699 [ $ 8,495.00

N

3"x4"x12', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, MCA/CA ground contact,

2.1A - Southern pine, SP1B Table 1.B

select structural only, S4S,E4E with fiber

bending rating of 2550 psi. All lumber

shall be K.D.A.T or A.D.A.T. to achieve

in-service moisture content of 19% after

treatment. Heartwood shall be less than 10% 0- 500

PCS

$ 1395 $

6,975.00

$ 2059 [ $ 10,295.00

w

3"x6"x12', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, rRadious Edge Surfacing, MCA ground contact,

2.1A - Southern pine, SP1B Table 1.B

select structural only, S4S, Radius Edge Surfacing

with fiber bending rating of 2550 psi. All lumber

shall be K.D.A.T or A.D.A.T. to achieve

in-service moisture content of 19% after

treatment. Heartwood shall be less than 10% 0- 10,000

PCS

$ 2150 | $ 215,000.00

$ 2444 $ 244,400.00

o

3"x10"x12', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, Micro ground contact, Type C, Grade #2 0- 4,000

PCS

$ 2645 | $ 105,800.00

$ 2813 $ 112,520.00

&)

3"x10"x14', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, Micro ground contact, Type C, Grade #2 0- 200

PCS

$ 30.95 | $

6,190.00

$ 3282 | $ 6,564.00

)

3"x12"x20", Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, MCA/CA ground contact, Type C, Grade #2 0- 50

PCS

$ 31.80 | $

1,590.00

$ 36.41 | $ 1,820.50

~

3"x12"x16', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, MCA/CA ground contact, Type C, Grade #2 0- 25

PCS

$ 4345 | $

1,086.25

$ 48.55 | $ 1,213.75

@

3"x12"x20", Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, MCA/CA ground contact, Type C, Grade #2 0- 25

PCS

$ 63.50 | $

1,587.50

$ 8182 | $ 2,045.50

©

3"x12"x24', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, MCA/CA ground contact, Type C, Grade #2 0- 25

PCS

$ 84.50 | $

2,112.50

$ 11659 | $ 2,914.75

GROUP D TOTAL AMOUNT

$ 346,191.25

$ 390,268.50

TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP D 9

9

9




SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

CITY CONTRACT NO: 14-34
CONTRACT NAME: SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF LUMBER AND PILING

NAME, ADDRESS AND Lumberman Associates, Inc. Tague Lumber, Inc.
BID OF EACH BIDDER P. O. Box 720 560 East High Street
Bristol, PA 19007 Philadelphia, PA 19144
KEY Thomas C. Coleman, Vice President Jeff Sandaver, Sales Representative
Awarded as per 40A:11-18 -American goods & products
to be used whenever possible.
Ph: (215) 785-4600 Ph: (215) 848-2500, ext. 110
Unit Price Bid - Commodity Fx: (215) 785-5645 Fx: (215) 848-0433
email: tomc@lumbermanassoc.com email: jsandaver@taguelumber.com
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
GROUP E - 4" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE
NOT REQUIRED AT THIS TIME
GROUP F — 6 " SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE
NOT REQUIRED AT THIS TIME
GROUP G - 2 7/8" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE
NOT REQUIRED AT THIS TIME
GROUP H - FIR PLYWOOD
1[1/2" x 4' x 8', AC Fir Plywood 0- 100 PCS NO BID NOBID | $ 34.00 | $ 3,400.00 | $ $ $ -
2[3/4" x 4 x 8', AC Fir Plywood 0- 100 PCS NO BID NOBID | $ 4320 [ $ 4,320.00] ¢ $ $ -
3|3/4" x 4' x 8', CDX Fir Plywood 0- 100 PCS NO BID NOBID | $ 3155 $ 3,155.00| $ $ $ -
4]1/2" x 4' x 8', CDX, 4 ply, Fir Plywood 0- 200 PCS NO BID NO BID 2173 $ 4,346.00 $ $ -
GROUP H TOTAL AMOUNT NO BID $ 15,221.00 $ - $ -
TOTAL ITEMS BID IN GROUP H 4 0 4
GROUP I - PILING
1[35' Piling, 12" Butt, 8" Tip, 2.5 CCA 0- 400 Pcs |'s 333.90 133,560.00 | $ 39263 $ 157,052.00 | $ $ $ -
2[35' Piling, 16" Butt, 8" Tip, 2.5 CCA 0- 400 Pcs |'s 841.75 336,700.00 | $ 84558 [ $ 338,232.00| $ $ $ -
GROUP | TOTAL AMOUNT 470,260.00 $ 495,284.00 $ - $ -
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP | 2 2 2
GROUP J - WHITE PINE - VARIOUS SIZES
NOT REQUIRED AT THIS TIME
GROUP K- HEM/FIR-VARIOUS SIZES
NOT REQUIRED AT THIS TIME
GROUP L - MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS
1[1/4"x4'x8', Luan Underlayment 0- 100 PCS NO BID NOBID] $ 929 $ 929.00| $ $ $ -
2[5/4"x4"x18', Perma Trim in White 0- 50 PCS NO BID NOBID | $ 2520 | $ 1,260.00 | $ $ $ -
GROUP L TOTAL AMOUNT NO BID $ 2,520.00 $ - $ -
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP L 2 2
Required Information
RIGHT TO EXTEND-TIME FOR AWARD: Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y/N
STOCKHOLDERS DISCLOSURE STATEMENT: Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y/N
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT: Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y/N
MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY LANGUAGE: Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y/N
AFFIRMATIVE ACTION REGULATION COMPLIANCE NOTICE: Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y/N
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RECEIPT OF ADDENDA: Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y/N
NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE (BRC): Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y/N
CERTIFICATE OF ORIGIN: Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y/N
DISCLOSURE OF INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES IN IRAN STATEMENT: Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y/N
NUMBER OF COPIES (3): Y Y




