CITY OF OCEAN CITY

AMERICA'S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

PURCHASING DIVISION DATE RECEIVED: Thursday, March 19, 2015 @ 2:00 PM, EDT
SUMMARY OF BIDS 251COCCPS CITY CONTRACT #: 15-01
PROPOSAL NAME: Firework Shows for the Calendar Years 2015 & 2016

for the City of Ocean City & the City of Ocean City
BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

Cooperative Pricing System Members
NAME, ADDRESS AND Pyrotecnico Zambelli Fireworks
BID OF EACH BIDDER P. O. Box 149 20 South Mercer Street
New Castle, PA 16103 New Castle, PA 16101
Ken Furstoss, Show Producer Damian C. DiCola
Ph: (856) 697-1023 Ph: (800) 245-0397, ext. 1004
Fx: (856) 697-9557 Fx: (732) 658-8318
email: kfurstoss@pyrotecnico.com email: ddicola@sambellifireworks.com
TOTAL AMOUNT FOR THE TOTAL AMOUNT FOR THE TOTAL AMOUNT FOR TOTAL AMOUNT FOR TOTAL AMOUNT FOR
ITEM DESCRIPTION SHOW SHOW THE SHOW THE SHOW THE SHOW
BASE BID-CITY OF OCEAN CITY, OCEAN CITY, NJ
1. CALENDAR YEAR 2015-FOURTH OF JULY FIREWORKS SHOW
1.a|BASE RATE FOR THE FIREWORKS SHOW AS SPECIFIED $ 48,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
Scheduled Show Date/Time: Saturday, July 4, 2015 @ 10:00 PM-
10:15 PM EDT
1.b|RATE FOR WEATHER/RAIN DELAY POSTPONEMENT $ 8,375.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
TOTALOF ITEMS 1L.a& 1.b $ 56,375.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
2. CALENDAR YEAR 2016-FOURTH OF JULY FIREWORKS SHOW
2.a|BASE RATE FOR THE FIREWORKS SHOW AS SPECIFIED $ 48,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
Scheduled Show Date/Time: Monday, July 4, 2016 @ 10:00 PM-
10:15 PM EDT
2.b|RATE FOR WEATHER/RAIN DELAY POSTPONEMENT $ 8,375.00
TOTAL OF ITEMS 2.a & 2.b $ 56,375.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
3. CALENDAR YEAR 2015 INDIAN SUMMER WEEKEND FIREWORKS SHOW
3.a|BASE RATE FOR THE FIREWORKS SHOW AS SPECIFIED $ 48,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
Scheduled Show Date/Time: Saturday, October 10, 2015 @ 10:00-
10:15 PM, EDT
3.b|RATE FOR WEATHER/RAIN DELAY POSTPONEMENT $ 8,375.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
TOTAL OF ITEMS 3.a& 3.b $ 56,375.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
4. CALENDAR YEAR 2016-INDIAN SUMMER WEEKEND FIREWORKS SHOW
4.a|BASE RATE FOR THE FIREWORKS SHOW AS SPECIFIED $ 48,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
Scheduled Show Date/Time: Saturday, October 8, 2016 @ 10:00 PM-
10:15 PM, EDT
4.b|RATE FOR WEATHER/RAIN DELAY POSTPONEMENT $ 8,375.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
TOTAL OF ITEMS 4.a & 4.b $ 56,375.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
TOTAL FOR ALL OF OCEAN CITY SHOWS-ITEMS 1.a, 2.a,3.a & 4.a $ 192,000.00 NO BID $ - $ - 3$ -




PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED:
251COCCPS CITY CONTRACT #:
PROPOSAL NAME:

Thursday, March 19, 2015 @ 2:00 PM, EDT

15-01

Firework Shows for the Calendar Years 2015 & 2016
for the City of Ocean City & the City of Ocean City

Cooperative Pricing S

stem Members

NAME, ADDRESS AND
BID OF EACH BIDDER

Pyrotecnico

Zambelli Fireworks

P. O. Box 149

20 South Mercer Street

New Castle, PA 16103

New Castle, PA 16101

Ken Furstoss, Show Producer

Damian C. DiCola

Ph: (856) 697-1023

Ph: (800) 245-0397, ext. 1004

Fx: (856) 697-9557

Fx: (732) 658-8318

email: kfurstoss@pyrotecnico.com

email: ddicola@sambellifireworks.com

TOTAL AMOUNT FOR THE TOTAL AMOUNT FOR THE TOTAL AMOUNT FOR TOTAL AMOUNT FOR TOTAL AMOUNT FOR
ITEM DESCRIPTION SHOW SHOW THE SHOW THE SHOW THE SHOW
BASE BID-CITY OF SEA ISLE, SEA ISLE, NJ
5. CALENDAR YEAR 2015-FOURTH OF JULY FIREWORKS SHOW
5.a/|BASE RATE FOR THE FIREWORKS SHOW AS SPECIFIED $ 44,500.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
Scheduled Show Date/Time: Saturday, July 4, 2015 @ 9:00 PM-9:18
PM EDT
5.b|RATE FOR WEATHER/RAIN DELAY POSTPONEMENT $ 6,875.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
(plus $1700 per
day for barge)| $ 1,700.00
TOTAL OF ITEMS5.a&5.b $ 53,075.00 $ - $ - $ - $ _
6. CALENDAR YEAR 2016-FOURTH OF JULY FIREWORKS SHOW
6.a|BASE RATE FOR THE FIREWORKS SHOW AS SPECIFIED $ 44,500.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
Scheduled Show Date/Time: Monday, July 4, 2016 @ 9:00 PM-9:18
PM EDT
6.b|RATE FOR WEATHER/RAIN DELAY POSTPONEMENT $ 6,875.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
(plus $1700 per
day for barge)| $ 1,700.00
TOTAL OF ITEMS 6.a & 6.b 3$ 53,075.00 $ - $ - $ - $ _
7. CALENDAR YEAR 2015-DECEMBER 31ST FIREWORKS
7.a|BASE RATE FOR THE FIREWORKS SHOW AS SPECIFIED $ 6,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
Scheduled Show Date/Time: Thursday, December 31, 2015 @ 8:00
PM - 8:10 PM EST
7.b|RATE FOR WEATHER/RAIN DELAY POSTPONEMENT $ 1,500.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
TOTALOF ITEMS 7.a& 7.b $ 7,500.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
8. CALENDAR YEAR 2016-DECEMBER 31ST FIREWORKS
8.a|BASE RATE FOR THE FIREWORKS SHOW AS SPECIFIED $ 6,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
Scheduled Show Date/Time: Thursday, December 31, 2016 @ 8:00
PM - 8:10 PM EST
8.b|RATE FOR WEATHER/RAIN DELAY POSTPONEMENT $ 1,500.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
TOTAL OF ITEMS 8.a & 8.b $ 7,500.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
TOTAL OF ALL OF THE SEA ISLE CITY SHOWS-ITEMS 5.a., 6.a, 7.a & 8.a $ 101,000.00 NO BID $ - $ - 3$ -




PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

251COCCPS CITY CONTRACT #: 15-01
PROPOSAL NAME: Firework Shows for the Calendar Years 2015 & 2016

stem Members

DATE RECEIVED: Thursday, March 19, 2015 @ 2:00 PM, EDT

for the City of Ocean City & the City of Ocean City
Cooperative Pricing S

NAME, ADDRESS AND
BID OF EACH BIDDER

Pyrotecnico

Zambelli Fireworks

P. O. Box 149

20 South Mercer Street

New Castle, PA 16103

New Castle, PA 16101

Ken Furstoss, Show Producer

Damian C. DiCola

Ph: (856) 697-1023

Ph: (800) 245-0397, ext. 1004

Fx: (856) 697-9557

Fx: (732) 658-8318

email: kfurstoss@pyrotecnico.com

email: ddicola@sambellifireworks.com

TOTAL AMOUNT FOR THE TOTAL AMOUNT FOR THE TOTAL AMOUNT FOR TOTAL AMOUNT FOR TOTAL AMOUNT FOR
ITEM DESCRIPTION SHOW SHOW THE SHOW THE SHOW THE SHOW
BASE BID-TOWNSHIP OF OCEAN, WARETOWN, NJ
9. CALENDAR YEAR 2015-(FOUNDERS DAY)
MEMORIAL DAY WEEKEND FIREWORKS SHOW
9.a|BASE RATE FOR THE FIREWORKS SHOW AS SPECIFIED $ 10,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
Scheduled Show Date/Time: Saturday, May 23, 2015 @ 9:15 pm-
9:31-9:33 EDT; Rain Date: Sunday, May 24, 2015
9.b|RATE FOR WEATHER/RAIN DELAY POSTPONEMENT $ 2,500.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
TOTAL OF ITEMS9.a&9.b $ 12,500.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
10. CALENDAR YEAR 2016-(FOUNDERS DAY)
MEMORIAL DAY WEEKEND FIREWORKS SHOW
10.a|BASE RATE FOR THE FIREWORKS SHOW AS SPECIFIED $ 10,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
Scheduled Show Date/Time: Saturday, May 28, 2016 @ 9:15 pm-
9:31-9:33 EDT; Rain Date: Sunday, May 29, 2016
10.b|RATE FOR WEATHER/RAIN DELAY POSTPONEMENT $ 2,500.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
TOTAL OF ITEMS 10.a & 10.b 3$ 12,500.00 $ - $ - $ - $ _
TOTAL FOR ALL OF THE TOWNSHIP OF OCEAN SHOWS-ITEMS 9.a & 10.a $ 20,000.00 NO BID $ - $ - $ -




PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED:

251COCCPS CITY CONTRACT #:
PROPOSAL NAME:

Thursday, March 19, 2015 @ 2:00 PM, EDT

15-01

Firework Shows for the Calendar Years 2015 & 2016
for the City of Ocean City & the City of Ocean City

Cooperative Pricing S

stem Members

NAME, ADDRESS AND
BID OF EACH BIDDER

Pyrotecnico

Zambelli Fireworks

P. O. Box 149

20 South Mercer Street

New Castle, PA 16103

New Castle, PA 16101

Ken Furstoss, Show Producer

Damian C. DiCola

Ph: (856) 697-1023

Ph: (800) 245-0397, ext. 1004

Fx: (856) 697-9557

Fx: (732) 658-8318

email: kfurstoss@pyrotecnico.com

email: ddicola@sambellifireworks.com

TOTAL AMOUNT FOR THE

TOTAL AMOUNT FOR THE

TOTAL AMOUNT FOR

TOTAL AMOUNT FOR

TOTAL AMOUNT FOR

ITEM DESCRIPTION SHOW SHOW THE SHOW THE SHOW THE SHOW
BASE BID-TOWNSHIP OF BARNEGAT, BARNEGAT, NJ
11.a|BASE RATE FOR THE FIREWORKS SHOW AS SPECIFIED $ 16,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
Scheduled Show Date/Time: Saturday, July 4, 2015 @ 9:15 PM-9:30-
9:32 PM EDT; Rain Date: Sunday, July 5, 2015
11.b|RATE FOR WEATHER/RAIN DELAY POSTPONEMENT $ 4,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
TOTAL OF ITEMS 11.a & 11.b $ 20,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ _
12. CALENDAR YEAR 2016-FOURTH OF JULY FIREWORKS SHOW
12.a|BASE RATE FOR THE FIREWORKS SHOW AS SPECIFIED $ 16,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
Scheduled Show Date/Time: Monday, July 4, 2016 @ 9:15 PM-9:30-
9:32 PM EDT; Rain Date: Tuesday, July 5, 2016
12.b|RATE FOR WEATHER/RAIN DELAY POSTPONEMENT $ 4,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
TOTAL OF ITEMS 12.a & 12.b $ 20,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
TOTAL OF ALL OF THE TOWNSHIP OF BARNEGAT SHOWS-ITEMS 11.a & 12.a $ 32,000.00 NO BID $ - $ - $ _
Required Information
BID DEPOSIT: YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO
CERTIFICATE OF SURETY: YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO
RIGHT TO EXTEND-TIME FOR AWARD: YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO
PUBLIC DISCLOSURE STATE: YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT: YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO
MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY LANGUAGE: YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RECEIPT OF ADDENDA: YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO
NEW JERSEY AFFIRMATIVE ACTION COMPLIANCE NOTICE: YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO
MANUFACTURER'S AFFIDAVIT & CERTIFICATE OF ORIGIN: YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO
DISCLOSURE OF INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES IN IRAN STATEMENT-2 PART FORM: YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO
NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE (BRC) SUBMITTED: YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO
GENERAL CONTRACT INFORMATION: YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO
LIST OF REFERENCES: YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO
NUMBER OF COPIES SUBMITTED (4): Y




