CITY OF OCEAN CITY

AMERICA’'S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

PURCHASING DIVISION

SUMMARY OF BIDS DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, May 19, 2015 @ 2:00 PM, EDT
CITY CONTRACT #: 15-21
BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ PROPOSAL NAME: 2015 Back Bay Dredging
NAME, ADDRESS & Mobile Dredging & Pumping Co. Tri-State Dredging, Inc. Wickberg Marine Contracting, Inc.
BID OF EACH BIDDER 3100 Bethel Road 4300 Holmesburg Avenue 610 Main Street
Chester, PA 19013 Philadelphia, PA 19136 Belford, NJ 07718
Engineer's Estimate:
Base Bid: $972,000.00 Alex Dick, Dredging Services Manager JThomas Clauss, President & Secretary JRichard B. Wickberg, Vice President|
Alternate Bid "A": $175,000.00
Alternate Bid "B": $98,000.00
Key
Calculation Error Ph: (610) 497-9500 Ph: (215) 624-2221 Ph: (732) 471-0106
Indicates Amount in Bid Proposal Fx: (610) 497-9708 Fx: (215) 331-5870 Fx: (732) 471-1773
email: n/a email: tsdredging@msn.com email: dregeitted@aol.com
ITEM| DESCRIPTION | QTY UNIT COST | TOTAL COST UNIT COST | TOTAL COST UNIT COST | TOTAL COST UNIT COST | TOTAL COST UNIT COST | TOTAL COST
BASE BID
1[Mobilization/Demobilization 1 LS no bid $ 1,300,000.00 | $ 1,300,000.00 | $ 625,000.00 | $ 625,000.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ -
2|Soil Erosion & Sediment Control 1 LS no bid $ 75,041.60 | $ 75,041.60 | $ 3,625.00 | $ 3,625.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ -
3|Maintenance Dredging for Bay Bridge Condos 2,000 CY no bid $ 34.00 | $ 68,000.00 | $ 29.00 | $ 58,000.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ -
4|Maintenance Dredging for Snug Harbor 16,000 CY no bid $ 34.00 | $ 544,000.00 | $ 29.00 | $ 464,000.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ -
5|Maintenance Dredging for Carnival Bayou 44,200 CY no bid $ 11.752 | $ 519,438.40 | $ 29.00 | $ 1,281,800.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ -
6|Additional Maintenance Dredging to -6 MLW 10,000 CY no bid $ 11.752 | $ 117,520.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 150,000.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ -
7|Allowance for Modifications to Route 52 CDF 1 LS no bid $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ -
TOTAL AMOUNT OF BASED BID ITEMS 1-7 INCLUSIVE no bid $ 2,674,000.00 | $ 2,873,925.00 | $ 2,632,425.00 $ - $ -
ALTERNATE BID "A"
8]Excavation, Unclassified [ 7,000 CY no bid $ 53.791 | $ 376,537.00 | $ 2150 | $ 150,500.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ -
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ALTERNATE BID "A' ITEM 8 no bid $ 376,540.00 | $ 376,537.00 $ 150,500.00 $ - $ -
ALTERNATE BID "B"
9[Tipping Fee [ 7,000 cCv no bid no bid $ 13.00 [ $ 91,000.00 | $ - |3 - 13 K -
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ALTERNATE BID "B' ITEM 9 no bid no bid $ 91,500.00 | $ 91,000.00 $ - $ -
REQUIRED INFORMATION
BID DEPOSIT/BOND: YES/NO YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO
CONSENT OF SURETY: YES/NO YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO
RIGHT TO EXTEND-TIME FOR AWARD: YES/NO YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO
STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE STATEMENT: YES/NO YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT: YES/NO YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO
NJ MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY LANGUAGE: YES/NO YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO
NJ AFFIRMATIVE ACTION REGULATION COMPLIANCE NOTICE: YES/NO YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO
REQUIRED SUB-CONTRACTORS LISTING: YES/NO YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO
OTHER SUBCONTRACTORS LISTED: YES/NO YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO YES/NO
ACKNOWLEDGMENT OF RECEIPT OF ADDENDA : YES/NO YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO
DISCLOSURE OF INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES IN IRAN STATE -2 PART FORM: YES/NO YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO
NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE (BRC) SUBMITTED: YES/NO YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO
NJ BRC FOR SUBCONTRACTORS SUBMITTED: YES/NO YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO YES/NO
NJ PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION ACT CERTIFICATE: YES/NO YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO
NJ PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION ACT CERTIFICATE FOR
SUBCONTRACTORS: YES/NO YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO YES/NO
COPIES SUBMITTED (2): YES/NO YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO YES/NO




