PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS
BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

CITY OF OCEAN CITY

AMERICA'S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

DATE RECEIVED:
CITY CONTRACT #:
PROPOSAL NAME:

TUESDAY, MAY 3, 2016 @ 2:00 PM, EDT

15-42
Ocean City Dredge Material Disposal

NAME, ADDRESS &
BID OF EACH BIDDER

Cape Mining & Recycling, LLC

Mobile Dredging & Pumping Co.

P. O. Box 246

3100 Bethel Road

Cape May Court House, NJ 08210

Chester, PA 19013

KEY: Contact: Chester J. Ottinger, Jr., Member Contact: Jerry Vetter, President Contact:
Recommended for Award Phone: 609-465-5617 Phone: 610-497-9500 Phone:
Vendor Withdrew Bid Proposal Fax: 609-463-1878 JFax: 610-497-9708 Fax:
Email: pgheunjr@aol.com JEmail: jvetter@mobiledredging.com Email:
Quantity of Dredge Material Max. Daily Quantity |Unit Payment (+) or Cost (-) Total Max. Daily Quantity |Unit Payment (+) or Cost (-) Total Max. Daily Quantity |Unit Payment (+) or Cost (-) Total
0 - 25,000 c.y. 600 c.y. / day -$12.00 c.y./ day -$300,000.00 c.y. / day $ cy./day No Bid c.y. / day $ c.y. / day $
25,001 - 50,000 c.y. 600 c.y. / day -$15.00 c.y./ day -$375,000.00 c.y. / day $ cy./day No Bid c.y. / day $ c.y. / day $
50,001 - 100,000 c.y. 600 c.y. / day -$10.00 c.y./ day -$500,000.00 c.y. / day $ cy./day No Bid c.y. / day $ c.y. / day $
100,001 - 200,000 c.y. 600 c.y. / day -$10.00 c.y./ day -$1,000,000.00 300 c.y. / day $13.00 c.y. / day $2,028,000.00 c.y. / day $ c.y. / day $
200,001 - 300,000 c.y. 600 c.y. / day -$10.00 c.y./ day -$1,000,000.00 c.y. / day $ cy./day No Bid c.y. / day $ c.y. / day $
300,001 - 400,000 c.y. 600 c.y. / day -$10.00 c.y./ day -$1,000,000.00 c.y. / day $ cy./day No Bid c.y. / day $ c.y. / day $
400,001 - 500,000 c.y. 600 c.y. / day -$10.00 c.y./ day -$1,000,000.00 c.y. / day $ cy./day No Bid c.y. / day $ c.y. / day $
Location 1: 600 South RR Ave, Lower Twp, NJ
Address where bidder will receive dredge materials: Location 2: 560 Goshen Rd, Middle Twp, NJ Kinsley's Landfill, 2025 Delsea Dr., Sewell, NJ 08080
Location 1: Lower Twp, Block 410.01, Lot 99.01, 99.02
Municipality, Block & Lot where bidder will receive dredge materials: Location 2: Middle Twp, Block 94, Lot 19.01, 19.02, 20 Deptford Township, Block 387.01, Lot 55, 56, 57, 66
REQUIRED INFORMATION
Required Number of Copies (2): Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
Bid Deposit/Bond: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
Consent of Surety: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
Right to Extend - Time for Award: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
Stockholder Disclosure Statement: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
Non-Collusion Affidavit: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
Mandatory Equal Employment Opportunity Language: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
NJ Affirmative Action Regulation Complaince Notice: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
Required Subcontractors Listing: Y/N N/A Y/N N/A Y/N N/A
Acknowledge of Receipt of Addenda: Y/N Yes - None Y/N Yes - None Y/N
Disclosure of Investment Activites in Iran Statement-Two Part Form: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
NJ Business Registration Certificate (BRC): Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
NJ Business Registration Certificate for Subcontractors (BRC): Y/N N/A Y/N N/A Y/N N/A
NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate: Y/N N/A Y/N N/A Y/N N/A
NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate for Subcontractors: Y/N N/A Y/N N/A Y/N
Statement of Authority: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
W-9: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
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