
CITY OF OCEAN CITY
AMERICA’S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, February 23, 2016 @ 2:00 PM EST

PURCHASING DIVISION CITY CONTRACT #: 16-03

SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS PROPOSAL NAME: Concession Licenses for the Sale of Food, Ice Cream & Beverage

Related Products at Designated City Owned Street Ends

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

NAME, ADDRESS &

BID OF EACH BIDDER

Estimate: $18,000

Key: Withdrawn Bid Proposal
Recommended for Award

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Number of 

Licenses Bid

Amount Per 

License

Total Annual 

Lease Fee

Number of 

Licenses Bid

Amount Per 

License

Total Annual 

Lease Fee

Number of 

Licenses Bid

Amount Per 

License

Total Annual 

Lease Fee

Number of 

Licenses Bid

Amount Per 

License

Total Annual 

Lease Fee

Number of 

Licenses Bid

Amount Per 

License

Total Annual 

Lease Fee

Number of 

Licenses Bid

Amount Per 

License

Total Annual 

Lease Fee

1.0
Motor Vehicles to Vend Food Products - Limited to Four (04) Motor 

Vehicle Licenses Annually

1.1-1.4
Motor Vehicle Licenses #1-4 ($2,000.00 Minimum Bid per License 

per Year) 1 5,025.00$       5,025.00$       4 5,101.00$       20,404.00$     1 5,873.79$       5,873.79$       1 7,576.00$       7,576.00$       2 7,150.00$       14,300.00$     4 6,800.00$       27,200.00$     

TOTAL DOLLAR AMOUNT FOR ALL LICENSES BID FOR ITEM 1.0 5,025.00$       20,404.00$  5,873.79$     7,576.00$     14,300.00$  27,200.00$  

2.0
Bicycle Carts to Peddle & Vend Food Products - Limited to Ten (10) 

Bicycle Licenses Annually

2.1-2.10
Bicycle Cart Licenses #1-12 ($1,000.00 Minimum bid per License per 

Year) No Bid -$               -$               10 1,636.00$       16,360.00$     No Bid -$               -$               No Bid -$               -$               No Bid -$               -$               No Bid -$               -$               

TOTAL DOLLAR AMOUNT FOR ALL LICENSES BID FOR ITEM 2.0 -$              16,360.00$  -$              -$              -$              -$              

TOTAL DOLLAR AMOUNT FOR LICENSES BID ITEMS 1.0 & 2.0 5,025.00$     36,764.00$  5,873.79$     7,576.00$     14,300.00$  27,200.00$  
(Amount to be Paid to the City Annually by Licensee)

TOTAL NUMBER OF LICENSES BID ON OVERALL ITEMS 1.0 & 2.0 1 14 1 1 2 4

TOTAL NUMBER OF LICENSES TO BE AWARDED: 0 10 0 1 Amount Due 6,818.00$       2 Amount Due $12,870.00 1 Amount Due $4,080.00

Required Information

BID DEPOSIT/BOND: YES/NO YES $503.00 YES/NO YES $3,676.40 YES/NO YES $600.00 YES/NO YES $758.00 YES/NO YES $1,430.00 YES/NO YES $2,720.00

CONSENT OF SURETY: YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A

RIGHT TO EXTEND-TIME FOR AWARD: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES

 PUBLIC DISCLOSURE STATEMENT: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES

NON-COLLISION AFFIDAVIT: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES

MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY LANGUAGE: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES

NJ AFFIRMATIVE ACTION REGULATION COMPLIANCE NOTICE: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES

REQUIRED SUBCONTRACTORS LISTING: YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A

ACKNOWLEDGMENT OF RECEIPT OF ADDENDA: YES/NO YES NONE ISSUED YES/NO YES NONE ISSUED YES/NO YES NONE ISSUED YES/NO YES NONE ISSUED YES/NO YES NONE ISSUED YES/NO YES NONE ISSUED

DISCLOSURE OF INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES IN IRAN STATEMENT-2 PART FORM: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES

STATEMENT OF AUTHORITY: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES

REQUIRED CONTRACTUAL INFORMATION: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES

W-9: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES

NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE (BRC): YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES

NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE SUBCONTRACTORS (BRC): YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A

NJ PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION ACT CERTIFICATE: YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A

NJ PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION ACT CERTIFICATE FOR

SUBCONTRACTORS: YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A

REQUIRED NUMBER OF COPIES (3): YES/NO YES 3 YES/NO YES 3 YES/NO YES 3 YES/NO YES 3 YES/NO YES 3 YES/NO YES 3

Website: none listed

Contact: Denitsa Spasova

Phone: 609-980-2840

Email: ikesfcc@gmail.com
Website: none listed

Contact: Romane McKenzie

Phone: 202-751-5494

Email: spasov.rossen@gmail.com

Phone: 609-778-7676

dba Ike's Famous Crabcakes

Phone: 347-782-4658

Email: romanemckenzie@yahoo.com

Phone: 609-377-9419

Email: jimbo86@comcast.netEmail: dfarhinman@yahoo.com

Contact: Frank Palmieri

Densita Spasova

dba Teniko, LLC

2840 South Meade Street

Arlington, VA 22206

Romane McKenzie

dba Cool Out, LLC

25 Clifton Avenue, Apt D306

Newark, NJ 07104

P. W. Entertainment

P. O. Box 1752

Voorhees, NJ 08043

Website: none listed

James Callista 

dba Amazon Jim

P. O. Box 672

Somers Point, NJ 08244

Contact: Jim Callista

Bustard Custard, LLC

721 Galleria Drive

Williamstown, NJ 08094

Contact: Diane Hinman

Website: none listed

Contact: Kelly Blum

Phone: 609-665-5866

Email: kblum@kona-ice.com
Website: none listed

Blum Family, LLC

dba Kona Ice Cape May

312 45th Place

Sea Isle City, NJ 08243


