
CITY OF OCEAN CITY
AMERICA’S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

OCEAN CITY COOPERATIVE PRICING SYSTEM 251COCCPS DATE RECEIVED: Thursday, Febuary 18, 2015 @ 2:00 PM, EST

PURCHASING DIVISION 251COCCPS CONTRACT #: 16-14

SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS PROPOSAL NAME: Supply & Delivery of Sand Fence & Post & Wooden Posts & Rail Fence Materials

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

NAME, ADDRESS AND

BID OF EACH BIDDER

KEY

Recommendation to Award as per 40A:11-18 -

American goods & products to be utilized when & where available.

Non-American Made Product

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY Unit Price

2/1/16 - 

6/30/16 Unit Price

2/1/16 - 

6/30/16 Unit Price

2/1/16 - 

6/30/16 Unit Price

2/1/16 - 

6/30/16

1 SAND FENCE

Supply & Delivery of Sand Fence

City of Ocean City 0- 360 Rolls $58.00 $35.40 $42.40 $39.95

Borough of Avalon 0- 300 Rolls $58.00 $35.40 $42.40 $39.95

City of Sea Isle City 0- 0 Rolls N/A N/A N/A N/A

Township of Upper 0- 0 Rolls N/A N/A N/A N/A

Certificate of Origin

2 WOODEN POST FOR SAND FENCE

Supply & Delivery of Seven (7') Foot Wooden Post

City of Ocean City 0- 1,800 Each $11.00 NO BID $6.58 $6.95

Borough of Avalon 0- 1,500 Each $11.00 NO BID $6.58 $6.95

City of Sea Isle City 0- 0 Each N/A NO BID N/A N/A

Township of Upper 0- 200 Each $23.00 NO BID $6.58 NO BID

Certificate of Origin

3 RAILS FOR POST & RAIL FENCE

Supply & Delivery of Rails

City of Ocean City 0- 150 Rails $28.00 NO BID $7.48 $9.80

Borough of Avalon 0- 2,300 Rails $13.00 NO BID $7.48 $9.80

City of Sea Isle City 0- 0 Rails N/A NO BID N/A N/A

Township of Upper 0- 800 Rails $15.00 NO BID $7.48 $9.80

Certificate of Origin

Phone: 609-965-6400

Fax: 609-965-6403

gcacent@aol.com

Chemung Supply Corp.

P. O. Box 527

Elmira, NY 14902

Accent Fence Inc.

P. O. Box 656

Egg Harbor, NJ 08215

Phone: 607-733-5506

Fax: 607-732-5379

cperine@chemungsupply.com

Lumbermen Associates, Inc.

P. O. Box 720

Bristol, PA 19007

Barbato Nursery Corp.

1600 Railroad Avenue

Holbrook, NY 11741

Phone: 631-285-6767

Fax: 631-285-6748

barbatolandscape@aol.com

2101 Hunter Road

Phone: 215-785-4600

Fax: 215-785-5645

tomc@lumbermenassoc.com

mailto:gcacent@aol.com
mailto:cperine@chemungsupply.com
mailto:barbatolandscape@aol.com
mailto:tomc@lumbermenassoc.com


OCEAN CITY COOPERATIVE PRICING SYSTEM 251COCCPS DATE RECEIVED: Thursday, Febuary 18, 2015 @ 2:00 PM, EST

PURCHASING DIVISION 251COCCPS CONTRACT #: 16-14

SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS PROPOSAL NAME: Supply & Delivery of Sand Fence & Post & Wooden Posts & Rail Fence Materials

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

NAME, ADDRESS AND

BID OF EACH BIDDER

KEY

Recommendation to Award as per 40A:11-18 -

American goods & products to be utilized when & where available.

Non-American Made Product

Phone: 609-965-6400

Fax: 609-965-6403

gcacent@aol.com

Chemung Supply Corp.

P. O. Box 527

Elmira, NY 14902

Accent Fence Inc.

P. O. Box 656

Egg Harbor, NJ 08215

Phone: 607-733-5506

Fax: 607-732-5379

cperine@chemungsupply.com

Lumbermen Associates, Inc.

P. O. Box 720

Bristol, PA 19007

Barbato Nursery Corp.

1600 Railroad Avenue

Holbrook, NY 11741

Phone: 631-285-6767

Fax: 631-285-6748

barbatolandscape@aol.com

2101 Hunter Road

Phone: 215-785-4600

Fax: 215-785-5645

tomc@lumbermenassoc.com

4 WOODEN POST FOR POST & RAIL FENCE

Supply & Delivery of Wooden Post

City of Ocean City 0- 300 Posts $27.00 NO BID $10.78 $12.95

Borough of Avalon 0- 1,150 Posts $21.00 NO BID $10.78 $12.95

City of Sea Isle City 0- 0 Posts N/A NO BID N/A N/A

Township of Upper 0- 200 Posts $27.00 NO BID $10.78 $13.95

Certificate of Origin

Required Information

BID DEPOSIT/BOND: YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A

CONSENT OF SURETY: YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A

RIGHT TO EXTEND-TIME FOR AWARD: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES

 PUBLIC DISCLOSURE STATEMENT: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES

NON-COLLISION AFFIDAVIT: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES

MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY LANGUAGE: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES

NJ AFFIRMATIVE ACTION REGULATION COMPLIANCE NOTICE: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES

REQUIRED SUBCONTRACTORS LISTING: YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A

ACKNOWLEDGMENT OF RECEIPT OF ADDENDA: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES

DISCLOSURE OF INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES IN IRAN STATEMENT-2 PART FORM: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES

OTHER SUBCONTRACTORS INDICATED: YES/NO NO YES/NO NO YES/NO NO YES/NO NO

NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE (BRC): YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES

NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE SUBCONTRACTORS (BRC): YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A

NJ PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION ACT CERTIFICATE: YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES

NJ PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION ACT CERTIFICATE FOR

SUB CONTRACTORS: YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A

REQUIRED NUMBER OF COPIES (3): YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES YES/NO YES
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