
CITY OF OCEAN CITY
AMERICA’S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, April 5, 2016 @ 2:00 PM, EDT
SUMMARY OF BIDS CITY CONTRACT NO: 16-20

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ CONTRACT NAME: SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF LUMBER AND PILING

NAME, ADDRESS AND
BID OF EACH BIDDER

KEY
Calculation Error
Recommended for Award

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST

GROUP A - 5/4" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE 
1 5/4" x 6" x 10', Southern Yellow Pine, Grade #2 0- 500 PCS 4.95$                           2,475.00$                     14.31$                         7,155.00$                     5.62$                           2,810.00$                     
2 5/4" x 6" x 8', Southern Yellow Pine, Premium 0- 1,440 PCS 5.65$                           8,136.00$                     10.50$                         15,120.00$                   4.45$                           6,408.00$                     
3 5/4" x 6" x 12', Southern Yellow Pine, Premium 0- 0 PCS N/A N/A N/A

GROUP A TOTAL AMOUNT 10,611.00$                 22,275.00$                 9,218.00$                   
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP A 2 2 2 2

GROUP B - 1" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE
NOT REQUIRED AT THIS TIME

GROUP B TOTAL AMOUNT N/A N/A N/A
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP B 0

GROUP C - 2" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE 
1 2" x 4" x 16', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 0 PCS N/A N/A N/A
2 2" x 6" x 10', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 0 PCS N/A N/A N/A
3 2" x 6" x 12', Southern Yellow Pine 128- 2,000 PCS 8.95$                           17,900.00$                   12.86$                         25,720.00$                   
4 2" x 6" x 16', Southern Yellow Pine 128- 2,000 PCS 11.95$                         23,900.00$                   17.11$                         34,220.00$                   
5 2" x 6" x 20', Southern Yellow Pine 128- 2,000 PCS 18.40$                         36,800.00$                   28.90$                         57,800.00$                   
6 2" x 10" x 12', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 1,000 PCS 12.85$                         12,850.00$                   21.68$                         21,680.00$                   14.64$                         14,640.00$                   
7 2" x 10" x 14', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 250 PCS 15.50$                         3,875.00$                     24.19$                         6,047.50$                     16.80$                         4,200.00$                     

GROUP C  TOTAL AMOUNT 95,325.00$                 145,467.50$               18,840.00$                 
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP C 5 5 5 2

GROUP D - 3" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE 
1 3" x 4" x 10', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 0 PCS N/A N/A N/A
2 3" x 4" x 12', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 500 PCS 14.55$                         7,275.00$                     
3 3" x 6" x 12', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 20,000 PCS 21.95$                         439,000.00$                 23.25$                         465,000.00$                 
4 3" x 10" x 12', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 4,000 PCS 27.90$                         111,600.00$                 41.75$                         167,000.00$                 35.10$                         140,400.00$                 
5 3" x 10" x 14', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 200 PCS 32.55$                         6,510.00$                     48.71$                         9,742.00$                     43.87$                         8,774.00$                     
6 3" x 12" x 20', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 50 PCS 34.50$                         1,725.00$                     56.10$                         2,805.00$                     42.98$                         2,149.00$                     
7 3" x 12" x 16', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 25 PCS 46.50$                         1,162.50$                     82.00$                         2,050.00$                     57.31$                         1,432.75$                     
8 3" x 12" x 20', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 25 PCS 64.60$                         1,615.00$                     129.00$                       3,225.00$                     91.80$                         2,295.00$                     
9 3" x 12" x 24', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 25 PCS 85.95$                         2,148.75$                     177.00$                       4,425.00$                     129.60$                       3,240.00$                     

GROUP D TOTAL AMOUNT 571,036.25$               654,247.00$               158,290.75$               
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP D 8 8 7 6

GROUP E - 4" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE
NOT REQUIRED AT THIS TIME

GROUP E TOTAL AMOUNT N/A N/A N/A
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP E 0

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
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GROUP F – 6 " SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE 
NOT REQUIRED AT THIS TIME

GROUP F TOTAL AMOUNT N/A N/A N/A
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP F 0

GROUP G - 2 7/8" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE 
NOT REQUIRED AT THIS TIME

GROUP G TOTAL AMOUNT N/A N/A N/A
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP G 0

GROUP H - FIR PLYWOOD
1 1/2" x 4' x 8', AC Fir Plywood 0- 200 PCS 52.80$                         10,560.00$                   33.37$                         6,674.00$                     
2 3/4" x 4' x 8', AC Fir Plywood 0- 200 PCS 69.45$                         13,890.00$                   41.08$                         8,216.00$                     
3 3/4" x 4' x 8', CDX Fir Plywood 0- 200 PCS 37.37$                         7,474.00$                     26.31$                         5,262.00$                     
4 1/2" x 4' x 8', CDX, 4 ply, Fir Sheathing Plywood 0- 300 PCS 30.88                           9,264.00$                     16.93                           5,079.00$                     

GROUP H TOTAL AMOUNT -$                            41,188.00$                 25,231.00$                 
TOTAL ITEMS BID IN GROUP H 4 0 4 4

GROUP I - PILING
1 35' Piling, 12" Butt, 8" Tip, 2.5 CCA 0- 400 PCS 336.90$                       134,760.00$                 316.80$                       126,720.00$                 
2 35' Piling, 16" Butt, 8" Tip, 2.5 CCA 0- 400 PCS 654.90$                       261,960.00$                 585.20$                       234,080.00$                 

GROUP I TOTAL AMOUNT 396,720.00$               -$                            360,800.00$               
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP I 2 2 0 2

GROUP J -  WHITE PINE - VARIOUS SIZES 
NOT REQUIRED AT THIS TIME

GROUP J TOTAL AMOUNT N/A N/A N/A
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP J 0

GROUP K-  HEM/FIR-VARIOUS SIZES
NOT REQUIRED AT THIS TIME

GROUP K TOTAL AMOUNT N/A N/A N/A
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP K 0

GROUP L - MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS
1 1/4" x 4' x 8', Luan Underlayment 0- 100 PCS 15.87$                         1,587.00$                     11.69$                         1,169.00$                     
2 5/4" x 4" x 18', Perma Trim in White 0- 0 PCS N/A N/A N/A

GROUP L TOTAL AMOUNT -$                            1,587.00$                   1,169.00$                   
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP L 1 0 1 1

TOTAL DOLLAR AMOUNT BID IN ALL GROUPS OF 
THE BASE BID-GROUPS A-L 1,073,692.25$           864,764.50$               573,548.75$               

TOTAL NUMBER OF ALL ITEMS BID A-L 22
13 $666,361.25 0 9 396,418.00$               

Required Information
Bid Deposit/Bond: Y/N N/A Y/N N/A Y/N N/A
Consent of Surety: Y/N N/A Y/N N/A Y/N N/A

Right to Extend - Time for Award: Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N YES
Stockholder Disclosure Statement: Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N YES

Non-Collusion Affidavit: Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N YES
Mandatory Equal Employment Opportunity Language: Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N YES
NJ Affirmative Action Regulation Complaince  Notice: Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N YES

Required Subcontractors Listing: Y/N N/A Y/N N/A Y/N N/A
Acknowledge of Receipt of Addenda: Y/N YES - NONE Y/N NO - NONE Y/N YES - NONE

Disclosure of Investment Activites in Iran Statement-Two Part Form: Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N YES
Statement of Authority: Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N YES

Manufacturer's Affidavit & Certificate of Origin Y/N YES Y/N NO Y/N YES
W-9: Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N YES

NJ Business Registration Certificate (BRC): Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N YES
NJ Business Registration Certificate for Subcontractors (BRC): Y/N N/A Y/N N/A Y/N N/A

NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate: Y/N N/A Y/N N/A Y/N N/A
NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate for Subcontractors: Y/N N/A Y/N N/A Y/N N/A

Required Number of Copies (2): Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N YES

NO BID
NO BID

TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS AWARDED FOR A TOTAL AMOUNT OF:

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
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