PURCHASING DIVISION

SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

CITY OF OCEAN CITY

AMERICA'S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, January 31, 2017 @ 2:00 PM, EDT
CITY CONTRACT #: 16-45
PROPOSAL NAME: Ocean City Drainage Improvements

NAME, ADDRESS & A.E. Stone, inc. Agate Construction Co., Inc. Charles Marandino, LLC Lexa Concrete, LLC Mathis Construction Co., Inc. Mount Construction Co., Inc. Pillari Bros. Construction Corp. Richard E. Pierson Construction Co. Inc. South State, Inc. Vollers Excavating & Construction, Inc.
BID OF EACH BIDDER 1435 Doughty Road 1030 Route 83 PO Box 20, 233 Main Ave 11 Commerce Way Drive 1510 Route 539, Suite 1 427 S. White Horse Pike 65 Squankum Yellowbrook Road 426 Swedeshoro Road P. 0. Box 68 3311 US Highway 22 East, P. O. Box 5297
Egg Harbor Township, NJ 08234 Clermont, NJ 08210 Milmax, NJ 08340 Hammonton, NJ 08037 Little Egg Harbor, NJ 08087 Berlin, NJ 08009 Farmingdale, NJ 07727 Pilesgrove, NJ 08098 Bridgeton, NJ 08302 North Branch, NJ 08876
Key: Apparent Low Bidder Steven C. Kurtz James E. Johnson, I11 Charles Marandino Alex O. Gherardi Christopher D. Mathis, President _jchael Mazzarella, V.P. of Business Developmer Michael Pillari, Vice President Robert L. Baccala, Vice President Chester J. Ottinger, Jr., President Benjamin J. Scott, CEO
Calculation Error P: 609-641-2781 P: 609-624-4909 P: 856-691-9963 P: 609-704-5293 P: 609-296-3728 P: 856-768-8493 P: 732-938-4550 P: 856-769-8244 P: 856-451-5300 P: 908-725-1026
Fatal Defect F: 609-641-0374 F: 609-624-0957 F: 856-691-5195 F: 609-704-5355 F: 609-296-2513 F: 856-753-1453 F: 732-938-3198 F: 856-7 F: 856-455-3461 F: 908-725-9784
skurtz@aestone.com estim; agateconstru net cmllc@comcast.net lexaconcrete@aol.com m. mathisconst.com mmazzarella@mountconstruction.com m| ros.com fo@repierson.com bbryan@southstateinc.com bscott@vollers.cc
ITEMI DESCRIPTION I QTY I UNIT UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
BASE BID
1 |CONSTRUCTION LAYOUT MOBILIZATION 1 DOLLAR $25,000.00 $25,000.00f $200,000.00) $200,000.00) $150,000.00) $150,000.00) $50,000.00 $50,000.00f $125,000.00) $125,000.00} $50,000.00 $50,000.00) $62,100.00 $62,100.00f $50,000.00 $50,000.00f $50,000.00 sso,ooo.ool $115,000.00) $115,000.00)
2 |MOBILIZATION 1 LS. $587,804.60| $587,804.60) $982,300.00| $982,300.00) $149,000.00| $149,000.00} $100,000.00| $100,000.00} $200,000.00) $400,000.00} $621,000.00) $621,000.00 $130,000.00| $130,000.00) $550,000.00| $550,000.00) $400,000.00| $400,000.00) $360,400.00| $360,400.00)
3 |SOIL EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL 1 LS. $5,000.00| $5,000.00) $400,000.00| $400,000.00) $100,000.00| $100,000.00) $10,000.00 $10,000.00f $150,000.00) $450,000.00) $40,000.00 $40,000.00] $88,100.00 $88,100.00f $20,000.00 $20,000.00f $20,000.00 $20,000.00] $130,600.00) $130,600.00)
4 |INLET, TYPEA 112 u $2,000.00 $224,000.00) $2,590.00) $290,080.00) $3,500.00) $392,000.00} $3,400.00) $380,800.00} $3,516.00) $14,064.00) $2,800.00) $313,600.00} $1,950.00) $218,400.00) $2,700.00) $302,400.00) $2,600.00) $291,200.00} $3,250.00) $364,000.00}
5 |SET INLET TYPE A, CASTING 8 U $500.00 $4,000.00) $775.00 $6,200.00) $350.00 $2,800.00) $600.00 $4,800.00) $2,083.00 $10,415.00f $750.00 $6,000.00) $550.00 $4,400.00) $525.00 $4,200.00) $1,300.00) $10,400.00f $1,080.00) $8,640.00)
6 |MANHOLE, 4 DIAMETER 1 [V $3,500.00) $3,500.00) $4,975.00 $4,975.00) $4,500.00) $4,500.00) $4,500.00 $4,500.00} $4,222.00 $25,332.00) $4,000.00 $4,000.00} $3,770.00) $3,770.00 $5,300.00) $5,300.00) $4,000.00 $4,000.00) $4,220.00 $4,220.00}
7 |MANHOLE, 5 DIAMETER 24 u $4,100.00| $98,400.00f $3,995.00) $95,880.00f $5,500.00 $132,000.00] $5,500.00) $132,000.00] $5,090.00) $35,630.00] $4,700.00) $112,800.00} $3,010.00 $72,240.00f $6,400.00) $153,600.00) $5,300.00) $127,200.00) $4,730.00) $113,520.00]
8 |MANHOLE, 6' DIAMETER 16 u $6,500.00) $104,000.00) $6,145.00) $98,320.00| $7,500.00) $120,000.00} $7,500.00) $120,000.00} $7,724.00 $61,792.00) $11,000.00 $176,000.00} $5,180.00) $82,880.00| $6,300.00) $100,800.00) $8,400.00) $134,400.00} $5,925.00) $94,800.00)
9 |MANHOLE, 8 DIAMETER 8 u $12,000.00 $96,000.00) $8,745.00) $69,960.00) $15,000.00 $120,000.00 $15,000.00 $120,000.00 $13,090.00 $117,810.00) $24,000.00 $192,000.00) $10,700.00 $85,600.00) $10,500.00 $84,000.00) $18,600.00 $148,800.00) $10,250.00 $82,000.00)
10 _[DIVERSION MANHOLE 2 [V $9,000.00| $18,000.00| $12,630.00 $25,260.00] $10,000.00 $20,000.00) $10,000.00 $20,000.00) $12,260.00 $122,600.00| $20,000.00 $40,000.00) $8,160.00) $16,320.00| $13,000.00 $26,000.00] $11,700.00 $23,400.00) $8,255.00) $16,510.00)
11 [SET MANHOLE CASTING 4 U $500.00 $2,000.00} $670.00 $2,680.00) $700.00 $2,800.00) $1,000.00) $4,000.00] $1,250.00) $13,750.00f $350.00 $1,400.00) $520.00 $2,080.00} $400.00 $1,600.00) $1,100.00| $4,400.00) $560.00 $2,240.00)
12 |RECONSTRUCTED MANHOLE, USING EXISTING CASTING 3 U $3,000.00| $9,000.00) $1,275.00 $3,825.00) $1,550.00) $4,650.00) $1,500.00) $4,500.00} $2,639.00) $31,668.00) $600.00 $1,800.00} $1,460.00) $4,380.00 $1,900.00) $5,700.00) $1,600.00) $4,800.00) $900.00 $2,700.00}
13 [12° DUCTILE IRON PIPE 2,356 LF. $135.00 $318,060.00) $158.00 $372,248.00) $145.00 $341,620.00) $150.00 $353,400.00) $225.00 $2,925.00) $115.00 $270,940.00) $96.50) $227,354.00) $150.00 $353,400.00) $150.00 $353,400.00) $110.00 $259,160.00)
14 _|16° DUCTILE IRON PIPE 3411 LF. $120.00 $409,320.00) $153.00 $521,883.00) $175.00 $596,925.00) $180.00 $613,980.00) $250.00 $3,500.00) $135.00 $460,485.00) $135.00 $460,485.00) $120.00 $409,320.00) $120.00 $409,320.00) $122.00 $416,142.00)
15 _[24" DUCTILE IRON PIPE 3,853 LF. $170.00 $655,010.00) $176.00 $678,128.00) $190.00 $732,070.00) $195.00 $751,335.00) $281.00 $4,215.00) $165.00 $635,745.00} $162.00 $624,186.00 $200.00 $770,600.00) $165.00 $635,745.00) $165.00 $635,745.00)
16 _|15" HIGH DENSITY POLYETHYLENE PIPE 1,342 LF. $120.00 $161,040.00) $165.00 $221,430.00) $155.00 $208,010.00) $150.00 $201,300.00) $214.00 $3,424.00) $95.00) $127,490.00) $100.00 $134,200.00) $115.00 $154,330.00) $86.00) $115,412.00) $105.00 $140,910.00)
17 _[30" HIGH DENSITY POLYETHYLENE PIPE 1,644 LF. $140.00 $230,160.00) $172.00 $282,768.00) $240.00 $394,560.00) $240.00 $394,560.00) $253.00 $4,301.00) $135.00 $221,940.00} $140.00 $230,160.00 $145.00 $238,380.00) $118.00 $193,992.00) $131.00 $215,364.00)
18 [36" HIGH DENSITY POLYETHYLENE PIPE 890 LF. $145.00 $129,050.00) $228.00 $202,920.00) $275.00 $244,750.00) $270.00 $240,300.00) $257.00 $4,626.00) $190.00 $169,100.00) $180.00 $160,200.00) $175.00 $155,750.00) $124.00 $110,360.00) $154.00 $137,060.00)
19 [48" HIGH DENSITY POLYETHYLENE PIPE 218 LF. $165.00 $35,970.00) $267.00 $58,206.00f $350.00 $76,300.00f $350.00 $76,300.00f $373.00 $7,087.00) $250.00 $54,500.00f $260.00 $56,680.00) $300.00 $65,400.00) $200.00 $43,600.00f $220.00 $47,960.00|
20 _|16" TIDE CONTROL CHECK VALVE,SLIP ON 2 U $8,500.00| $17,000.00f $5,680.00) $11,360.00f $7,000.00) $14,000.00] $7,000.00) $14,000.00] $7,055.00) $141,100.00) $11,000.00 $22,000.00) $9,240.00) $18,480.00f $7,400.00 $14,800.00f $9,400.00) $18,800.00f $7,950.00) $15,900.00f
21 _[24" TIDE CONTROL CHECK VALVE,SLIP ON 1 [V $15,000.00 $15,000.00f $11,365.00 $11,365.00] $14,000.00 $14,000.00) $14,000.00 $14,m| $13,310.00 $279,510.00| $13,000.00 $13,000.00) $13,000.00 $13,000.00f $14,000.00 $14,000.00f $17,000.00 $17,000.00) $13,400.00 $13,400,00|
22 _|30" TIDE CONTROL CHECK VALVE,SLIP ON 2 U $17,000.00 $34,000.00f $13,320.00 $26,640.00f $17,500.00 $35,000.00] $17,500.00 szs,ooo.ool $16,845.00 $370,590.00) $15,000.00 $30,000.00) $18,500.00 $37,000.00f $24,000.00 $48,000.00f $19,700.00 $39,400.00f $15,300.00 $30,600.00]
23 _[36" TIDE CONTROL CHECK VALVE, SLIP ON 1 [V $24,000.00 $24,000.00| $19,365.00 $19,365.00f $23,000.00 $23,000.00) $23,000.00 $23,000.00) $22,115.00 $508,645.00} $21,000.00 $21,000.00) $22,300.00 $22,300.00f $32,000.00 $32,000.00] $28,000.00 $28,000.00) $21,125.00 $21,125.00)
24 _|RE-CONSTRUCTED INLET, TYPE E2, USING EXISTING CASTING 1 u $3,000.00| $3,000.00) $865.00 $865.00f $1,500.00) $1,500.00) $1,500.00) $1,500.00] $2,250.00) $54,000.00] $1,400.00) $1,400.00) $392.00 $392.00) $1,900.00) $1,900.00) $1,600.00) $1,600.00) $1,150.00) $1,150.00)
25 |RIPRAP STONE CHANNEL PROTECTION, 12" THICK (D50=6") 14 S.Y. $60.00| $840.00 $250.00 $3,500.00) $100.00 $1,400.00) $100.00 $1,400.00) $115.00 $2,875.00) $550.00 $7,700.00) $88.00| $1,232.00) $55.00) $770.00) $125.00 $1,750.00) $143.00 $2,002.00)
26-1 |STORMWATER PUMP STATION 1 1 U $250,000.00| $250,000.00) $450,000.00| $450,000.00) $405,000.00| $405,000.00) $430,000.00) $430,000.00) $334,850.00) $334,850.00) $300,000.00) $300,000.00) $225,500.00| $225,500.00) $215,000.00) $215,000.00) $300,000.00) $300,000.00) $246,050.00) $246,050.00)
26-2 |STORMWATER PUMP STATION 2 1 [V $250,000.00| $250,000.00) $550,000.00| $550,000.00) $405,000.00| $405,000.00) $430,000.00| $430,000.00) $309,000.00| $309,000.00) $260,000.00| $260,000.00 $210,000.00| $210,000.00) $215,000.00| $215,000.00} $300,000.00| $300,000.00} $220,000.00) $220,000.00}
26-3 |STORMWATER PUMP STATION 3 1 U $250,000.00| $250,000.00) $400,000.00| $400,000.00) $405,000.00| $405,000.00) $430,000.00| $430,000.00) $334,850.00) $334,850.00) $300,000.00) $300,000.00) $225,500.00) $225,500.00) $215,000.00) $215,000.00) $300,000.00) $300,000.00) $246,050.00) $246,050.00)
26-4_|STORMWATER PUMP STATION 4 1 u $250,000.00) $250,000.00) $400,000.00) $400,000.00) $405,000.00) $405,000.00) $430,000.00) $430,000.00) $309,000.00) $309,000.00) $260,000.00) $260,000.00) $205,000.00) $205,000.00) $215,000.00) $215,000.00) $300,000.00) $300,000.00) $220,000.00) $220,000.00)
27 _|cLEAN OUT 7 U $8,500.00| $59,500.00f $7,365.00 $51,555.00f $5,500.00) $38,500.00f $5,000.00 $35,000.00) $9,700.00) $261,900.00) $7,500.00) $52,500.00) $8,680.00) $60,760.00f $4,000.00 $28,000.00f $8,400.00) $58,800.00f $6,600.00) $46,200.00|
28 |RESET MANHOLE, SANITARY SEWER, USING EXISTING CASTING 35 u $500.00 $17,500.00) $656.00 $22,960.00f $500.00 $17,500.00f $400.00 $14,000.00f $781.00 $21,868.00f $375.00 $13,125.00f $872.00 $30,520.00f $450.00 $15,750.00f $430.00 $15,050.00f $810.00 $28,350.00f
29 |HMAMILLING, 3" OR LESS 52,520 SY. $1.00 $52,520.00) $1.50 $78,780.00) $1.50 $78,780.00| $2.40 $126,048.00) $1.80 $52.20) $3.50 $183,820.00) $2.05 $107,666.00) $1.00 $52,520.00) $2.20 $115,544.00) $4.10 $215,332.00)
30 |HOT MIX ASPHALT 9.5 M 64 SURFACE COURSE 5,887 TON $100.00 $588,700.00) $71.90) $423,275.30) $72.00) $423,864.00) $68.00) $400,316.00) $85.00) $2,550.00) $75.00) $441,525.00) $85.00) $500,395.00) $80.00| $470,960.00) $72.00| $423,864.00) $89.00| $523,943.00)
31 [8"X 18" CONCRETE VERTICAL CURB 6,205 LF. $22.00| $138,490.00) $35.00) $220,325.00) $32.00| $201,440.00) $36.00) $226,620.00) $34.00| $1,054.00) $30.00| $188,850.00) $26.50] $166,817.50} $35.00) $220,325.00) $22.00| $138,490.00) $39.00| $245,505.00)
32 |CONCRETE GUTTER, 8" THICK X 18" WIDE 19,684 LF. $20.00| $393,680.00) $24.00| $472,416.00) $24.00| $472,416.00) $27.00) $531,468.00) $23.00) $736.00f $40.00) $787,360.00) $21.00) $413,364.00) $26.00) $511,784.00) $23.00) $452,732.00) $24.00| $472,416.00)
33 |CONCRETE SIDEWALK, 4" THICK 1,429 SY. $55.00| $78,595.00) $63.00| $90,027.00) $100.00 $142,900.00) $80.00| $114,320.00) $116.00 $3,828.00) $135.00 $192,915.00) $78.50) $112,176.50} $60.00] $85,740.00| $55.00) $78,595.00] $94.00| $134,326.00}
34 |DETECTABLE WARNING SURFACE 126 SY. $225.00 $28,350.00) $200.00 $25,200.00) $450.00 $56,700.00) $260.00 $32,760.00) $324.00 $11,016.00) $275.00 $34,650.00) $190.00 $23,940.00) $130.00 $16,380.00) $225.00 $28,350.00) $410.00 $51,660.00)
35 | TRAFFIC MARKINGS, LINES, LONG LIFE, THERMOPLASTIC 21,884 LF. $0.60 $13,130.40| $0.60 $13,130.40| $0.65 $14,224.60| $0.65 $14,224.60) $0.75 $26.25| $0.65 $14,224.60) $0.68 $14,881.12] $0.60 $13,130.40) $0.63 $13,786.92) $0.75 $16,413.00|
36 |TRAFFIC MARKINGS, SYMBOLS, LONG LIFE, THERMOPLASTIC 1,432 SY. $5.00 $7,160.00) $5.50 $7,876.00) $6.00 $8,592.00) $6.00 $8,592.00) $6.50 $234, ool $6.00 $8,592.00) $6.15 $8,806.80) $5.50 $7,876.00} $9.50 $13,604.00) $6.25 $8,950.00)
37 _|HDPE CONNECTION 6 [V $800.00 $4,800.00) $3,265.00) $19,590.00f $600.00 $3,600.00) $600.00 $3,600.00} $427.00 $15,799.00) $1,300.00) $7,800.00} $184.00 $1,104.00} $500.00 $3,000.00) $1,200.00| $7,200.00) $1,635.00) $9,810.00)
38 |12" HIGH DENSITY POLYETHYLENE PIPE 23 LF. $120.00 $2,760.00) $135.00 $3,105.00) $115.00 $2,645.00) $100.00 $2,300.00) $163.00 $6,194.00) $135.00 $3,105.00) $119.00 $2,737.00) $35.00) $805.00 $150.00 $3,450.00) $45.50) $1,046.50)
39 [HOT MIX ASPHALT 9.5 M 64 BASE COURSE, 35" THICK 469 TON $120.00 $56,280.00) $110.00 $51,590.00f $72.00) $33,768.00| $75.00) $35,175.00] $103.00 $4,017.00) $85.00| $39,865.00f $85.00| $39,865.00) $90.00| $42,210.00) $85.00) $39,865.00] $92.00| $43,148.00|
40 _|DENSE-GRADED AGGREGATE BASE COURSE, 6" THICK 2,043 SY. $7.00 $14,301.00) $20.00| $40,860.00) $12.00| $24,516.00f $12.00| $24,516.00] $25.00) $1,000.00) $11.00| $22,473.00] $8.50 $17,365.50] $15.00) $30,645.00) $13.00) $26,559.00] $11.00| $22,473.00]
41 _|CONCRETE DRIVEWAY, 6" THICK 600 SY. $60.00) $36,000.00) $81.00| $48,600.00| $1.00 $600.00f $80.00| $48,000.00f $42.00| $1,722.00) $80.00| $48,000.00f $90.00| $54,000.00] $90.00| $54,000.00) $60.00| $36,000.00] $79.00| $47,400.00|
42__|UTILITY CONFLICTS (NO BID) 20 u $2,000.00) $40,000.00f $2,000.00) $40,000.00f $2,000.00) $40,000.00f $2,000.00) $40,000.00f $2,000.00) $84,000.00] $2,000.00) $40,000.00) $2,000.00) $40,000.00f $2,000.00) $40,000.00f $2,000.00) $40,000.00f $2,000.00) $40,000.00f
43 | TRAFFIC CONTROL 1 LS. $15,000.00 $15,000.00f $841,000.00| $841,000.00) $83,000.00 $83,000.00) $15,000.00 $15,m| $64,000.00 $2,752,000.00) $15,000.00 $15,000.00) $35,000.00 $35,000.00] $15,000.00 $15,000.00] $20,000.00 $20,000.00) $46,500.00 $46,m|
44 |PIPE PLUG 10 cy $500.00 $5,000.00) $228.00 $2,280.00) $180.00 $1,800.00) $180.00 $1,800.00] $950.00 $41,800.00f $900.00 $9,000.00) $439.00 $4,390.00) $880.00 $8,800.00) $600.00 $6,000.00) $645.00 6,450.00
45 _|RESET FIRE HYDRANT 5 U $3,500.00) $17,500.00f $1,475.00 $7,375.00) $1,500.00) $7,500.00) $1,500.00) 7,500.00] $2,070.00) $93,150.00f $3,500.00) $17,500.00f $1,400.00) $7,000.00 $2,400.00) $12,000.00) $1,600.00) $8,000.00) $2,050.00) $10,250.00]
46 24" STEEL CASING 233 LF. $750.00 $174,750.00) $716.00 $166,828.00) $1,200.00) $279,600.00) $1,200.00) $279,600.00) $903.00 $41,538.00f $500.00 $116,500.00} $875.00 $203,875.00 $600.00 $139,800.00) $600.00 $139,800.00) $640.00 $149,120.00)
47 _|SODDING 4,272 SY. $7.00 $29,904.00) $12.00| $51,264.00) $1.00 $4,272.00) $10.00| $42,720.00f $15.00| $705.00f $10.50) $44,856.00f $17.00| $72,624.00f $6.00 $25,632.00) $8.00 $34,176.00f $7.50 $32,040.00f
48 _|EXCAVATION, UNCLASSIFIED 200 c. $15.00| $3,000.00) $50.00| $10,000.00f $1.00 $200.00f $50.00| $10,000.00f $44.00| $2,112.00) $75.00) $15,000.00] $22.00| $4,400.00} $55.00) $11,000.00] $50.00] $10,000.00f $27.50) $5,500.00)
49 _|REGULATORY AND WARNING SIGN 100 SF. $27.00| $2,700.00) $27.00| $2,700.00) $35.00) $3,500.00) $34.00) $3,400.00) $44.00) $2,156.00) $11.00| $1,100.00) $9.25| $925.00f $35.00) $3,500.00) $26.00| $2,600.00} $290.00 $29,000.00f
50 |ELECTRICAL SERVICE CONNECTION 1 LS. $150,000.00| $150,000.00) $1.00 $1.00} $145,000.00| $145,000.00) $120,000.00| $120,000.00} $144,490.00| $144,490.00| $125,000.00) $125,000.00} $112,000.00| $112,000.00) $50,000.00 $50,000.00f $84,000.00 $84,000.00) $204,300.00| $204,300.00}
51 |TESTPITS 80 SY. $100.00 $8,000.00) $1,000.00| $80,000.00) $50.00] $4,000.00) $300.00 $24,000.00f $50.00) $2,550.00) $175.00 $14,000.00f $781.00 $62,480.00f $300.00 $24,000.00) $400.00 $32,000.00f $27.50) $2,200.00)
52 _|FUEL PRICE ADJUSTMENT (NO BID) 1 DOLLAR $2,900.00| $2,900.00) $2,900.00) $2,900.00) $2,900.00) $2,900.00} $2,900.00) $2,900.00} $2,900.00) $150,800.00} $2,900.00) $2,900.00} $2,900.00) $2,900.00 $2,900.00) $2,900.00) $2,900.00) $2,900.00) $2,900.00) $2,900.00}
53 _|ASPHALT PRICE ADJUSTMENT (NO BID) 1 DOLLAR $4,300.00) $4,300.00) $4,300.00 $4,300.00) $4,300.00 $4,300.00) $4,300.00) $4,300.00] $4,300.00) $227,900.00) $4,300.00) $4,300.00} $4,300.00 $4,300.00 $4,300.00) $4,300.00) $4,300.00 $4,300.00) $4,300.00) $4,300.00)
54 _|POLICE TRAFFIC DIRECTOR (NO BID) 1 LS. $10,000.00 $10,000.00f $10,000.00 $10,000.00f $10,000.00 $10,000.00) $10,000.00 $10,000.00) $10,000.00 $540,000.00} $10,000.00 $10,000.00) $10,000.00 $10,000.00f $10,000.00 $10,000.00f $10,000.00 $10,000.00) $10,000.00 $10,000.00)
55 |30° DUCTILE IRON PIPE 86 LF. $300.00 $25,800.00) $247.00 $21,242.00f $400.00 $34,400.00f $400.00 $34,400.00f $374.00 $20,570.00f $285.00 $24,510.00] $260.00 $22,360.00f $300.00 $25,800.00) $265.00 $22,790.00f $235.00 $20,210.00]
56 |36 DUCTILE IRON PIPE 585 LF. $375.00 $219,375.00) $322.00 $188,370.00) $485.00 $283,725.00) $485.00 $283,725.00) $472.00 $26,432.00| $325.00 $190,125.00} $302.00 $176,670.00 $400.00 $234,000.00) $315.00 $184,275.00) $295.00 $172,575.00)
57 _|48" DUCTILE IRON PIPE 46 LF. $550.00 $25,300.00) $493.00 $22,678.00f $600.00 $27,600.00] $600.00 $27,600.00] $927.00 $52,839.00f $550.00 $25,300.00] $615.00 $28,290.00f $540.00 $24,840.00) $800.00 $36,800.00f $575.00 $26,450.00]
58 [401009P - HMAMILLING, 3" OR LESS 12,005 SY. $1.00 $12,005.00) $1.50 $18,007.50f $1.50 $18,007.50f $2.40 $28,812.00] $1.80 $104.40] $5.00 $60,025.00f $2.05 $1.00 $12,005.00) $2.20 $26,411.00f $4.10 $49,220.50f
59 [401042M - HOT MIX ASPHALT 9.5 M 64 SURFACE COURSE 1,305 TON $100.00 $130,500.00 $71.90 $93,829.50] $72.00) $93.960.00f $68.00) sss,mo.ool $85.00) $5,015.00) $84.00) $109,620.00) $85.00) $80.00) $104,400.00) $72.00) $93.960.00f $89.00) $116,145.00)
TOTAL AMOUNT - BASE BID, ITEMS 1-59: $6,576,955.00 $9,522,222.70 $8,064,695.10] $8,032,111.60] $8,602,716.85] $7,577,440.60] $6,099,086.67] $6,723,352.40] $6,596,880.92 $6,957,381.00]
ALTERNATE NO. 1
29A_|HMA MILLING, 3" OR LESS | s07a5 | sv. |s 100 [ s 30,745.00 | $ 150 | s 46,117.50 | $ 150 | s 46,117.50 | $ 2.80 | s 86,086.00 | $ 180 | s 55,341.00 | 450 | s 138,352.50 | $ 2.05 s 63,027.25 | $ 100 [ s 30,745.00 | $ 3.00 | s 92,235.00 | $ 410 126,054.50
30A |HOT MIX ASPHALT 9.5 M 64 SURFACE COURSE | 3513 | TN |s 100.00 | § 354,300.00 | $ 7190 | 5 25474170 | 5 72.00 | 255,006.00 | 5 70.00 | 5 248,010.00 | $ 85.00 | 301,155.00 | 78.00 | 5 276,354.00 | $ 85.00 | 301,155.00 | 5 85.00 | 301,155.00 | $ 75.00 | 265,725.00 | $ 89.00 | 5 315,327.00
TOTAL AMOUNT - ALTERNATE NO. 1, ITEMS 29A - 30A: $385,045.00 $300,859.20 $301,213.50] $334,096.00; $356,496.00 $414,706.50] $364,182.25 $331,900.00; $357,960.00] $441,381.50]
TOTAL AMOUNT - BASE BID AND ALTERNATE NO. 1: $6,962,000.00 $9,823,081.90 $8,365,908.60] $8,366,207.60] $8,959,212.85] $7,992,147.10] $6,463,268.92 $7,055,252.40] $6,954,840.92 $7,398,762.50]
DOCUMENTATION
Required Number of Copies (3): YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes
Bid Deposit/Bond: YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes
Consent of Surety: YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes
Buy American Certification: YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes
Right to Extend - Time for Award: YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes
Statement of Ownership Disclosuret| YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes
Non-Collusion Affidavit: YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes
Mandatory Equal Employment Opportunity Language: YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes
NJ Affirmative Action Regulation Complaince Notice: YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes
Required Subcontractors Listing:| YIN Yes - Three YIN Yes - Two YIN Yes - Two YIN Yes - One YIN Yes - One YIN Yes - One YIN Yes - None YIN Yes - One YIN Yes - Two YIN Yes - One
Acknowledge of Receipt of Addenda: YIN Yes - Two YIN Yes - Two YIN Yes - Two YIN Yes - Two YIN Yes - Two YIN Yes - Two YIN Yes - Two YIN Yes - Two YIN Yes - Two YIN Yes - Two
Disclosure of Investment Activites in Iran Statement-Two Part Form:| YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes
NJ Business Registration Certificate (BRC): YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes
NJ Business Registration Certificate for Subcontractors (BRC):| YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes
NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate:| YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes
NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate for Subcontractors: YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes
Statement of Authority| YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes
W-9: YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes YIN Yes




