
CITY OF OCEAN CITY
AMERICA’S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, December 19, 2017 @ 2:00 PM, EDT

CITY CONTRACT #: 17-53
BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ PROPOSAL NAME: North End Drainage Improvements

NAME, ADDRESS &
BID OF EACH BIDDER

Key: Engineer's Estimate: $9,659,248.00
Apparent Low Bidder
Non-Responsive - Fatal Defect

Base Bid - Item Description Quantity Unit
1  CONSTRUCTION LAYOUT 1 DOLLAR $13,320.38 $13,320.38 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $230,000.00 $230,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00
2  MOBILIZATION 1 L.S. $415,000.00 $415,000.00 $97,900.00 $97,900.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $230,000.00 $230,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $900,000.00 $900,000.00 $875,000.00 $875,000.00
3  FUEL PRICE ADJUSTMENT(NO BID) 1 DOLLAR $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
4  ASPHALT PRICE ADJUSTMENT(NO BID) 1 DOLLAR $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
5  SOIL EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL 1 L.S. $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $140,000.00 $140,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $47,000.00 $47,000.00 $100.00 $100.00
6  TRAFFIC CONTROL 1 L.S. $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00 $105,500.00 $105,500.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $48,000.00 $48,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
7  POLICE TRAFFIC DIRECTOR(NO BID) 1 DOLLAR $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00
8  REGULATORY AND WARNING SIGN 100 S.F. $30.00 $3,000.00 $1.00 $100.00 $35.00 $3,500.00 $30.00 $3,000.00 $25.00 $2,500.00 $32.00 $3,200.00 $38.30 $3,830.00 $30.00 $3,000.00
9  12" HIGH DENSITY POLYETHYLENE PIPE 2,018 L.F. $65.00 $131,170.00 $115.00 $232,070.00 $100.00 $201,800.00 $97.00 $195,746.00 $104.00 $209,872.00 $130.00 $262,340.00 $201.00 $405,618.00 $90.00 $181,620.00

10  8" X 18" CONCRETE VERTICAL CURB 15,000 L.F. $22.00 $330,000.00 $21.50 $322,500.00 $27.00 $405,000.00 $28.00 $420,000.00 $29.50 $442,500.00 $30.00 $450,000.00 $22.00 $330,000.00 $23.00 $345,000.00
11  CONCRETE GUTTER, 8" THICK X 18" WIDE 28,400 L.F. $20.00 $568,000.00 $21.50 $610,600.00 $22.00 $624,800.00 $22.00 $624,800.00 $24.25 $688,700.00 $40.00 $1,136,000.00 $20.00 $568,000.00 $21.00 $596,400.00
12  CONCRETE SIDEWALK, 4" THICK 8,800 S.Y. $55.00 $484,000.00 $58.00 $510,400.00 $78.00 $686,400.00 $68.00 $598,400.00 $69.50 $611,600.00 $145.00 $1,276,000.00 $55.00 $484,000.00 $55.00 $484,000.00
13  CONCRETE DRIVEWAY, 6" THICK 1,600 S.Y. $60.00 $96,000.00 $58.00 $92,800.00 $78.00 $124,800.00 $70.00 $112,000.00 $71.60 $114,560.00 $90.00 $144,000.00 $60.00 $96,000.00 $60.00 $96,000.00
14  HOT MIX ASPHALT DRIVEWAY, 6" THICK 500 S.Y. $30.00 $15,000.00 $45.00 $22,500.00 $45.00 $22,500.00 $45.00 $22,500.00 $36.00 $18,000.00 $60.00 $30,000.00 $67.60 $33,800.00 $45.00 $22,500.00
15  DETECTABLE WARNING SURFACE 160 U $500.00 $80,000.00 $250.00 $40,000.00 $200.00 $32,000.00 $102.00 $16,320.00 $290.00 $46,400.00 $250.00 $40,000.00 $220.00 $35,200.00 $225.00 $36,000.00
16  HMA MILLING, 3" OR LESS 67,800 S.Y. $0.01 $678.00 $2.50 $169,500.00 $2.50 $169,500.00 $2.00 $135,600.00 $4.20 $284,760.00 $5.00 $339,000.00 $2.00 $135,600.00 $2.00 $135,600.00
17  HOT MIX ASPHALT 9.5 M 64 SURFACE COURSE, 1 1/2" THICK 75,800 S.Y. $22.50 $1,705,500.00 $16.00 $1,212,800.00 $15.75 $1,193,850.00 $15.40 $1,167,320.00 $8.00 $606,400.00 $6.50 $492,700.00 $8.00 $606,400.00 $12.00 $909,600.00
18  HOT MIX ASPHALT 19 M 64 BASE COURSE, 3" THICK 72,262 S.Y. $0.01 $722.62 $0.01 $722.62 $0.01 $722.62 $0.01 $722.62 $11.20 $809,334.40 $14.00 $1,011,668.00 $3.00 $216,786.00 $0.01 $722.62
19  TRAFFIC MARKINGS, LINES, LONG LIFE, THERMOPLASTIC 41,700 L.F. $0.51 $21,267.00 $0.75 $31,275.00 $0.60 $25,020.00 $0.60 $25,020.00 $0.55 $22,935.00 $0.65 $27,105.00 $0.70 $29,190.00 $0.75 $31,275.00
20  TURF REPAIR STRIP 4,100 L.F. $1.00 $4,100.00 $4.00 $16,400.00 $1.00 $4,100.00 $2.50 $10,250.00 $6.60 $27,060.00 $8.00 $32,800.00 $4.50 $18,450.00 $5.00 $20,500.00
21  SODDING 4,400 S.Y. $4.50 $19,800.00 $6.00 $26,400.00 $10.25 $45,100.00 $6.00 $26,400.00 $13.50 $59,400.00 $5.00 $22,000.00 $10.00 $44,000.00 $10.00 $44,000.00
22  TREE REMOVAL, OVER 6'' TO 12'' DIAMETER 5 U $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $800.00 $4,000.00 $300.00 $1,500.00 $1.00 $5.00 $790.00 $3,950.00 $500.00 $2,500.00 $520.00 $2,600.00 $300.00 $1,500.00
23  SMALL DECIDUOUS TREE, 5-6' HIGH, B&B 5 U $300.00 $1,500.00 $900.00 $4,500.00 $300.00 $1,500.00 $315.00 $1,575.00 $220.00 $1,100.00 $550.00 $2,750.00 $520.00 $2,600.00 $500.00 $2,500.00
24  INLET, TYPE A 85 U $4,000.00 $340,000.00 $2,997.00 $254,745.00 $3,000.00 $255,000.00 $2,100.00 $178,500.00 $2,019.00 $171,615.00 $3,000.00 $255,000.00 $3,600.00 $306,000.00 $5,000.00 $425,000.00
25  INLET, TYPE B 38 U $4,000.00 $152,000.00 $3,426.00 $130,188.00 $3,500.00 $133,000.00 $2,670.00 $101,460.00 $2,556.00 $97,128.00 $5,000.00 $190,000.00 $4,000.00 $152,000.00 $6,000.00 $228,000.00
26  INLET, TYPE E 19 U $4,000.00 $76,000.00 $3,926.00 $74,594.00 $4,100.00 $77,900.00 $2,820.00 $53,580.00 $2,698.00 $51,262.00 $4,500.00 $85,500.00 $4,500.00 $85,500.00 $6,000.00 $114,000.00
27  INLET, TYPE E1 13 U $6,000.00 $78,000.00 $5,654.00 $73,502.00 $5,500.00 $71,500.00 $4,290.00 $55,770.00 $4,101.00 $53,313.00 $5,500.00 $71,500.00 $6,000.00 $78,000.00 $6,000.00 $78,000.00
28  SET INLET TYPE A, CASTING 22 U $300.00 $6,600.00 $250.00 $5,500.00 $500.00 $11,000.00 $870.00 $19,140.00 $832.00 $18,304.00 $800.00 $17,600.00 $1,060.00 $23,320.00 $1,000.00 $22,000.00
29  SET INLET TYPE B, CASTING 6 U $500.00 $3,000.00 $250.00 $1,500.00 $700.00 $4,200.00 $870.00 $5,220.00 $832.00 $4,992.00 $1,200.00 $7,200.00 $1,340.00 $8,040.00 $1,200.00 $7,200.00
30  RECONSTRUCTED INLET, TYPE A 7 U $1,000.00 $7,000.00 $1,250.00 $8,750.00 $1,500.00 $10,500.00 $1,335.00 $9,345.00 $1,277.00 $8,939.00 $1,000.00 $7,000.00 $2,330.00 $16,310.00 $1,000.00 $7,000.00
31  RECONSTRUCTED INLET, TYPE B 2 U $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $1,250.00 $2,500.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,627.00 $3,254.00 $1,556.00 $3,112.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,280.00 $4,560.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00
32  MANHOLE, 4' DIAMETER 3 U $8,300.00 $24,900.00 $8,260.00 $24,780.00 $17,000.00 $51,000.00 $12,165.00 $36,495.00 $11,638.00 $34,914.00 $28,000.00 $84,000.00 $21,000.00 $63,000.00 $6,500.00 $19,500.00
33  MANHOLE, 5' DIAMETER 9 U $11,000.00 $99,000.00 $11,113.00 $100,017.00 $20,000.00 $180,000.00 $13,500.00 $121,500.00 $12,915.00 $116,235.00 $30,000.00 $270,000.00 $20,000.00 $180,000.00 $8,000.00 $72,000.00
34  MANHOLE, 6' DIAMETER 4 U $13,000.00 $52,000.00 $12,556.00 $50,224.00 $21,000.00 $84,000.00 $15,670.00 $62,680.00 $14,993.00 $59,972.00 $35,000.00 $140,000.00 $23,000.00 $92,000.00 $9,000.00 $36,000.00
35  MANHOLE, 8' DIAMETER 5 U $20,000.00 $100,000.00 $17,900.00 $89,500.00 $31,000.00 $155,000.00 $21,450.00 $107,250.00 $20,522.00 $102,610.00 $49,000.00 $245,000.00 $26,000.00 $130,000.00 $10,000.00 $50,000.00
36  SET MANHOLE CASTING 16 U $500.00 $8,000.00 $250.00 $4,000.00 $550.00 $8,800.00 $460.00 $7,360.00 $440.00 $7,040.00 $800.00 $12,800.00 $437.00 $6,992.00 $1,000.00 $16,000.00
37  RECONSTRUCTED MANHOLE, USING EXISTING CASTING 1 U $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,206.00 $1,206.00 $1,154.00 $1,154.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,620.00 $1,620.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00
38  12" DUCTILE IRON PIPE 2,264 L.F. $125.00 $283,000.00 $125.00 $283,000.00 $120.00 $271,680.00 $123.00 $278,472.00 $159.00 $359,976.00 $100.00 $226,400.00 $130.00 $294,320.00 $140.00 $316,960.00
39  18" DUCTILE IRON PIPE 735 L.F. $200.00 $147,000.00 $169.00 $124,215.00 $170.00 $124,950.00 $185.00 $135,975.00 $199.00 $146,265.00 $135.00 $99,225.00 $140.00 $102,900.00 $150.00 $110,250.00
40  24" DUCTILE IRON PIPE 2,691 L.F. $235.00 $632,385.00 $235.00 $632,385.00 $200.00 $538,200.00 $227.00 $610,857.00 $241.00 $648,531.00 $225.00 $605,475.00 $300.00 $807,300.00 $240.00 $645,840.00
41  30" DUCTILE IRON PIPE 400 L.F. $250.00 $100,000.00 $256.00 $102,400.00 $310.00 $124,000.00 $273.00 $109,200.00 $290.00 $116,000.00 $315.00 $126,000.00 $312.00 $124,800.00 $175.00 $70,000.00
42  30" HIGH DENSITY POLYETHYLENE PIPE 2,076 L.F. $160.00 $332,160.00 $157.00 $325,932.00 $170.00 $352,920.00 $163.00 $338,388.00 $180.00 $373,680.00 $125.00 $259,500.00 $203.00 $421,428.00 $175.00 $363,300.00
43  24" HIGH DENSITY POLYETHYLENE PIPE 1,854 L.F. $180.00 $333,720.00 $146.00 $270,684.00 $160.00 $296,640.00 $157.00 $291,078.00 $177.00 $328,158.00 $115.00 $213,210.00 $125.00 $231,750.00 $120.00 $222,480.00
44  STORMWATER PUMP STATION 1 1 U $265,000.00 $265,000.00 $223,445.00 $223,445.00 $240,000.00 $240,000.00 $262,230.00 $262,230.00 $262,230.00 $262,230.00 $415,000.00 $415,000.00 $425,000.00 $425,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00
45  STORMWATER PUMP STATION 2 1 U $265,000.00 $265,000.00 $226,444.00 $226,444.00 $240,000.00 $240,000.00 $262,230.00 $262,230.00 $262,230.00 $262,230.00 $415,000.00 $415,000.00 $475,000.00 $475,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00
46  STORMWATER PUMP STATION 3 1 U $265,000.00 $265,000.00 $226,444.00 $226,444.00 $240,000.00 $240,000.00 $262,230.00 $262,230.00 $262,230.00 $262,230.00 $415,000.00 $415,000.00 $425,000.00 $425,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00
47  CLEAN OUT 8 U $6,000.00 $48,000.00 $6,631.00 $53,048.00 $8,000.00 $64,000.00 $10,627.00 $85,016.00 $10,166.00 $81,328.00 $4,500.00 $36,000.00 $7,000.00 $56,000.00 $15,000.00 $120,000.00
48  18" TIDE CONTROL CHECK VALVE,SLIP ON 1 U $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,705.00 $8,705.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $7,705.00 $7,705.00 $7,371.00 $7,371.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $9,200.00 $9,200.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
49  CHECK VALVE CHAMBER 1 U $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $17,970.00 $17,970.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $44,990.00 $44,990.00 $43,040.00 $43,040.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $90,000.00 $90,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00
50  CLEANING EXISTING PIPE, 12" TO 24" DIAMETER 326 L.F. $10.00 $3,260.00 $30.00 $9,780.00 $30.00 $9,780.00 $33.00 $10,758.00 $32.00 $10,432.00 $7.00 $2,282.00 $7.95 $2,591.70 $6.00 $1,956.00
51  RESET FIRE HYDRANT 17 U $1.00 $17.00 $1.00 $17.00 $1,000.00 $17,000.00 $4,117.00 $69,989.00 $3,939.00 $66,963.00 $1,200.00 $20,400.00 $1,170.00 $19,890.00 $1,200.00 $20,400.00
52  RESET MANHOLE, SANITARY SEWER, USING EXISTING CASTING 54 U $500.00 $27,000.00 $250.00 $13,500.00 $500.00 $27,000.00 $644.00 $34,776.00 $616.00 $33,264.00 $225.00 $12,150.00 $425.00 $22,950.00 $10.00 $540.00
53  DENSE-GRADED AGGREGATE BASE COURSE 2,800 TONS $25.00 $70,000.00 $30.00 $84,000.00 $25.00 $70,000.00 $25.00 $70,000.00 $21.60 $60,480.00 $38.00 $106,400.00 $16.50 $46,200.00 $30.00 $84,000.00
54  PULVERIZED SOIL AGGREGATE BASE COURSE, ROAD MIXED, 6" THICK 7,760 S.Y. $5.00 $38,800.00 $12.00 $93,120.00 $10.00 $77,600.00 $10.00 $77,600.00 $4.20 $32,592.00 $10.00 $77,600.00 $4.50 $34,920.00 $2.00 $15,520.00
55  I-5 SOIL AGGREGATE 1,800 C.Y. $15.00 $27,000.00 $30.00 $54,000.00 $25.00 $45,000.00 $1.00 $1,800.00 $42.80 $77,040.00 $45.00 $81,000.00 $23.60 $42,480.00 $30.00 $54,000.00
56  24" TIDE CONTROL CHECK VALVE, SLIP ON 1 U $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $11,300.00 $11,300.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $10,530.00 $10,530.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $13,700.00 $13,700.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00
57  TEST PITS 66 C.Y. $125.00 $8,250.00 $125.00 $8,250.00 $100.00 $6,600.00 $250.00 $16,500.00 $250.00 $16,500.00 $300.00 $19,800.00 $479.00 $31,614.00 $100.00 $6,600.00
58  UTILITY CONFLICTS (NO BID) 30 U $2,000.00 $60,000.00 $2,000.00 $60,000.00 $2,000.00 $60,000.00 $2,000.00 $60,000.00 $2,000.00 $60,000.00 $2,000.00 $60,000.00 $2,000.00 $60,000.00 $2,000.00 $60,000.00
59  PIPE PLUG 10 C.Y. $500.00 $5,000.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $250.00 $2,500.00 $814.00 $8,140.00 $778.00 $7,780.00 $800.00 $8,000.00 $403.00 $4,030.00 $150.00 $1,500.00
60  ELECTRICAL JUNCTION BOX 6 U $5,000.00 $30,000.00 $4,500.00 $27,000.00 $6,000.00 $36,000.00 $4,953.00 $29,718.00 $4,740.00 $28,440.00 $5,000.00 $30,000.00 $2,060.00 $12,360.00 $3,600.00 $21,600.00
61  CONCRETE ENCASED CONDUIT 195 L.F. $130.00 $25,350.00 $180.00 $35,100.00 $200.00 $39,000.00 $172.00 $33,540.00 $165.00 $32,175.00 $200.00 $39,000.00 $60.20 $11,739.00 $150.00 $29,250.00
62  TRANSFORMER PAD 3 U $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $13,500.00 $3,600.00 $10,800.00 $3,850.00 $11,550.00 $3,685.00 $11,055.00 $10,000.00 $30,000.00 $2,490.00 $7,470.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00
63  ELECTRICAL SERVICE REQUEST(NO BID) 1 DOLLAR $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00
64  TRAFFIC MARKINGS, SYMBOLS, LONG LIFE, THERMOPLASTIC 500 S.F. $25.00 $12,500.00 $26.00 $13,000.00 $19.50 $9,750.00 $19.50 $9,750.00 $6.00 $3,000.00 $5.00 $2,500.00 $25.85 $12,925.00 $25.00 $12,500.00
65  COMPOSITE BULKHEAD 1 L.S. $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $140,000.00 $140,000.00 $173,500.00 $173,500.00 $173,558.00 $173,558.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $87,500.00 $87,500.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00
66  8" DUCTILE IRON PIPE 100 L.F. $100.00 $10,000.00 $200.00 $20,000.00 $100.00 $10,000.00 $203.00 $20,300.00 $194.00 $19,400.00 $95.00 $9,500.00 $4.80 $480.00 $200.00 $20,000.00

Alternate 1 Quantity Unit
67  MOBILE GENERATOR 3 U $76,000.00 $228,000.00 $88,000.00 $264,000.00 $86,000.00 $258,000.00 $80,000.00 $240,000.00 $82,593.00 $247,779.00 $85,000.00 $255,000.00 $255,000.00 $765,000.00 $75,000.00 $225,000.00

Required Number of Copies (2): Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes
Bid Deposit/Bond: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes
Consent of Surety: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes

Buy American Certification Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes
Right to Extend - Time for Award: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes

Statement of Ownership Disclosure: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes
Non-Collusion Affidavit: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes

Mandatory Equal Employment Opportunity Language: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes
NJ Affirmative Action Regulation Compliances Notice: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes

Subcontractors Listing  - Two Required - Electrical & Plumbing/Gas: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N No Y/N Yes Y/N Yes
Acknowledge of Receipt of Addenda - One Issued: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes

Disclosure of Investment Activities in Iran Statement-Two Part Form: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes
NJ Business Registration Certificate (BRC): Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes

NJ Business Registration Certificate for Subcontractors (BRC): Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes
NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes

NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate for Subcontractors: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes
Statement of Authority: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes

W-9: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes

F: 856-691-5195F: 609-704-5355

Lexa Concrete
11 Commerce Way Dr.
Hammonton, NJ 08037

Alex O. Gherardi, Mg Member
P: 609-704-5293

Charles Marandino LLC
P. O. Box 20

Milmay, NJ 08340
Charles Marandino, Owner

P: 856-691-9963

skurtz@aestone.com cmllc@comcast.netlexaconcrete@aol.commailbox@lferiozzi.com

Required Information

Total Amount for Base Bid Items, 1 - 66: $8,100,000.00 $7,599,006.62 $8,005,412.62 $8,314,710.62

Total Amount for Alternate 1 Item, 67: $8,328,000.00 $7,863,006.62 $8,263,412.62 $8,554,710.62

F: 609-344-3719

1435 Doughty Road

 Steven Kurtz, President 

A.E. Stone, Inc.

Egg Harbor Township, NJ 08234

 P: 609-641-2781 
F: 609-641-0374

L. Feriozzi Concrete Company
3010 Sunset Avenue

Atlantic City, NJ 08401
Joseph L. Feriozzi
P: 609-823-2563

Mathis Construction Co. Inc. Mount Contruction Co. Inc. Richard E. Pierson Construction Co. Inc. South State, Inc.  
1510 Route 539, Suite 1 427 S. White Horse Pike 426 Swedesboro Road P.O. Box 68, 202 Reeves Road

Little Egg Harbor, NJ 08087 Berlin, NJ 08009 Pilesgrove, NJ 08098 Bridgeton, NJ 08302
Christopher D. Mathis, President Michael Mazzarella, V. P. of Bus. Devt. Robert L. Baccala, Vice President Chester J. Ottinger, Jr., President

P: 609-296-3728 P: 856-768-8493 P: 856-769-8244 P: 856-451-5300
F: 609-296-2513 F: 856-753-1453 F: 856-769-5630 F: 856-455-3461

$9,217,188.40 $11,280,105.00 $10,747,963.70 $9,114,713.62

mail@mathisconst.com mmazzarella@mountconstruction.com info@repierson bbryan@southstateinc.com

$8,969,409.40 $11,025,105.00 $9,982,963.70 $8,889,713.62

mailto:mail@mathisconst.com
mailto:info@repierson
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