PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

CITY OF OCEAN CITY

AMERICA'S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

C

DATE RECEIVED:
ITY CONTRACT #:
PROPOSAL NAME:

Tuesday, August 7, 2018 @ 2:00 PM, EDT
18-17
Ocean City Lifesaving Station - Phase 3

NAME, ADDRESS &
BID OF EACH BIDDER
Engineer's Estimate: $143,031.00

Key: Apparent Low Bidder

Disqualified Bidder-Material Defect

Fred M. Schiavone Construction, LLC

Straga Brothers, Inc

West Bay Construction, Inc

PO Box 416

P.O. Box 216

133 Pleasant Avenue

Malaga New Jersey 08328

Glassboro, NJ 08028

Absecon, NJ 08201

Contact Name(s) lggy Bik

Contact Name(s) Dennis Straga

Contact Name(s) Elsamarie Corradetti

Tel # 856-697-4558 x15

Tel # 856 881 7960

Chris Jones

Fax Number 856-697-9612

Fax Number 856 881 8853

Tel # 609 380 7065

ibik@fmschiavone.com

dennis@stragabrothers.net

609 513 7182 (cell)

gail@stragabrothers.net

Fax Number 609 573 5955

elsa@westbayinc.net

cjones@westbayonc.net

ITEM] DESCRIPTION ] oty | unNIT UNIT COST | TOTAL COST UNIT COST | TOTAL COST UNIT COST | TOTAL COST
BASE BID
1 |Owner's Requirements, General Conitions as stated in Division 01 of the
Project Manual & all items not listed below 1 LumpSum | $ 7,000.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 18,712.00 | $ 18,712.00 NO BID
2 [Site Work, Including Shoring/Bracing, Grading, Selective Demolition,
Removals, Archeological Monitoring as listed in Division 02 of the Project
Manual 1 Lump Sum | $ 14,700.00 | $ 14,700.00 | $ 19,300.00 | $ 19,300.00 NO BID
3 |All Work as it relates to Fabrication & Installation of a Custom Wood Fence &
Accessories at the Property 1 Lump Sum | $ 74,200.00 | $ 74,200.00 | $ 55,880.00 | $ 55,880.00 NO BID
4 |All Work as it relates to Bluestone Walks from the Public Sidewalk to the Porch
Steps 2 locations West & South Elevations 1 Lump Sum | $ 10,540.00 | $ 10,540.00 | $ 13,200.00 | $ 13,200.00 NO BID
5 |All Work as it relates to the Installation of the New Porous Pavers East
Elevation of the Building at the Boat Ramp 1 Lump Sum | $ 19,000.00 | $ 19,000.00 § $ 13,200.00 | $ 13,200.00 NO BID
6 |All Work as it relates to the Installation of the New Flagpole, including
Foundation & Salavaging of the Hardware from Existing Pole 1 Lump Sum | $ 12,300.00 | $ 12,300.00 | $ 8,758.00 | $ 8,758.00 NO BID
7 |All Work as it relates to the Concrete Work, including Parking Area 1 LumpSum | $ 11,500.00 | $ 11,500.00 | $ 9,850.00 | $ 9,850.00 NO BID
8 |All Work as it relates to the Faberaction, Erection of the Project Sign 1 Lump Sum | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 NO BID
9 |Owner Established Allowance for the Faricaiton & Installation of a Permanent
Cast Bronze Historic Marker 1 LumpSum | $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00
$ - $ - $ -
Total Amount Bid, Base Bid, Items 1 - 9: $155,240.00 $144,000.00 $0.00
Part B: Alternate Items
ALTERNATE BID "1"
1 |Exisiting Flag Pole Removal [ 1 (+or -) -$600.00 -$600.00 -$500.00] -$500.00 | NO BID
Total Amount Bid, Alternate Bid "1": -$600.00 -$500.00 NO BID
ALTERNATE BID "2"
2 |North Fence saving If the perimeter fence along the Northern Property Lump Sum
Boundary is eliminated from scope of work 1 (+or-) -$16,100.00 -$16,100.00 -$12,000.00 -$12,000.00 NO BID
Total Amount Bid, Alternate Bid "2": -$16,100.00 -$12,000.00 NO BID

JALTERNATE BID "3"




NAME, ADDRESS &
BID OF EACH BIDDER
Engineer's Estimate: $143,031.00

Key: Apparent Low Bidder
Disqualified Bidder-Material Defect

Fred M. Schiavone Construction, LLC

Straga Brothers, Inc

West Bay Construction, Inc

PO Box 416

P.O. Box 216

133 Pleasant Avenue

Malaga New Jersey 08328

Glassboro, NJ 08028

Absecon, NJ 08201

Contact Name(s) lggy Bik

Contact Name(s) Dennis Straga

Contact Name(s) Elsamarie Corradetti

Tel # 856-697-4558 x15

Tel # 856 881 7960

Chris Jones

Fax Number 856-697-9612

Fax Number 856 881 8853

Tel # 609 380 7065

ibik@fmschiavone.com

dennis@stragabrothers.net

609 513 7182 (cell)

gail@stragabrothers.net

Fax Number 609 573 5955

elsa@westbayinc.net

cjones@westbayonc.net

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT COST - TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
3 |is eliminated from scope of work 1 (+or-) -$14,700.00 -$14,700.00 -$11,000.00 -$11,000.00 NO BID
Total Amount Bid, Alternate Bid "3": -$14,700.00 -$11,000.00 NO BID
REQUIRED INFORMATION
Required Number of Copies (2): Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N NO BID
Bid Deposit/Bond: Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N NO BID
Consent of Surety: Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N NO BID
Buy American Certification Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N NO BID
Right to Extend - Time for Award: Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N NO BID
Statement of Ownership Disclosure: Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N NO BID
Non-Collusion Affidavit: Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N NO BID
Mandatory Equal Employment Opportunity Language: Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N NO BID
NJ Affirmative Action Regulation Complaince Notice: Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N NO BID
Required Subcontractors Listing: Y/N YES-1 Steel Y/N YES-1 Steel Y/N NO BID
Acknowledge of Receipt of Addenda: YES-1 7/30/18 YES YES-1 7/30/18 YES YES-1 7/30/18 NO BID
Disclosure of Investment Activites in Iran Statement-Two Part Form: Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N NO BID
NJ Business Registration Certificate (BRC): Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N NO BID
NJ Business Registration Certificate for Subcontractors (BRC): Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N NO BID
NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate: Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N NO BID
NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate for Subcontractors: Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N NO BID
Statement of Authority: Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N NO BID
W-9: Y/N YES Y/N YES Y/N NO BID




	18-17 PAGE 2

