
CITY OF OCEAN CITY
AMERICA’S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

PURCHASING DIVISION DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, December 19, 2017 @ 2:00 PM, EDT
SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS CITY CONTRACT #: 18-19

PROPOSAL NAME: 9th Street Outfall Improvements 
BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

NAME, ADDRESS & Agate Construciton Company, Inc. Ramson, Inc. T/A Atlantic Marine Construciton Arthur R. Henry, Inc.
BID OF EACH BIDDER 130 Route 83 P.O. Box 924 3031 Ocean Heights Avenue

P.O. Box 107 Cape May Court House, NJ 08210 Egg Harbor Township, NJ 08234
Engineer's Estimate for Base Bid 1 & 2: $412,550 Ocean View, NJ 08230

James E Johnston, II I- President Edward M. Thomas - President Ralph R Henry, Jr. - President
609-602-3689 609-927-6660
609-465-1924 609-927-4780
eddie@atlanticmachines.net Grant@arhenry.com

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
BASE BID 1-BEACH WORK

1 SOIL EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL 1 LUMP SUM 664,720.00$           664,720.00$                         14,000.00$                14,000.00$                                     $5,000.00 $5,000.00
2 MAINTENANCE AND PROTECTION OF TRAFFIC 1 LUMP SUM 20,000.00$            20,000.00$                           6,000.00$                  6,000.00$                                       $36,000.00 $36,000.00
3 36" DIAMETER PIPE SUPPORT SYSTEM 20 UNIT 5,000.00$              100,000.00$                         7,800.00$                  156,000.00$                                    $10,500.00 $210,000.00
4 36" DUCTILE IRON CULVERT PIPE, CLASS 52 400 L.F. 200.00$                 80,000.00$                           731.00$                    292,400.00$                                    $300.00 $120,000.00
5 36" DUCTILE IRON CULVERT PIPE, CLASS 52, T 1 UNIT 21,000.00$            21,000.00$                           21,300.00$                21,300.00$                                     $15,000.00 $15,000.00
6 CONNECT TO EXISTING STORM SEWER 1 UNIT 3,000.00$              3,000.00$                             8,000.00$                  8,000.00$                                       $40,000.00 $40,000.00
7 CAPE' AMERICAN BEACHGRASS 7,500 UNITS 1.25$                     9,375.00$                             4.70$                        35,250.00$                                     $3.00 $22,500.00

TOTAL AMOUNT - BASE BID 1, ITEMS 1 - 7: $898,095.00 $448,500.00
BASE BID 2-ROAD WORK

8 SOIL EROSION & SEDIMENT CONTROL 1 LUMP SUM 102,000.00$           102,000.00$                         NO BID $1,500.00 $1,500.00
9 MAINTENANCE AND PROTECTION OF TRAFFIC 1 LUMP SUM 20,000.00$            20,000.00$                           NO BID $8,000.00 $8,000.00
10 HMA PROFILE MILLING 1,050 S.Y. 10.00$                   10,500.00$                           NO BID $10.00 $10,500.00
11

         
THICK 1,050 S.Y. 17.25$                   18,112.50$                           NO BID $17.00 $17,850.00

12 CONCRETE GUTTER, 8" THICK 15 S.Y. 124.00$                 1,860.00$                             NO BID $300.00 $4,500.00
13 CONCRETE SIDEWALK, 4" THICK 20 S.Y. 63.00$                   1,260.00$                             NO BID $140.00 $2,800.00
14 CONCRETE DRIVEWAY, 6" THICK 10 S.Y. 81.00$                   810.00$                               NO BID $275.00 $2,750.00
15 8"x18" CONCRETE VERTICAL CURB 40 L.F. 60.00$                   2,400.00$                             NO BID $100.00 $4,000.00
16

      
PERFORATED 30 L.F. 170.00$                 5,100.00$                             NO BID $230.00 $6,900.00

17 36" HIGH DENSITY POLYETHYLENE CULVERT PIPE 178 L.F. 110.00$                 19,580.00$                           NO BID $250.00 $44,500.00
18 UTILITY CROSSING 2 UNIT 4,000.00$              8,000.00$                             NO BID $500.00 $1,000.00
19 INLETS, TYPE "E" 2 UNIT 3,300.00$              6,600.00$                             NO BID $7,000.00 $14,000.00
20 CONNECT TO EXISTING STORM SEWER 1 UNIT 2,000.00$              2,000.00$                             NO BID $10,000.00 $10,000.00
21 STORM SEWER MANHOLES,  6' DIAMETER 1 UNIT 5,200.00$              5,200.00$                             NO BID $18,000.00 $18,000.00

203,422.50$                        $0.00 $146,300.00
TOTAL AMOUNT FOR BASE BIDs 1 & 2: 1,101,517.50$                    Base Bid #1 ONLY $532,950.00 594,800.00$                                            

Required Number of Copies (2): Y/N 2 Y/N 2 Y/N 1 original & 1 CD
Bid Deposit/Bond: Y/N YES-Western Surety Company Y/N YES-1st Indeminty of America Ins Co Y/N YES-the Ohio Casualty Insurance Company
Consent of Surety: Y/N YES-Western Surety Company Y/N YES-1st Indeminty of America Ins Co Y/N YES-the Ohio Casualty Insurance Company

Buy American Certification: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes
Right to Extend - Time for Award: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes

Statement of Ownership Disclosure: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes
Non-Collusion Affidavit: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes

Mandatory Equal Employment Opportunity Language: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes
NJ Affirmative Action Regulation Compliance Notice: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes

Required Subcontractors Listing - None Required: Y/N YES-NONE Listed Y/N YES-NONE Listed Y/N YES-NONE Listed
Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda - Three Issued 11/29, 12/1, 12/8: Y/N YES-3 Y/N YES-2 Y/N YES-3

Disclosure of Investment Activates in Iran Statement-Two Part Form: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes
NJ Business Registration Certificate (BRC): Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes

NJ Business Registration Certificate for Subcontractors (BRC): Y/N N/A Y/N N/A Y/N N/A
NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes

NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate for Subcontractors: Y/N N/A Y/N N/A Y/N N/A
Statement of Authority: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes

W-9: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N Yes

$532,950.00

DOCUMENTATION

TOTAL AMOUNT - BASE BID 2, ITEMS 8 - 21:

mailto:eddie@atlanticmachines.net
mailto:Grant@arhenry.com


CITY OF OCEAN CITY
AMERICA’S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

PURCHASING DIVISION DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, December 19, 2017 @ 2:00 PM, EDT
SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS CITY CONTRACT #: 18-19

PROPOSAL NAME: 9th Street Outfall Improvements 
BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

NAME, ADDRESS & Lafayette Utility Constructuion Co. Inc. Walter Marine Construction
BID OF EACH BIDDER 9 Atlantic Avenue 414 Woodbine-Ocean View Rd

Egg Harbor Township, NJ  08234 Ocean View, NJ  08230
Engineer's Estimate for Base Bid 1 & 2: $412,550

David Powell Jr.-Vice President David E. Southard-Secretary
609-645-2600-Telephone 609-624-8702-Telephone
609-383-9613-Fax 609-624-8703- Fax
lafayetteutil@comcast.net office@waltersmarineconstruciton.com

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
BASE BID 1-BEACH WORK

1 SOIL EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL 1 LUMP SUM 7,500.00$              7,500.00$                   625.00$                    625.00$                                          $0.00
2 MAINTENANCE AND PROTECTION OF TRAFFIC 1 LUMP SUM 7,500.00$              7,500.00$                   500.00$                    500.00$                                          $0.00
3 36" DIAMETER PIPE SUPPORT SYSTEM 20 UNIT 7,400.00$              148,000.00$               20,000.00$                400,000.00$                                    $0.00
4 36" DUCTILE IRON CULVERT PIPE, CLASS 52 400 L.F. 599.00$                 239,600.00$               300.00$                    120,000.00$                                    $0.00
5 36" DUCTILE IRON CULVERT PIPE, CLASS 52, T 1 UNIT 29,000.00$             29,000.00$                 25,000.00$                25,000.00$                                     $0.00
6 CONNECT TO EXISTING STORM SEWER 1 UNIT 36,500.00$             36,500.00$                 1,500.00$                  1,500.00$                                       $0.00
7 CAPE' AMERICAN BEACHGRASS 7,500 UNITS 3.00$                     22,500.00$                 1.25$                        9,375.00$                                       $0.00

TOTAL AMOUNT - BASE BID 1, ITEMS 1 - 7: 490,600.00$             557,000.00$                                  $0.00
BASE BID 2-ROAD WORK

8 SOIL EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL 1 LUMP SUM 7,500.00$              7,500.00$                   750.00$                    750.00$                                          $0.00
9 MAINTENANCE AND PROTECTION OF TRAFFIC 1 LUMP SUM 2,500.00$              2,500.00$                   2,500.00$                  2,500.00$                                       $0.00
10 HMA PROFILE MILLING 1,050 S.Y. 12.00$                   12,600.00$                 18.00$                      18,900.00$                                     $0.00

11
HOT MIX ASPHALT SURFACE COURSE, MIX 9.5M64, 1 1/2" 
THICK 1,050 S.Y. 19.85$                   20,842.50$                 15.00$                      15,750.00$                                     $0.00

12 CONCRETE GUTTER, 8" THICK 15 S.Y. 59.00$                   885.00$                     150.00$                    2,250.00$                                       $0.00
13 CONCRETE SIDEWALK, 4" THICK 20 S.Y. 59.00$                   1,180.00$                   80.00$                      1,600.00$                                       $0.00
14 CONCRETE DRIVEWAY, 6" THICK 10 S.Y. 79.00$                   790.00$                     200.00$                    2,000.00$                                       $0.00
15 8"x18" CONCRETE VERTICAL CURB 40 L.F. 36.00$                   1,440.00$                   70.00$                      2,800.00$                                       $0.00

16
24" HIGH DENSITY POLYETHYLENE CULVERT PIPE, 
PERFORATED 30 L.F. 149.00$                 4,470.00$                   150.00$                    4,500.00$                                       $0.00

17 36" HIGH DENSITY POLYETHYLENE CULVERT PIPE 178 L.F. 174.00$                 30,972.00$                 400.00$                    71,200.00$                                     $0.00
18 UTILITY CROSSING 2 UNIT 2,500.00$              5,000.00$                   500.00$                    1,000.00$                                       $0.00
19 INLETS, TYPE "E" 2 UNIT 4,900.00$              9,800.00$                   4,000.00$                  8,000.00$                                       $0.00
20 CONNECT TO EXISTING STORM SEWER 1 UNIT 4,900.00$              4,900.00$                   750.00$                    750.00$                                          $0.00
21 STORM SEWER MANHOLES,  6' DIAMETER 1 UNIT -$                          10,000.00$                10,000.00$                                     $0.00

102,879.50$             142,000.00$                                  $0.00
TOTAL AMOUNT FOR BASE BIDs 1 & 2: 593,479.50$             699,000.00$                                  -$                                                         

DOCUMENTATION
Required Number of Copies (2): Y/N 2 Y/N 2 Y/N

Bid Deposit/Bond: Y/N tive Insurance Company o  Y/N S-International Fidelity Insurance Compa Y/N
Consent of Surety: Y/N tive Insurance Company o  Y/N S-International Fidelity Insurance Compa Y/N

Buy American Certification: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
Right to Extend - Time for Award: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N

Statement of Ownership Disclosure: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
Non-Collusion Affidavit: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N

Mandatory Equal Employment Opportunity Language: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
NJ Affirmative Action Regulation Compliance Notice: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N

Required Subcontractors Listing - None Required: Y/N YES-NONE Listed Y/N YES-NONE Listed Y/N
Acknowledgement of Receipt of Addenda - Three Issued 11/29, 12/1, 12/8: Y/N YES-1 Y/N YES-3 Y/N

Disclosure of Investment Activates in Iran Statement-Two Part Form: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
NJ Business Registration Certificate (BRC): Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N

NJ Business Registration Certificate for Subcontractors (BRC): Y/N N/A Y/N N/A Y/N
NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N

NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate for Subcontractors: Y/N N/A Y/N N/A Y/N
Statement of Authority: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N

W-9: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N

TOTAL AMOUNT - BASE BID 2, ITEMS 8 - 21:

mailto:lafayetteutil@comcast.net
mailto:office@waltersmarineconstruciton.com
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