PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

CITY OF OCEAN CITY

AMERICA'S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

DATE RECEIVED:
CITY CONTRACT #:
PROPOSAL NAME:

Tuesday, May 17, 2016 @ 2:00 PM, EDT
16-17-R1
Supply & Delivery of Lifeguard Uniforms

NAME, ADDRESS & Maui Rippers Inc. Wave One Sports Inc.
BID OF EACH BIDDER 4345 Waha Place 1992 Bulter Pike
Haiku, HI 96708 Conshohocken, PA 19428
KEY: Contact: Joe Faustine, President Contact: Peter Oppenheimer, President Contact:
Ph: 808-573-0402 Ph: 610-238-4470 Ph:
Recommended for Award Fax: not listed Fax: 610-238-9098 Fax:
e-mail: info@mauirippers.com e-mail: pete@waveonesports.com e-mail:
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE 201.6/2917 201.7/2(.)18 2018/2019. Unit} 2016/2017. Unit] 2017/2018. Unit] 2018/2019. Unit] 2016/2017. Unit] 2017/2018. Unit] 2018/2019. Unit]
Unit Price Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
A. SHIRTS-TANKS, T-SHIRTS & SPORTSWEAR Items 1.0 - 9.0 Previously Awarded through CC 16-17
B. SWIM SUITS & BOARD SHORTS Items 1.0 - 5.0 Previously Awarded through CC 16-17
6.0 [Men's Maui Rippers #LGSTNV - no substitutions 28 - 44 $23.50 $23.50 $23.50 No Bid $ - $ - $ -
7.0 [Women's Maui Rippers #LGW - no substitutions 1-15 $23.50 $23.50 $23.50 No Bid $ - $ - $ -
C. JACKETS, SWEATSHIRTS, WARM UP PANTS & RAINGEAR
1.0 |Jacket, Wave One Sports, Bomber (red) - no substitutions M-XL No Bid $81.00 $82.00 $83.004 - $ - $ -
XXL No Bid $86.00 $87.00 $88.00] $ - $ - $ -
2.0 Jacket, Wave One Sports, Straight Bottom Bomber (red) - no M-XL No Bid $81.00 $82.00 $83.00] $ - $ - $ -
substitutions XXL No Bid $86.00 $87.00 $88.00] $ - |3 - |s -
3.0 |Warm-Up Pants, Wave One Sports (red) - no substitutions M-XL No Bid $45.00 $46.00 $47.000 $ - $ - $ -
XXL No Bid $49.00 $50.00 $51.00] $ - $ - $ -
4.0 [Warm-Up Pants, Wave One Sports (navy) - no substitutions M-XL No Bid $45.00 $46.00 $47.000 $ - $ - $ -
XXL No Bid $49.00 $50.00 $51.00] $ - $ - $ -
5.0 [Sweatshirt, Eagle #S1102 and/or approved equal S-XXL Previously Awarded through CC 16-17
6.0 |Raingear, Rainfair #RN 91539 S-XL No Bid | No Bid Is - s - s -
D. OTHER ITEMS - HATS Items 1.0 - 3.0 Previously Awarded through CC 16-17
Required Information
Required Number of Copies (2): Y/N Yes Y/N No Y/N
Bid Deposit/Bond: Y/N N/A Y/N N/A Y/N N/A
Consent of Surety: Y/N N/A Y/N N/A Y/N N/A
Right-to-Extend - Time for Award: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
Stockholder Disclosure Statement: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
Non-Collusion Affidavit: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
NJ Mandatory Equal Employment Opportunity Language: Y/N No Y/N Yes Y/N
Required Subcontractors Listing: Y/N N/A Y/N N/A Y/N N/A
Acknowledge of Receipt of Addenda: Y/N Yes - None Y/N Yes - None Y/N None
NJ Affirmative Action Complaince Notice to Bidders: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
Manufacturer's Affidavit & Certificate of Origin: Y/N Yes Y/N Sections C & D but not A & B
Disclosure of Investment Activites in Iran Statement - Two Part Form: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes, but not certified or notarized Y/N
NJ Business Registration Certificate (BRC): Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
NJ Business Registration Certificate for Subcontractors (BRC): Y/N N/A Y/N N/A Y/N N/A
NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate: Y/N N/A Y/N N/A Y/N N/A
NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate for Subcontractors: Y/N N/A Y/N N/A Y/N N/A
Statement of Authority: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
W-9: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N




