
CITY OF OCEAN CITY
AMERICA’S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

PURCHASING DIVISION DATE RECEIVED: Thursday, April 14, 2016 @ 2:00 PM, EDT

SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS CITY CONTRACT #: 16-17

PROPOSAL NAME: Supply & Delivery of Lifeguard Uniforms

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

NAME, ADDRESS &

BID OF EACH BIDDER

KEY:

Recommended for Award

ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE
2016/2017        

Unit Price

2017/2018        

Unit Price

2018/2019            

Unit Price

2016/2017        

Unit Price

2017/2018        

Unit Price

2018/2019            

Unit Price

2016/2017        

Unit Price

2017/2018        

Unit Price

2018/2019            

Unit Price

S-XL 14.49$           14.49$           14.49$                24.75$           25.59$           26.10$           -$              -$              -$              

XXL 15.49$           15.49$           15.49$                24.75$           28.89$           29.25$           -$              -$              -$              

S-XL 11.49$           11.49$           11.49$                13.45$           13.90$           14.40$           -$              -$              -$              

XXL 12.49$           12.49$           12.49$                14.95$           15.50$           16.00$           -$              -$              -$              

S-XL 13.99$           13.99$           13.99$                15.55$           16.05$           16.50$           -$              -$              -$              

XXL 14.99$           14.99$           14.99$                17.00$           17.55$           18.10$           -$              -$              -$              

S-XL 19.99$           19.99$           19.99$                22.45$           23.15$           23.85$           -$              -$              -$              

XXL 21.99$           21.99$           21.99$                23.95$           24.75$           25.45$           -$              -$              -$              

S-XL 19.99$           19.99$           19.99$                22.45$           23.15$           23.85$           -$              -$              -$              

XXL 21.99$           21.99$           21.99$                23.95$           24.75$           25.45$           -$              -$              -$              

S-XL 19.99$           19.99$           19.99$                22.45$           23.15$           23.85$           -$              -$              -$              

XXL 21.99$           21.99$           21.99$                23.95$           24.75$           25.45$           -$              -$              -$              

7.0 Sport-Tek Raglan Ladies Sport Shirt (navy) - no substitutions S-L 19.99$           19.99$           19.99$                22.45$           23.15$           23.85$           -$              -$              -$              

8.0 Sport-Tek Raglan Ladies Sport Shirt (white) - no substitutions S-L 19.99$           19.99$           19.99$                22.45$           23.15$           23.85$           -$              -$              -$              

9.0 Sport-Tek Raglan Ladies Sport Shirt (red) - no substitutions S-L 19.99$           19.99$           19.99$                22.45$           23.15$           23.85$           -$              -$              -$              

1.0 Women's Speedo #871100 - no substitutions 28 - 40 38.99$           38.99$           39.99$                55.00$           57.00$           59.00$           -$              -$              -$              

2.0 Women's Speedo #781101 - no substitutions 28 - 40 38.99$           38.99$           39.99$                55.00$           57.00$           59.00$           -$              -$              -$              

3.0 Women's Swimsuit Bottom, Dolfin #6583C and/or approved equal XS - XL 28.95$           28.95$           28.95$                27.00$           28.00$           29.00$           -$              -$              -$              

4.0 Women's Swimsuit Top, Dolfin #6582C and/or approved equal XS - XL 28.95$           28.95$           28.95$                31.00$           31.95$           33.00$           -$              -$              -$              

5.0 Women's Bikini Top, Dolfin #6582C and/or approved equal XS - XL 28.95$           28.95$           28.95$                31.00$           31.95$           33.00$           -$              -$              -$              

6.0 Men's Maui Rippers #LGSTNV - no substitutions 28 - 44 -$              -$              -$              

7.0 Women's Maui Rippers #LGW - no substitutions 1 - 15 -$              -$              -$              

B. SWIM SUITS & BOARD SHORTS

Sport-Tek Raglan Men's Sport Shirt (navy)  - no substitutions4.0

Sport-Tek Raglan Men's Sport Shirt (white) - no substitutions5.0

Sport-Tek Raglan Men's Sport Shirt (red) - no substitutions6.0

No Bid

No Bid

2.0

Unique Sale Co. Tank Tops - sample required, no substitutions1.0

Ultra Club Long Sleeve T-Shirts - no substitutions3.0

A. SHIRTS-TANKS, T-SHIRTS & SPORTSWEAR

Ultra Club T-Shirt -  sample required, no substitutions

No Bid

No Bid

e-mail:  

Ph:  

Fax:  

e-mail: jreddington@gardenstateapparel.com

Proforma Dynamic Resources, LLC

157 Cooper Road

West Berlin, NJ 08091

Kirk Lind, Managing Partner

Ph: (856) 751-0500

Fax: (856) 767-4555

e-mail: kirk.lind@proforma.com

Metuchen Center, Inc.

10 - 12 Embroidery Street

Sayreville, NJ 08872

Al Douglas, President

Ph: (732) 418-1388

Fax: (732) 246-3341



SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS CITY CONTRACT #: 16-17

PROPOSAL NAME: Supply & Delivery of Lifeguard Uniforms

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

NAME, ADDRESS &

BID OF EACH BIDDER

KEY:

Recommended for Award

ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE
2016/2017        

Unit Price

2017/2018        

Unit Price

2018/2019            

Unit Price

2016/2017        

Unit Price

2017/2018        

Unit Price

2018/2019            

Unit Price

2016/2017        

Unit Price

2017/2018        

Unit Price

2018/2019            

Unit Price

A. SHIRTS-TANKS, T-SHIRTS & SPORTSWEAR

e-mail:  

Ph:  

Fax:  

e-mail: jreddington@gardenstateapparel.com

Proforma Dynamic Resources, LLC

157 Cooper Road

West Berlin, NJ 08091

Kirk Lind, Managing Partner

Ph: (856) 751-0500

Fax: (856) 767-4555

e-mail: kirk.lind@proforma.com

Metuchen Center, Inc.

10 - 12 Embroidery Street

Sayreville, NJ 08872

Al Douglas, President

Ph: (732) 418-1388

Fax: (732) 246-3341

M-XL -$              -$              -$              

XXL -$              -$              -$              

M-XL -$              -$              -$              

XXL -$              -$              -$              

M-XL -$              -$              -$              

XXL -$              -$              -$              

M-XL -$              -$              -$              

XXL -$              -$              -$              

S-XL 29.99$           29.99$           29.99$                42.79$           43.79$           45.15$           -$              -$              -$              

XXL 32.99$           32.99$           32.99$                46.79$           47.79$           49.15$           -$              -$              -$              

6.0 Raingear, Rainfair #RN 91539 S-XL 11.70$           12.35$           12.95$           -$              -$              -$              

1.0 Hat, Big Accessories, Inc. HCO Outlander - no substitutions One Size 11.99$           11.99$           11.99$                11.89$           12.39$           12.89$           -$              -$              -$              

2.0 Baseball Hat, FlexFit Style #6577S - no substitutions One Size 10.99$           10.99$           10.99$                12.99$           13.40$           13.85$           -$              -$              -$              

S - M 10.99$           10.99$           10.99$                12.99$           13.40$           13.85$           -$              -$              -$              

L - XL 10.99$           10.99$           10.99$                12.99$           13.40$           13.85$           -$              -$              -$              

Required Information

Required Number of Copies (2): Y/N Y/N Y/N

Bid Deposit/Bond: Y/N Y/N Y/N

Consent of Surety: Y/N Y/N Y/N

Right-to-Extend - Time for Award: Y/N Y/N Y/N

Stockholder Disclosure Statement: Y/N Y/N Y/N

Non-Collusion Affidavit: Y/N Y/N Y/N

NJ Mandatory Equal Employment Opportunity Language: Y/N Y/N Y/N

Required Subcontractors Listing: Y/N Y/N Y/N

Acknowledge of Receipt of Addenda: Y/N Y/N Y/N

NJ Affirmative Action Regulation Complaince Notice: Y/N Y/N Y/N

Manufacturer's Affidavit & Certificate of Origin: Y/N Y/N

Disclosure of Investment Activites in Iran Statement - Two Part Form: Y/N Y/N Y/N

NJ Business Registration Certificate (BRC): Y/N Y/N Y/N

NJ Business Registration Certificate for Subcontractors (BRC): Y/N Y/N Y/N

NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate: Y/N Y/N Y/N

NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate for Subcontractors: Y/N Y/N Y/N

Statement of Authority: Y/N Y/N Y/N

W-9: Y/N Y/N Y/N

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

Sweatshirt, Eagle #S1102 and/or approved equal5.0

D. OTHER ITEMS - HATS

Baseball Hat, FlexFit Style #6077 - no substitutions3.0

Jacket, Wave One Sports, Straight Bottom Bomber (red) - no 

substitutions
2.0

Warm-Up Pants, Wave One Sports (red) - no substitutions3.0

4.0 Warm-Up Pants, Wave One Sports (navy) - no substitutions

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

C. JACKETS, SWEATSHIRTS, WARM UP PANTS & RAINGEAR

Jacket, Wave One Sports, Bomber (red) - no substitutions1.0
No Bid

No Bid

None

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Yes

N/A

N/A

Yes

Yes

Yes

N/A

N/A

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

N/A

N/A

N/A

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

N/A

Yes - None

Yes

Yes

N/A

N/A

N/A

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

N/A

Yes - None

Yes

Yes


