SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS
BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

CITY OF OCEAN CITY

AMERICA’'S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, April 25, 2017 @ 2:00 PM, EDT

CITY CONTRACT NO: 17-31
CONTRACT NAME: SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF LUMBER & PILING

NAME, ADDRESS & Lumberman Associates, Inc. U.S. Lumber, Inc.
BID OF EACH BIDDER 2101 Hunter Road, P.O. Box 750 668 S. Evergreen Avenue
Bristol, PA 19007 Woodbury Heights, NJ 08097
KEY: Recommended for Award Thomas C. Coleman Isabelita M. Abele
P: 215-785-4600 P: 856-853-1770
F: 215-785-5645 F: 856-384-8351
tomc@lumbermenassoc.com info@uslumberinc.com
ITEMI DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
GROUP A - 5/4" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE
1 |5/4" x 6" x 10', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 500 [ pes. 5451] $ 2,725.00 NO BID NO BID
Total Dollar Amount Group A $ 2,725.00
Total Number of Line Items Bid in Group A [ 1 ] 1 0
GROUP B - 1" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE
1 1" x 6" x 12', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 200 [ pes. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total Dollar Amount Group B
Total Number of Line Items Bid in Group B [ 1 ] 0 0
GROUP C - 2" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE
1 [2"x 4" x 16', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 200 pcs. 9.55 1,910.00 NO BID NO BID
2 2" x 6" x 12', Southern Yellow Pine 128- 2,000 pcs. 10.95 21,900.00 NO BID NO BID
3 2" x 6" x 16', Southern Yellow Pine 128- 2,000 pcs. 15.10 30,200.00 NO BID NO BID
4 2" x 6" x 20', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 1,000 pcs. 21.35 | 4§ 21,350.00 NO BID NO BID
Total Dollar Amount Group C $ 75,360.00
Total Number of Line Items Bid in Group C [ 4 ] 4 0
GROUP D - 3" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE
1 3" x 4" x 12', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 500 pcs. 1525 [ $ 7,625.00 NO BID NO BID
2 3" x 6" x 12', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 20,000 pcs. 23.20 464,000.00 NO BID NO BID
3 3" x 10" x 12', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 4,000 pcs. 27.10 108,400.00 NO BID NO BID
4 3" x 10" x 14', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 200 pcs. 31.62 6,324.00 NO BID NO BID
5 3" x 12" x 20', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 25 pcs. 70.10 1,752.50 NO BID NO BID
6 3" x 12" x 24', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 25 pcs. 92.80 | 2,320.00 NO BID NO BID
Total Dollar Amount Group D 3 590,421.50
Total Number of Line Items Bid in Group D | 6 ] 6 0
GROUP E - 6" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE
1 6" x 6" x 8', Southern Yellow Pine 0- 25 [ pcs. 24.00 | $ 600.00 NO BID NO BID
Total Dollar Amount Group E $ 600.00
Total Number of Line Items Bid in Group E [ 1 ] 1 -
GROUP F - FIR PLYWOOD
1 1/2" x 4' x 8', AC Fir Plywood 0- 450 pcs. NO BID NO BID 3752 | $ 16,884.00
2 3/4" x 4' x 8', AC Fir Plywood 0- 250 pcs. NO BID NO BID 40.12 | $ 10,030.00
3 3/4" x 4' x 8', CDX Fir Plywood 0- 250 pcs. NO BID NO BID 40.12 | $ 10,030.00
4 3/4" x 4' x 8', CDX, Fir Plywood 0- 200 pcs. NO BID NO BID 27.56 | $ 5,512.00
5 1/2" x 4' x 8', CDX, 4 ply, Fir Sheathing Plywood 0- 500 pcs. NO BID NO BID 21.60 | $ 10,800.00
Total Dollar Amount Group F $ - $ 53,256.00
Total Number of Line Items Bid in Group F [ 5 ] 0 5
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GROUP G - PILING
1 35' Piling, 12" Butt, 8" Tip, 2.5 CCA 0- 400 PCS 318.50 127,400.00 NO BID NO BID
2 35' Piling, 16" Butt, 8" Tip, 2.5 CCA 0- 400 PCS 600.25 | { 240,100.00 NO BID NO BID
Total Dollar Amount Group G $ 367,500.00
Total Number of Line Items Bid in Group G | 2 ] 2 0
GROUP H- HEM/FIR-VARIOUS SIZES
1 2" x 12" x 8', Hem/Fir 0- 25 pcs. NO BID NO BID 1095 | $ 273.75
2 2" x 10" x 16', Hem/Fir 0- 25 pcs. NO BID NO BID 18.00 | $ 450.00
3 2" x 6" x 16', Hem/Fir 0- 50 pcs. NO BID NO BID 10.98 | $ 549.00
4 |2" x 4" x 8', Hem/Fir 0- 60 pcs. NO BID NO BID 345 1% 207.00
5 2" x 4" x 12', Hem/Fir 0- 25 pcs. NO BID NO BID 5151$% 128.75
Total Dollar Amount Group H $ - $ 1,608.50
Total Number of Line Items Bid in Group H [ 5 ] 0 5
GROUP I - MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS
1 1/4" x 4' x 8', Luan Underlayment 0- 100 [ pes. NO BID NOBID |} $ 14.17 | § 1,417.00
Total Dollar Amount Group I $ - $ 1,417.00
Total Number of Line Items Bid in Group I [ 1 ] 0 1
GRAND TOTAL DOLLAR AMOUNT FOR ALL
GROUPS - GROUPS A-I 1,036,606.50 | $ 56,281.50
TOTAL NUMBER OF ALL ITEMS BID A-I 26 | 14.00 11.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF LINE ITEMS BID IN ALL GROUPS A THROUGH I: 14 11
Required Information
Required Number of Copies (3): Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
Bid Deposit/Bond: Y/N n/a Y/N n/a Y/N n/a
Consent of Surety: Y/N n/a Y/N n/a Y/N n/a
Right to Extend - Time for Award: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
Statement of Ownership Disclosure: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
Non-Collusion Affidavit: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
Mandatory Equal Employment Opportunity Language: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
NJ Affirmative Action Regulation Complaince Notice: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
Manufacturer's Affidavit & Certificate of Origin: Y/N Yes - U.S. Y/N Yes - U.S. Y/N
Required Subcontractors Listing: Y/N n/a Y/N n/a Y/N n/a
Acknowledge of Receipt of Addenda: Y/N Yes - One - 4/12/17 Y/N Yes - One - 4/12/17 Y/N One - 4/12/17
Disclosure of Investment Activites in Iran Statement-Two Part Form: Y/N Yes YIN Yes Y/N
NJ Business Registration Certificate (BRC): Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
NJ Business Registration Certificate for Subcontractors (BRC): Y/N n/a Y/N n/a Y/N n/a
NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate: Y/N n/a YIN n/a Y/N n/a
NJ Public Works Contractors Registration Act Certificate for Subcontractors: Y/N n/a YIN n/a Y/N n/a
Statement of Authority: Y/N Yes YIN Yes Y/N
W-9: Y/N Yes Y/N Yes Y/N
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