
CITY OF OCEAN CITY
AMERICA’S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

PURCHASING DIVISION

SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, September 26, 2017 @ 2:00 PM EST

CITY CONTRACT #: 18-07

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ PROPOSAL NAME: Supply & Delivery of Police & Fire Department Uniforms

NAME, ADDRESS AND Action Uniform Company, LLC Landsman Uniform & Embroidery  Inc. This & That Uniforms

BID OF EACH BIDDER 3164 Fire Road 4450 Black Horse Pike Suite 3934 1500 S. New Road

Egg Harbor Township, NJ  08234 Mays Landing, NJ  08330 Pleasantville, NJ  08232

Rick Zelig, President/Owner Janet Smith, CEO Marie Franco, General Manager

609-573-5462-Phone 609-909-1000-Phone 609-646-1522

609-568-6054-Fax 609-909-9968-Fax 609-641-2197
rick@actionuniformco.com janet@landsmanuniforms.com maria@tntuniforms.com

ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE

APPROX.         

QUANTITY 2018 Unit Price 2019 Unit Price 2020 Unit Price 2018 Unit Price 2019 Unit Price 2020 Unit Price 2018 Unit Price 2019 Unit Price 2020 Unit Price

GROUP I - POLICE DEPARTMENT UNIFORMS

1.0 Trousers with Stripe 32-44 0-085 75.00$              75.00$              75.00$              75.00$              75.00$              75.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Fechheimer Class "A", Navy

2.0 Short Sleeve Shirt S, M, L & XL 0-024 60.00$              60.00$              60.00$              50.00$              50.00$              55.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Elbeco Regulation, Navy Blue

3.0 Long Sleeve Shirt S, M, L & XL 0-024 20.00$              20.00$              20.00$              30.00$              30.00$              30.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Fechheimer Class "A", French Blue

4.0 Short Sleeve Shirt

Brand: Fechheimer Class "A", French Blue S, M, L & XL 0-024 20.00$              20.00$              20.00$              25.00$              25.00$              25.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.0 Winter Hats 6-5/8"- 7-5/8" 0-024 15.00$              15.00$              15.00$              20.00$              20.00$              25.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Round Pershing Type, Model #74714 French Blue

6.0 All Season Jacket S, M, L & XL 0-024 320.00$            320.00$            320.00$            250.00$            250.00$            265.00$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  5.11,  Model #5-in-1, Navy 

7.0 Raincoat S, M, L & XL 0-012 80.00$              80.00$              80.00$              75.00$              75.00$              75.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Blauer, Model #733

8.0 Trousers 30-46 0-012 11.00$              11.00$              11.00$              12.00$              12.00$              12.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Dickies,Model #04741, Black

9.0 Short Sleeve Shirt S, M, L & XL 0-012 69.00$              69.00$              69.00$              50.00$              50.00$              55.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  5.11, Color various - TBD XXL 0-024 15.00$              15.00$              15.00$              50.00$              50.00$              55.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

XXXL 0-002 15.00$              15.00$              15.00$              50.00$              50.00$              55.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

10.0 Shorts S, M, L & XL 0-012 50.00$              50.00$              50.00$              48.00$              48.00$              48.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Molcan Model #1020L,Navy Blue

11.0 Baseball Hat S, M, L & XL 0-012 30.00$              30.00$              30.00$              24.00$              24.00$              25.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Yupong Model #74444

12.0 Belt

Brand:  Bianchi Accumold, Model #6280  Black 0-012 250.00$            250.00$            250.00$            240.00$            240.00$            240.00$            No Bid No Bid No Bid
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BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ PROPOSAL NAME: Supply & Delivery of Police & Fire Department Uniforms

NAME, ADDRESS AND Action Uniform Company, LLC Landsman Uniform & Embroidery  Inc. This & That Uniforms

BID OF EACH BIDDER 3164 Fire Road 4450 Black Horse Pike Suite 3934 1500 S. New Road
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QUANTITY 2018 Unit Price 2019 Unit Price 2020 Unit Price 2018 Unit Price 2019 Unit Price 2020 Unit Price 2018 Unit Price 2019 Unit Price 2020 Unit Price

13.0 Trousers 30-46 0-012 58.00$              58.00$              58.00$              50.00$              50.00$              55.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  5.11 Taclite Style (PRO), Khaki

14.0 Polo Shirt S, M, L & XL 0-012 45.00$              45.00$              45.00$              45.00$              45.00$              50.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  5.11 Professional Services

15.0 Polo Shirt

Brand:  5.11 Professional Series S, M, L & XL 0-012 45.00$              45.00$              45.00$              45.00$              45.00$              50.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

16.0 Breeches/Jodphur Pants 30-46 0-012 75.00$              75.00$              75.00$              85.00$              85.00$              85.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Motorcycle, K-9, Navy Blue

17.0 Hat 6-5/8"-7-5/8" 0-012 79.00$              79.00$              79.00$              30.00$              30.00$              30.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Keystone, Navy Blue

18.0 Patrol Shirt Long Sleeve (Winter) S, M, L & XL 0-012 68.00$              68.00$              68.00$              55.00$              55.00$              60.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand: Elbeco Model #319N XXL 0-006 20.00$              20.00$              20.00$              55.00$              55.00$              60.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Dark Navy XXXL 0-006 20.00$              20.00$              20.00$              55.00$              55.00$              60.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

XXXXL 0-006 20.00$              20.00$              20.00$              55.00$              55.00$              60.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

19.0 Winter Watch Cap Brand 5.11 Various 0-012 25.00$              25.00$              25.00$              22.00$              22.00$              22.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model #WWCBlack/Dark Navy Blue w/Gold Lettering

20.0 Blouse Brand:  Hope Model #H-D-B Various 0-012 350.00$            350.00$            350.00$            280.00$            280.00$            300.00$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

New Jersey State Police Style, Department patch left

sleeve & Command Flag right sleeve, Sgt. Gold stripes

21.0 Trouser S, M, L & XL 0-012 90.00$              90.00$              90.00$              65.00$              65.00$              65.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Flying Cross Deluxe Tactical Pants#39300 XXL 0-004 20.00$              20.00$              20.00$              65.00$              65.00$              65.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Navy Blue XXXL 0-004 20.00$              20.00$              20.00$              65.00$              65.00$              65.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

22.0 Trouser S, M, L & XL 0-012 75.00$              75.00$              75.00$              55.00$              55.00$              55.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Flying Cross Command Daily Duty Patrol Pants XXL 0-004 25.00$              25.00$              25.00$              55.00$              55.00$              55.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Navy Blue XXXL 0-004 25.00$              25.00$              25.00$              55.00$              55.00$              55.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

23.0 Trouser 

Brand:  Flying Cross Valor Pants Alternate DD Pants S, M, L & XL 0-012 24.00$              24.00$              24.00$              50.00$              50.00$              50.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Navy Blue XXL 0-004 12.00$              12.00$              12.00$              50.00$              50.00$              50.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

XXXL 0-004 12.00$              12.00$              12.00$              50.00$              50.00$              50.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

24.0 Rain Pants

Brand:  Blauer, Model #134 B-Dry Navy Blue S, M, L & XL 0-012 45.00$              45.00$              45.00$              35.00$              35.00$              40.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid
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SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, September 26, 2017 @ 2:00 PM EST

CITY CONTRACT #: 18-07

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ PROPOSAL NAME: Supply & Delivery of Police & Fire Department Uniforms

NAME, ADDRESS AND Action Uniform Company, LLC Landsman Uniform & Embroidery  Inc. This & That Uniforms

BID OF EACH BIDDER 3164 Fire Road 4450 Black Horse Pike Suite 3934 1500 S. New Road

Egg Harbor Township, NJ  08234 Mays Landing, NJ  08330 Pleasantville, NJ  08232

Rick Zelig, President/Owner Janet Smith, CEO Marie Franco, General Manager

609-573-5462-Phone 609-909-1000-Phone 609-646-1522

609-568-6054-Fax 609-909-9968-Fax 609-641-2197
rick@actionuniformco.com janet@landsmanuniforms.com maria@tntuniforms.com

ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE

APPROX.         

QUANTITY 2018 Unit Price 2019 Unit Price 2020 Unit Price 2018 Unit Price 2019 Unit Price 2020 Unit Price 2018 Unit Price 2019 Unit Price 2020 Unit Price

25.0 Jackets, Coaches

Brand: Trimountain Model #1500 Navy Blue S, M, L & XL 0-024 40.00$              40.00$              40.00$              35.00$              35.00$              40.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Parking Enforcement Officer & Officer's Name XXL 0-004 40.00$              40.00$              40.00$              35.00$              35.00$              40.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

26.0 Shorts S, M, L & XL 0-024 34.00$              34.00$              34.00$              35.00$              35.00$              35.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Propper Model #8410 Navy Blue XXL 0-006 24.00$              24.00$              24.00$              35.00$              35.00$              35.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

27.0 Boots, Motorcycle/K-9

Brand:  Chippewa, Model #27950 7-14,D-EEEE 0-012 239.00$            239.00$            239.00$            95.00$              95.00$              95.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

28.0 Shirt Long Sleeve Men's Class "A"

Brand:  Elbeco Model Men's L/S #319N S, M, L & XL 0-024 75.00$              75.00$              75.00$              65.00$              65.00$              70.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

29.0 Shirt Short Sleeve Men's Class "A"

Brand:  Elbeco Model #Men's S/S #3319N French Blue S, M, L & XL 0-024 75.00$              75.00$              75.00$              64.00$              64.00$              69.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

30.0 Shirt Long Sleeve Ladies Class "A" S, M, L & XL 0-024 75.00$              75.00$              75.00$              25.00$              25.00$              25.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Elbeco Model #Ladies L/S #9319LCN French

Blue

31.0 Shirt Short Sleeve Ladies Class "A" S, M, L & XL 0-024 75.00$              75.00$              75.00$              25.00$              25.00$              25.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Elbeco Model #Ladies S/S #9819LCN French

Blue

32.0 Hat

Brand:  Keystone #OCPD Navy stock w/French Blue 6-5/8" - 7-5/8"0-024    0-024 79.00$              79.00$              79.00$              75.00$              75.00$              80.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Elastique top

TOTAL DOLLAR AMOUNT-GROUP 1-POLICE DEPT. UNIFORMS 2,939.00$        2,939.00$        2,939.00$        2,810.00$        2,810.00$        2,936.00$        NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID (Items 1-32) 32 32 32 32 32 32 0 0 0
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SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, September 26, 2017 @ 2:00 PM EST

CITY CONTRACT #: 18-07

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ PROPOSAL NAME: Supply & Delivery of Police & Fire Department Uniforms

NAME, ADDRESS AND Action Uniform Company, LLC Landsman Uniform & Embroidery  Inc. This & That Uniforms
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ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE

APPROX.         

QUANTITY 2018 Unit Price 2019 Unit Price 2020 Unit Price 2018 Unit Price 2019 Unit Price 2020 Unit Price 2018 Unit Price 2019 Unit Price 2020 Unit Price

GROUP II- POLICE DEPARTMENT ACADEMY RECRUIT UNIFORMS

1.0 Long Sleeve Shirt S, M, L & XL 0-024 30.00$              30.00$              30.00$              30.00$              30.00$              35.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Red Cap or Equal, Khaki

2.0 Pants S, M, L & XL 0-024 30.00$              30.00$              30.00$              30.00$              30.00$              35.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Red Cap or Equal, Khaki

3.0 Tie, Black S, M, L & XL 0-024 7.00$                7.00$                7.00$                5.00$                5.00$                6.00$                No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Samuel Broom Model #90010

4.0 Field Jacket S, M, L & XL 0-024 75.00$              75.00$              75.00$              55.00$              55.00$              65.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Ruthco, Field Jacket Style Model #M65

5.0 Shorts S, M, L & XL 0-024 15.00$              15.00$              15.00$              15.00$              15.00$              18.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Augusta Model #915

6.0 T-Shirt S, M, L & XL 0-024 17.00$              17.00$              17.00$              15.00$              15.00$              15.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Jerzee Model #29M

7.0 Belt S, M, L & XL 0-024 17.00$              17.00$              17.00$              17.00$              17.00$              17.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Dutyman, Black

8.0 Sweat Pant & Top (set) S, M, L & XL 0-024 20.00$              20.00$              20.00$              33.00$              33.00$              36.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Jerzee Model #973(sweat Pant) & 562 (sweat

shirt)

9.0 Gloves S, M, L & XL 0-024 6.00$                6.00$                6.00$                6.00$                6.00$                6.00$                No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Rothco Model #4747 DOT finish on palms

10.0 Baseball Cap w/Academy Patch, Black One Size 0-024 20.00$              20.00$              20.00$              15.00$              15.00$              16.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Yupong Model #6277

11.0 Dress Shoes, Black to CMCPA specifications 7 TO 14 0-012 79.00$              79.00$              79.00$              65.00$              65.00$              70.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand:  Bates MODEL #0941 width D to EEEE

TOTAL DOLLAR AMOUNT - GROUP II-POLICE DEPT. ACADEMY 316.00$           316.00$           316.00$           286.00$           286.00$           319.00$           NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID (Items 1-11) 11 11 11 11 11 11 0 0 0
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GROUP III-POLICE DEPARTMENT MISCELLANEOUS EQUIPMENT

1.0 Leather Duty Belt to include Magazine Pouch, One Size 0-024 140.00$            140.00$            140.00$            135.00$            135.00$            145.00$            No Bid No Bid No Bid

Handcuff Case, OC Spray Pouch & Radio Holder, Black

Brand:  Safariland Model #851

2.0 Color Brass Badge Number & Rank One Size 0-024 30.00$              30.00$              30.00$              20.00$              20.00$              20.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand S & W Model #DNR

3.0 Custom Badge

Brand: Smith & Warren Ocean City Custom DNR

Badge # & Rank One Size 0-24 40.00$              40.00$              40.00$              80.00$              80.00$              85.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.0 Metal Name Tag One Size 0-024 15.00$              15.00$              15.00$              10.00$              10.00$              12.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid

Silver Tag: Patrolman & Sergeants Gold Tag: 
Lieutenant, Captain & Chief

TOTAL DOLLAR AMOUNT - GROUP III-POLICE DEPT. - MISCELLANEOUS EQUIPMENT 225.00$           225.00$           225.00$           245.00$           245.00$           262.00$           NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID (Items 1-4) 4 4 4 4 4 4 0 0 0

TOTAL DOLLAR AMOUNT-POLICE DEPT. IN GROUPS I, II, III 3,480.00$        3,480.00$        3,480.00$        3,341.00$        3,341.00$        3,517.00$        NO BID NO BID NO BID

TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID-POLICE DEPT IN GROUPS I, II, III 47 47 47 47 47 47 0 0 0

GROUP IV-FIRE DEPARTMENT UNIFORMS

1.0 Shirt-Short Sleeve S, M, L & XL 0-024 120.00$            120.00$            120.00$            110.00$            110.00$            120.00$            99.00$              99.00$              105.00$            

Brand:  Fechheimer #9800 & 9810, Flying Cross, Navy BlueXXL 0-004 12.00$              12.00$              12.00$              110.00$            110.00$            120.00$            20.00$              20.00$              25.00$              

2.0 Shirt-Long Sleeve S, M, L & XL 0-024 130.00$            130.00$            130.00$            120.00$            120.00$            130.00$            105.00$            105.00$            110.00$            

Brand:  Fechheimer #9820 & 9830, Flying Cross, Navy BlueXXL 0-002 13.00$              13.00$              13.00$              120.00$            120.00$            130.00$            20.00$              20.00$              25.00$              

3.0 Trousers 32-42 0-024 120.00$            120.00$            120.00$            115.00$            115.00$            125.00$            115.00$            115.00$            120.00$            

Brand:  Fechheimer #94200, Flying Cross, Navy Blue 44-48 0-006 12.00$              12.00$              12.00$              115.00$            115.00$            125.00$            30.00$              30.00$              35.00$              

TOTAL DOLLAR AMOUNT - GROUP IV-FIRE DEPT. 407.00$           407.00$           407.00$           690.00$           690.00$           750.00$           389.00$           389.00$           420.00$           
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID (Items 1-3) 3 3 3 3 3 3 3 3 3

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST
Required Number of Copies (3):

Buy American Certification:

Right to Extend - Time for Award:

Statement of Ownership Disclosure:

Non-Collusion Affidavit:

Mandatory Equal Employment Opportunity Language:

NJ Affirmative Action Regulation Complaince Notice:

Acknowledge of Receipt of Addenda:

Disclosure of Investment Activites in Iran Statement-Two Part Form:

NJ Business Registration Certificate (BRC):

Statement of Authority:
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