PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

CITY OF OCEAN CITY

AMERICA'S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

DATE RECEIVED:
CITY CONTRACT #:
PROPOSAL NAME:

Tuesday, April 21, 2015 @ 2:00 PM, EDT
15-25

Supply & Delivery of Fluorescent Bulbs &
Electronic Ballasts

NAME, ADDRESS &
BID OF EACH BIDDER

Colonial Electric Supply

Cooper Electric Supply co.

Graybar

Pemberton Electrical Supply Co., LLC

Production Distribution Companies

701 West Delilah Road

402 Bloomfield Drive

800 Huyler Street

140 Mt. Holly Bypass, Unit 7

9511 South Dorchester

Pleasantville, NJ 08232

West Berlin, NJ 08091

Teterboro, NJ 07609-1157

Lumberton, NJ 08048

Chicago, IL 60628

Walter J. Brunetti, Branch Manager

George Mossop, Inside Sales

Patrick McHugh, Coordinator

Tina A. Lilston-Horner, CEO

Cleo Downs, President

Quotations Department

KEY Ph: (609) 645-8110 Ph: (856) 306-8267 Ph: (201) 596-2600 Ph: (609) 518-7877 Ph: (708) 489-0195
Calculation Error Fx: (609) 645-2270 Fx: (856) 719-1166 Fx: (201) 596-2653 Fx: (609) 518-7097 Fx: (708) 489-0196
email: Walter.Brunetti@ColonialElectric.com email: George.Mossop@cooper-electric.com email: patrick. nchugh@graybar.com email: Thorner@pembertonelectrical.com |email: cleo@pdcompanies.org
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT
BASE BID
1 Osram Sylvania, MFG #21781 1,200 EACH] $ 189 | $ 2,268.00 | $ 185 | $ 2,220.00 | $ 205 $ 2,460.00 | $ 169 | $ 2,028.00 | $ 2181 $ 2,616.00
Osram Sylvania, MFG #20924 80 EACH] $ 373 $ 29840 | $ 555 | % 444.00 | $ 455 | $ 364.00 | $ 336 | $ 268.80 | $ 430 $ 344.00
3 Osram Sylvania, MFG #20586, SYLFT40DL/841/RS/ECO 150 EACH] $ 549 | $ 823.50 | $ 730 | $ 1,095.00 | $ 611 $ 916.50 | $ 4941 $ 741.00 | $ 488 | $ 732.00
4 Osram Sylvania, MFG #20582, SYLFT36DL/835/RS/ECO 40 EACH] $ 6.10 | $ 24400 | $ 725 | % 290.00 | $ 681 | % 27240 | $ 550 | $ 220.00 | $ 751|$ 300.40
5 Osram Sylvania, MFG #21671, SYLFBO32/841/6/ECO 32 EACH| $ 629 | $ 201.28 | $ 745 | $ 238.40 | $ 761 $ 243.52 | $ 529 $ 169.28 | $ 516 | $ 165.12
6 Osram Sylvania, MFG #22149, SYLFO96/841/ECO 48 EACH] $ 639 | $ 306.72 | $ 710 | $ 34080 | $ 732 % 351.36 | $ 4.40 | $ 211.20 | $ 573 | $ 275.04
7 Osram Sylvania, MFG#78422, SYLLED6MR16/DIM/830/FL36 48 EACH| $ 1091 | $ 523.68 | $ 10.00 | $ 480.00 | $ 1250 | $ 600.00 | $ 899 | $ 431.52 | $ 1373 | $ 659.04
8 Osram Sylvania, MFG #78433, SYLLED16PAR38/DIM/830/NFL 48 EACH] $ 2471 | $ 1,186.08 | $ 2350 | $ 1,128.00 | $ 2386 | $ 1,145.28 | $ 23.08 | $ 1,107.84 | $ 26.58 | $ 1,275.84
9 Osram Sylvania, MFG #378747, SYLLED15PAR30/DIM/P/930/FL 48 EACH| $ 3659 | $ 1,756.32 | $ 39.00 | $ 1,872.00 | $ 3864 | $ 1,854.72 | $ 32.96 | $ 1,582.08 | $ 3553 | $ 1,705.44
10 |Osram Sylvania, MFG #78748, SYLLED10PAR20/DIM/P/930/FL 48 EACH] $ 18.17 | $ 872.16 | $ 31.00 | $ 1,488.00 | $ 1591 | $ 763.68 | $ 16.37 | $ 785.76 | $ 16.24 | $ 779.52
11 |Osram Sylvania, MFG #73017, SYLLED10A19F/827/G2 12 EACH] $ 732 % 87.84 | $ 625 | $ 75.00 | $ 568 | $ 68.16 | $ 650 | $ 78.00 | $ 7151 $ 85.80
12 |Osram Sylvania, MFG #79082, SYLLED13A19/DIM/0/827/G3 12 EACH| $ 16.99 | $ 20388 | $ 1460 | $ 17520 | $ 1477 | $ 177.24 | $ 1539 | $ 184.68 | $ 2382 | $ 285.84
13 |Osram Sylvania, MFG #49908, SYLQTP4X32T8/UNV-ISN-SC-B 50 EACH] $ 1359 | $ 679.50 | $ 10.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 12.06 | $ 603.00 | $ 965 | $ 482.50 | $ 1286 | $ 643.00
14 |Phillips Advancec, MFG #49909, ICN1P32N351 10 EACH| $ 1599 | $ 159.90 | $ 10.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 9.09 | $ 90.90 | $ 1113 | $ 111.30 | $ 931 | $ 93.10
15 |Universal Basic-12, B340R120HPT12 Electronic Fluorescent Ballast 10 EACH] $ 39.45 | $ 39450 | $ 25.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 11.14 | $ 111.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid
Equal To Products Bid-
Total Bid Amount of All Items Bid $ 10,005.76 $ 10,696.40 All GE Products 3$ 10,022.16 3$ 8,401.96 3$ 9,960.14
Number of days for delivery after receipt of PO: 10-14 days 30 days 15 days 7 days 15 days
REQUIRED INFORMATION
RIGHT TO EXTEND-TIME FOR AWARD: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
PUBLIC DISCLOSURE STATEMENT: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
NJ MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY LANGUAGE: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
NJ AFFIRMATIVE ACTION REGULATION COMPLIANCE NOTICE: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
ACKNOWLEDGMENT OF RECEIPT OF ADDENDA: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
MANUFACTURER'S AFFIDAVIT & CERTIFICATE OF ORIGIN: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
DISCLOSURE OF INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES IN IRAN STATEMENT-2 PART FORM: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE (BRC) SUBMITTED: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
NUMBER OF COPIES SUBMITTED (2): YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y




