
CITY OF OCEAN CITY
AMERICA’S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, November 26, 2013
CITY QUOTE #: Q-13-018

PURCHASING DIVISION PROPOSAL NAME: Permitting, Pump Station Design, Road Design 
SUMMARY OF RFP & Construction Management Services for a

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ FEMA Hazard Mitigation Grant Project

NAME, ADDRESS & Hatch Mott MacDonald, LLC Junetta N. Dix Consulting, Inc. Mott Associates, LLC Paulus, Sokolowski and Sartor, LLC Water's Edge Environmental, LLC
BID OF EACH BIDDER 111 Wood Avenue South 213 E. Seaview Avenue 3122 Fire Road 67B Mountain Boulevard Ext. 1259A Asbury Ave., PO Box 118

Iselin, NJ  08830 Linwood, NJ  08221 Egg Harbor Twp., NJ  08234 Warren, NJ  07059 Ocean City, NJ  08226

Albert J. Melini, PE, Executive Vice President Junetta N. Dix, President James A. Mott, Owner James R. Wancho, Vice President Michael Lucey, Environmental
Director, Managing Partner

Ph:  (973) 379-3400 Ph:  (609) 927-5580 Ph:  (609) 569-1511 Ph:  (732) 560-9700 Ph:  (609) 249-3744
Fx:  (973) 376-1072 Fx:  (609) 927-5580 Fx:  (609) 569-1521 Fx:  (732) 764-6713 Fx:  (609) 249-3860
email:  corporate@hatchmott.com email:  junettanowell@comcast.net email:  jamott@comcast.net email:  jwancho@psands.com email:  mlucey@watersedgellc.com

ITEM DESCRIPTION COST COST COST COST COST

1 PERMITTING NO BID 17,632.00$                             30,000.00$                                 22,271.57$                               25,445.00$                           

2 STORMWATER & PUMP STATION DESIGN 379,200.00$                                   NO BID NO BID 456,586.70$                             NO BID

3 ROAD DESIGN & COORDINATION NO BID NO BID 250,000.00$                               150,644.50$                             NO BID

4 CONSTRUCTION MANAGEMENT SERVICES NO BID NO BID 300,000.00$                               365,849.00$                             NO BID

TOTAL OF ALL WORK IN THE PROPOSAL  $379,200.00 (item #2 only)  $17,632.00 (item #1 only)  $580,000.00 (items #1,3,& 4)  $995,801.77 (items #1-4)  $25,445.00 (item #1 only) 

Required Information
DAVIS BACON REQUIREMENTS: YES/NO N YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

COPELAND "ANTI-KICKBACK" ACT CERTIFICATION: YES/NO N YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

BUY AMERICAN CERTIFICATION: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO N

LOBBY CERTIFICATION: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

ESBE PARTICIPATION & FORM B: YES/NO Y YES/NO N YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO N

RIGHT TO EXTEND: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RECEIPT OF ADDENDA: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE STATEMENT: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY LANGUAGE: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION REGULATIONS NOTICE TO BIDDERS: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

SWORN STATEMENT BY PROFESSIONAL SERVICES PROVIDER: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

STANDARD FORM 254: YES/NO Y YES/NO N YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE (BRC): YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y


